EAGLE MOUNTAIN CITY
MATERIAL BID TABULATION

KIOWA VALLEY FEEDER CAPACITY INCREASE
CODALE ELEC SUPPLY

NORTHERN POWER EQUIP

MATERIAL/EQUIPMENT

QTY

DEL
WEEKS

BID

PRICE

UNIT

TOTAL

DEL
WEEKS

BID PRICE

UNIT

| TotaL

15 kV URD Cable with 750 kcmil
Compressed Stranded Aluminum
Conductor, 220 mils of EPR Insulation,
1/3 Concentric Neutral and Black

Encapsulating LLDPE Jacket

14,013’

Stock

$7.04

$98,651.52

No Bid

S & C Electric 14.4 kV Pad-Mounted
Switchgear, PME-11, Cat No. 65162R1-
E3-F2

2 ea.

8 Wks

$17,500.00

$35,000.00

No Bid

Box Pad for S & C Electric 14.4 kV Pad-
Mounted Switchgear, - Concast Fibercrete
Cat No. FC-74-76-36

2 ea.

6 - 7 Wks

$885.00

$1,770.00

6 - 7 Wks

$942.00

$3,768.00

Box Pad Cover For 600 Amp Three Phase
Sectionalizing Enclosure for Future
Mounting of 14.4 kV, S & C Electric Pad-
Mounted Switchgear — Concast Fibercrete
Cat. No. FC-74-76-C

4 ea.

6 - 7 Wks

$368.00

$1,472.00

6 - 7 Wks

$392.00

$1,568.00

15 kV 600 Amp Three Phase
Sectionalizing Enclosure - Hoffman Cat
No. UJ306724M2 with (3) UJP2SSOFF

8 ea.

6 - 7 Wks

$800.00

$6,400.00

No Bid

Box Pad for 15 kV 600 Amp 3 Phase
Sectionalizing Enclosure — Concast
Fibercrete Cat. No. FC-23-67-32-1862

4 ea.

6 - 7 Wks

$505.00

$2,020.00

6 - 7 Wks

$537.00

$2,148.00

15 kV 600 Amp Non Loadbreak Elbows
for 15 kV URD Cable with a 750 kcmil
Compressed Stranded Aluminum
Conductor - Cooper Cat. No. TP615-GG-
25-50-T-C-SC-CS2-X

54 ea.

No Bid

6 Weeks

$330.00

$17,820.00

15 kV 600 Amp Two Position Non
Loadbreak Junction with U Straps —
Cooper Power Cat. No. DJ625A- 3-U

24 ea.

3-5Wks

$140.00

$3,360.00

4 - 6 Wks

$189.00

$4,536.00

15 kV 600 Amp Insulated Protective Cap
— Cooper Cat. No. DPC625-U-X

9 ea.

3-5Wks

$72.25

$650.25

Stock

$63.00

$567.00

15 kV 200 Amp Insulated Protective
Cap— Cooper Cat. No. LPC215-X

12 ea.

Stock

$20.25

$243.00

Stock

$21.00

$252.00

15 kV 200 Amp LB Elbows for 15 kV
URD Cable with a #2 AWG Stranded
Aluminum Conductor and Test Point —
Cooper Cat. No. LE215-AB-04-T-X

12 ea.

Stock

$24.00

$288.00

Stock

$24.00

$288.00

Faulted Circuit Indicators, 200 Amp One
Phase — Cooper Cat. No. STVT

6 ea.

No Bid

No Bid

TOTAL

| $149,854.77

[ $30,947.00
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EMERGENCY STOCK MATERIAL

CODALE ELEC SUPPLY NORTHERN POWER EQUIP
DEL BID PRICE DEL BID PRICE
MATERIAL/EQUIPMENT QTY | WEEKS UNIT TOTAL weeks | unit | ToTAL
15 kV URD Cable with 750 kcmil 5400 Stock $7.04 $38,016.00 No Bid
Compressed Stranded Aluminum
Conductor, 220 mils of EPR Insulation,
1/3 Concentric Neutral and Black
Encapsulating LLDPE Jacket
S & C Electric 14.4 kV Pad-Mounted 1 ea. 8 Wks |$17,500.00| $17,500.00 No Bid
Switchgear, PME-11, Cat No. 65162R1-
E3-F2
TOTAL $55,516.00 | $0.00
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