UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION
MEETING

August 14, 2024 9:00 AM

meet.googale.com/xsz-hwab-suc
Phone Numbers
(US)+1.254-881-9257

PIN: 653 220 525#

Anchor Location
Room 474
Heber M Wells Building
160 E 300 S

Roll call

Elect a chairman and vice-chair

Approve minutes from the December 20, 2023

Review proposed amendments to 2023 NEC

Article 210.8(A)

Article 210.8(D)

Article 210.52©(2)

Article 220.5(c)

Article 314.27(A)(2)

Article 406.4(D)(4)

5. Review recommendation from Electrical Advisory Committee for the
2023 NEC along with proposed amendments

6. Approve 2023 NEC with current and proposed amendments for public
hearing

Advisory Committee Minutes
Electrical Advisory Committee 9-14-23, 10-12-23, 10-26-23, 11-9-23, 1-11-
24, 2-8-24, 4-11-24, 5-9-24, 6-13-24, 7-11-24 & 7-18-24

Info Items

Spreadsheet for 2023 NEC

il el e

Next meeting date: September 11,2024

Please call Sharon at 530-6163 if you do not plan on attending the meeting.

In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, individuals
needing special accommodations (including auxiliary communicative
aids and services) during this meeting should notify Carol Inglesby,
ADA Coordinator, Division of Occupational and Professional Licensing,
160 East 300 South, Salt Lake City UT 84111, Phone 530-6626, at
least three working days prior to the meeting.




MINUTES

UTAH
UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION

December 20, 2023

9:00

Convened: 9:11 Adjourned: 9:30

STAFF:

Stephen Duncombe, Bureau Manager

Sharon Smalley, Board Secretary

Nicole Herrera. Board Secretary

Matt Johnson, Legal Analyst

COMMISSIONERS:

Thomas Peterson Chris Hendrickson

Josh Blazzard Art Anderson

Lorianne Bisping Karl Mott

Travis Dalley Joerg Ruegemer

Trent Hunt Scott Carpenter (excused)

Ken Adams Steve Dailey

Gary Bullock

VISITORS:

Ross Ford Bryce McConkie

Herriman Building Dept Cathryn Nelson

PUBLIC HEARING A public hearing was conducted by Matt John-
son for the corrections and new proposed
amendments for Title 15A.

MINUTES A motion was made by Trent Hunt to approve
the minutes from the December 13, 2023, meet-
ing as written. The motion was seconded by
Karl Mott and passed unanimously.

MAKE A RECOMMENDATION There were no comments made by the public

TO THE BUSINESS AND LABOR

INTERIM COMMITTEE

during the public hearing. A motion was made
by Karl Mott to approve the recommendations
for Title 15A and to move them forward to the
Business and Labor Interim Committee. The
motion was seconded by Trent Hunt and passed
unanimously.



Page 2 of 2

Minutes

Uniform Building Code Commission
December 20, 2023

The meeting adjourned at 10:07.

Note: These minutes are not intended to be a verbatim transcript but are intended to record the significant features of the business con-

ducted in this meeting. Discussed items are not necessarily shown in the chronological order they occurred.



UTAH DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE
DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL AND PROFESSIONAL LICENSING
160 East 300 South Salt Lake City UT 84111

PO Box 146741 Salt Lake City UT 84114-6741
E-mail; b8@utah.gov
Web: www.dopl.utah.gov

REQUEST FOR CODE AMENDMENT

Requesting Agency/Person: Home Builders Association of Utah | Date:6 Jun 20204

Street Address:38 W 113775 S suite 120

City, State, Zip Draper Utah 84020

Contact Person: Ross Ford Phone:801-361-9301

Code to be Amended: 2023 National Electric Code (NEC)

{Tnclude edition)

Section: 210.8(A)

Section GFCI for Kitchen Receptacles

AMENDMENT:

In line 6 after the word kitchens add where the receptacles arc installed to scrve the countertop surfaces

Strike line 7

210.8(A) Dwelling Units.

All 125-volt through 250-volt receptacles installed in the locations and supplied by single-phase branch
circuits rated 150 volts or less (o ground shall have ground-fault circuit-interrupter protection for
personnel.

(1) Rathrooms

(2) Garages and also accessory buildings that have a floor located at or below grade level not

intended as habitable rooms and limited to storage arcas, work areas, and areas of similar use

(3) Outdoars

(4) Craw! spaces — at or below grade level

(3) Basements

(6) Kitchens — where the receptacles arc installed to serve the countertop surfaces

RSt HN A s 110 bty A b gt sraneEatiaa laviara
A eRS Y HA-SHRIS G- PoHRanen Prarie b repiftthtn e

(R) Sinks — where receptacles are installed within 1.8 m (6 fu} from the top inside edge of the bowl
of the sink
(9) Boathouscs

(10) Bathtubs or shower stalls — where receplacles are installed w ithin | 8 m (6 ) of the outside




Purpose of or Reason for the amendment:

Reason:

GFCIs have been an unmitigated success, contributing significantly to reducing deaths due to electrical
shock. In just 25 years after GFCIs were introduced, accidental electrocutions in the United States were
cut by more than half, even though electricity use more than doubled!. There is a clear relationship
between the reduction in electrocutions and the increased use of GFCls over the last 45 years as
indicated in Figure 1 below. However, this success has relied on requiring the devices in locations where
dangers exist which they can protect against.

GECIs are shown to be effective where a corded product is plugged into a standard “convenience”
receptacle in a wet or damp location. However, the expanded requirement is for areas of the kitchen
where handheld electric devices will never come near the sink. The extent of a “kitchen” is very open to
8

interpretation and may include any dining and living areas connected to it in today’s popular open floor
plans. Many additional receptacles are covered by this new requirement.

Over 80 percent of the incidents cited as reason for this change in the model code resulted from people
attempting to repair, modify or install an appliance while plugged in and contact occurring with the
energized elements within the particular appliance. The NEC should not mandate GFCI protection for all

kitchen outlets due to the clearly unsafe practices of unqualified individuals.

Electrocutions Associated With Consumer Products

B I ! ! HLLOLD DM
i AP | . Number of GFCI
1 -
b | F AR L Protected Homes
S00 - \ If\ ! -
i C A
| I ¢“ | G L9l Consumer Product
v : | ; | R
400 ! B \ ' | Electrocutions
- | - 0,0
Mac el |~
w4 O E | |
| L
10 : Q| | U040 900
).':: | | Reouired Leeations - 126 yeolt
| Al | CFCIReceptacies
! \ e LSTRIL LIRHIT ) A Belvoom: (“879)
200 ( pa et \__.—« |
— G { Y\ f |
| b7 ‘ LRI IRIT]
e | | H 12d Basemerns  1987°
Ino i B | @ A - €3
| ' ATA TR )
i | = Pt O ~ H iy Rozms (2205)
| T
i N [N, | =S | =R — . 0 i
FET0 1975 10RD 19w% Tus 198h 200G @i 20Mn g 2 oy

Flg_ﬁr_clvGFCI Protection in Homes Versus Electrocutions 1_975_to_§(_)1-8_(36@:_A NEMA Ground Fault

Personnel Protection Section Article entitled “GFCI Receplacles: Consumer Protection Personified” June
2020, Revision 2).

Footnotes:

1

“Know the Dangers in Your Older Home”, February 2015 (page 5). Electrical Safety Foundation

_International.




Cost or Savings Impact of Amendment:

This amendment will save 50 to 100 dollars per home.

Compliance Costs for Affected Persons (APerson@ means any individual, partnership, corporation, association,
governmental entity, or public or private organization of any character other than an agency.) (You must break out
the impact cost to State Budget, Local Government and you must state aggregate cost to other persons {cost per

person times number of persons affected}):

This amendment will have no cost change for affected persons

Signature:

Date: 6/6/2024

For Division Use:

Date Received:

Committee Action:

,K Approved A Denied
A Approved with revisions

A Referred to:

A Tabled

UBC Commission Decision for Hearing:
A Approved for hearing A Denied

A Approved with revisions

A Referred to:

A Tabled

Date Filed:

Public Hearing Date:

%Approvcd A Denied
A Approved with revisions

A Referred to:

A Tabled

UBC Commission Decision for Adoption:

Effective Date:




UTAH DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE
DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL AND PROFESSIONAL LICENSING
160 East 300 South Salt Lake City UT 84111
PO Box 146741 Salt Lake City UT 84114-6741

E-mail: b8@utah.gov
Web: www.dopl.utah.gov

REQUEST FOR CODE AMENDMENT

Requesting Agency/Person: Home Builders Association of Utah

Date:6 Jun 20204

Street Address:38 W 113775 S suite 120

City, State, Zip Draper Utah §4020

Contact Person: Ross Ford

Phone:801-361-9301

Code to be Amended: 2023 National Electric Code (NEC)

(Include edition)

Section: 210.8(D)

Section Title: Specific Appliances

AMENDMENT:

Type proposed amendment in rule change form. (Using strikeout on portions being removed and underline on all new wording.)

Strike 8 through 11
210.8(D) Specific Appliances.

GFCI protection shall be provided for the branch circuit or outlet supplying the following appliances

rated 150 volts or less to ground and 60 amperes or less, single- or 3-phase:

(1) Aulomotive vacuum machines

(2) Drinking water coelers and bottle fill stations
(3) High-pressure spray washing machines

(4) Tire inflation machines

(5) Vending machines

(6) Sump pumps

(7) Dishwashers

Hi-Elestrietamees

Oy Wat-nrotmntedovens

€ o

(12) Microwave avens




Purpose of or Reason for the amendment:

Reason:

The two main reasons for this amendment are the (1) incompatibility issues caused by requiring 240-volt
appliances to be on a GFCI device and (2) the inadequate substantiation given when it was adopted into
the model code.

The change to this section now requires receptacles serving household ranges to be covered by a GFCI
device. The Association of Home Appliance Manufacturers (AHAM) points out that when this code
proposal was submitted to the NEC, it was not submitted to the relevant product safety standards for
houschold appliances that plug into such outlets. As a result, no evaluation was conducted to evaluate
issues of compatibility between these household appliances and GFCI devices, leading to nuisance
tripping. For more information, see AHAM's white paper Nuisance Tripping of Ground-Fault Circuit
Interrupters (GFCIs) for Appliances.

The GFCI was first introduced into the NEC when loads, such as appliances, in the home were operating
on 60Hz clectricity. Therefore, the GFCIs based their protection requirements on current measurements
at 60Hz:

Virtually every modern AC electrical product has parts of the appliance that are operating at frequencies
other than 60Hz. This is due to implementation of components like LED drivers, switched-mode power
supplies, electrically commutated motors, and variable frequency drives. These components have been
implemented to meet consumer demands but also to comply with mandatory energy efficiency
regulations set by the U.S. Department of Energy and state regulators.

GFCIs need to be modernized. There are no existing requirements for how a GFCI shall react to
frequencies above 60Hz. Even if appliances have minimal, safe levels of high frequency leakage current,
GFCls are tripping and disabling critical appliances. There is a UL 943 Task Group that is working to
update the GFCl standard for modern electrical loads.

Until this update is published into UL 943 and made a compliance requirement, GFCI expansion in the
NEC is premature.

Regarding the substantiation for this change in the model code, the unfortunate event used as the sole
substantiation for the change involved an older stove with both an appliance manufacturing error as
well as an installation error. This change goes beyond requiring belt and suspenders safety provisions,
which were already in place.

The proposed requirement of GFCI protection for all 240-volt receptacles is too broad and not
supported by the committee’s substantiation. According to the NFPA article used to support the change,
the appliance in question was “an older instaliation, onc predating today’s requirement to install an
equipment grounding conductor in the branch circuit to the range™. The tragedy was only possible with
older wiring. This is another example that shows new construction and updated electrical systems do
not constitute the same dangers as those in older homes, yet this requirement was not limited to homes
with older wiring methods.

The committee contended that 240-volt receptacles presented similar hazards as 123-volt convenience

receptacles and this is not true. 240-volt receptacles are installed behind the range or drver without




being readily accessible to the consumer. 240-volt appliances are plugged in and left for the operation of

the appliance, but 125-volt receptacles are generally accessible to the consumer. If the consumer chose

to, they could use a convenience receptacle for extension cords or other appliance use, whereas a 240

volt receptacle is specific to that appliance.

Similar amendments were put in place last adoption cycle however the language in the 2023 code can be interpreted

to get around previous amendments.

Cost or Savings Impact of Amendment:

The cost will vary depending on size of home and number of appliances, but it is estimated to generate a savings of

over $300 per home

Compliance Costs for Affected Persons (APcrson@ means any individual, partnership, corporation, association,
governmental entity, or public or private organization of any character other than an agency.) (You must break out
the impact cost to State Budget, Local Government and you must state aggregate cost to other persons {cost per

person times number of persons affected}):

This amendment will have no cost change for affected persons

Signature:

Date: 6/6/2024

For Division Use:

Date Received:

Committee Action:

A Approved A Denied
@Approved with revisions
A Referred to:

A Tabled

UBC Commission Decision for Hearing:

A Approved for hearing A Denied
A Approved with revisions
A Referred to:

A Tabled

Date Filed:

Public Hearing Date:

UBC Commission Decision for Adoption:

%Approved A Denied

A Approved with revisions
A Referred to:

A Tabled

Effective Datc:




UTAH DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE
DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL AND PROFESSIONAL LICENSING
160 East 300 South Salt Lake City UT 84111
PO Box 146741 Salt Lake City UT 84114-6741

E-mail: b8@utah.gov
Web: www.dopl.utah.gov

REQUEST FOR CODE AMENDMENT

Requesting Agency/Person: Home Builders Association of Utah

Date:6 Jun 20204

Street Address;38 W 113775 S suite 120

City, State, Zip Draper Utah 84020

Contact Person: Ross Ford

Phone:801-361-9301

Code to be Amended: 2023 National Electric Code (NEC)

(include cdition)

Section: 21.52(C)(2)

Section Title: Kitchen receptacles on Islands and Peninsulas

AMENDMENT:

Delete the entire section




Purpose of or Reason for the amendment:

Cost or Savings Impact of Amendment:

The cost will vary depending on size of home and number of devices, but it is estimated to generate a savings of over

$300 per home

Compliance Costs for Affected Persons (APerson@ means any individual, partnership, corporation, association,
governmental entity, or public or private organization of any character other than an agency.) (You must break out
the impact cost to State Budget, Local Government and you must state aggregate cost to other persons {cost per

person times number of persons affected}):

This amendment will have no cost change for affected persons

Signature:

Date: 6/6/2024

For Division Use:

Date Received:

Committee Action:

A Approved @Denied
A Approved with revisions

A Referred to:

A Tabled

UBC Commission Decision for Hearing:
A Approved for hearing A Denied

A Approved with revisions

A Referred to:

A Tabled

Date Filed:

Public Hearing Date:

A Approved @)enied
A Approved with revisions
A Referred to:

A Tabled

UBC Cammission Decision for Adoption:

Effective Date:




UTAH DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE
DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL AND PROFESSIONAL LICENSING
160 East 300 South Salt Lake City UT 84111

PO Box 146741 Salt Lake City UT 84114-6741
E-mail: b8@utah.gov
Web: www.dopl.utah.gov

REQUEST FOR CODE AMENDMENT

Requesting Agency/Person: Home Builders Association of Utah | Date:6 Jun 20204

Street Address:38 W 113775 S suite 120

City, State, Zip Draper Utah 84020

Contact Person; Ross Ford Phone:801-361-9301

Code to be Amended: 2023 National Electric Code (NEC)

(Tnclude edition)

Section: 220.5(c)

Section Title: Floor area

AMENDMENT:

Type proposed amendment in rule change form, (Using strikcout on portions being removed and underline on all new wording.)

220.5(C) Floor Area. The floor area for each floor shall be calculated from the outside dimensions of the
building, dwelling unit, or other area involved. For dwelling units, the calculated floor area shall not
include open porches, garages, or unfinished areas not adaptable for future use as a habitable room or
occupiable space.




Purpose of or Reason for the amendment:

In the 2023 NEC development cycle, garages were removed from the list of exempted areas solely
because “there are general lighting load requirements throughout the entire dwelling,” including the
garage. As written, this section requires the floor area of garages to be included in the branch-circuit load
calculations. It does not add any additional electrical loading through receptacie outlets, lighting, etc. It
simply requires more capacity in the electrical panel despite discussions happening that electrical loads
are declining due to more efficient lighting and appliances.

This amendment restores the application of this section to the 2020 code by replacing the word “garages”.

Consider that the code requires the following electrical loads which would fall under the calculation of
Section 220.5(C).

- One 20-amp receptacle outlet in each vehicle bay
- One lighting outlet

Section 220.41 allows motors rated less than [/8 hp to be considered part of the minimum lighting load
when connected to a lighting circuit. However, garage door openers available today are typically 2 hp or
larger. They would need to be calculated separately and would not be included in the floor area
calculation.

Cost or Savings Impact of Amendment:

There is no cost increase for this amendment.

Compliance Costs for Affected Persons (APerson@ means any individual, partnership, corporation, association,
governmental entity, or public or private organization of any character other than an agency.) (You must break out
the impact cost to State Budget, Local Government and you must slate aggregate cost to other persons {cost per
person times number of persons affected} ):

This amendment will have no cost change for affected persons

Signature: Date: 6/6/2024

For Division Use:

Date Received:

Committee Action: x UBC Commission Decision for Hearing:
A Approved @Denied A Approved for hearing A Denied

A Approved with revisions A Approved with revisions

A Referred to: A Referred to:

A Tabled | A Tabled




Date Filed:

Public Hearing Date:

UBC Commission Decision for Adoption:

A Approved &Denicd
A Approved with revisions

A Referred to:

A Tabled

Effective Date:




UTAH DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE
DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL AND PROFESSIONAL LICENSING
160 East 300 South Salt Lake City UT 84111

PO Box 146741 Salt Lake City UT 84114-6741
E-mail: b8@utah.gov
Web: www.dopl.utah.gov

REQUEST FOR CODE AMENDMENT

Requesting Agency/Person: Home Builders Association of Utah | Date:6 Jun 20204

Street Address:38 W 113775 S suite 120

City, State, Zip Draper Utah 84020

Contact Person: Ross Ford Phone:801-361-9301

Code to be Amended: 2023 National Electric Code (NEC)

(Tnclude edition)

Section: 314.27(A)(2)

Section Title: Ceiling Outlets

AMENDMENT:

Typc proposcd amendment in rule change form. (Using strikeout on portions being removed and underline on all new wording.)

At every outlet used exclusively for ceiling suspended paddle fan lighting, the box shall be designed or
installed so that a luminaire or lampholder can be attached. Boxes shall be required to support a luminaire
weighing a minimum of 23 kg (50 1b). A luminaire that weighs more than 23 kg (50 Ib) shall be supported
independently of the outlet box, unless (he outlet box 1s listed for not less than the weight (o be supported.
The interior of the box shall be marked by the manufacturer to indicate the maximum weight the box shall
be permitted to support.




Purpose of or Reason for the amendment:

This amendment eliminates the need for weight rated boxes for small fixtures. For example, there is no
need for a box to be rated to hold a 50 pound fixture when the fixture is a small LED light installed close

to a wall and used to illuminate art.

Cost or Savings Impact of Amendment:

This amendment will reduce the cost by $6 per non rated light box.

Compliance Costs for Affected Persons (APerson@ means any individual, partnership, corporation, association,
governmental entity, or public or private organization of any character other than an agency.) (You must break out
the impact cost to State Budget, Local Government and you must state aggregate cost to other persons {cost per

person times number of persons affected}):

This amendment will have no cost change for affected persons

Signature:

Date: 6/6/2024

For Division Use:

Date Received:

Committee Action:

UBC Commission Decision for Hearing:

A Approved @Denied A Approved for hearing A Denied
A Approved with revisions A Approved with revisions

A Referred to: A Referred to:

A Tabled A Tabled

Date Filed: Public Hearing Date:

A Approved enied
A Approved with revisions
A Referred to:

A Tabled

UBC Commission Decisiqé}l;)r Adoption:

Effective Date:




UTAH DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE
DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL AND PROFESSIONAL LICENSING
160 East 300 South Salt Lake City UT 84111

PO Box 146741 Salt Lake City UT 84114-6741
E-mail: b8@utah.gov
Web: www.dopl.utah.gov

REQUEST FOR CODE AMENDMENT

Requesting Agency/Person: Home Builders Association of Utah | Date:6 Jun 20204

Street Address:38 W 113775 S suite 120

City, State, Zip Draper Utah 84020

Contact Person: Ross Ford Phone:801-361-9301

Code to be Amended: 2023 National Electric Code (NEC)

(Include edition)

Section: 406.4(D)(4)

Section Title: Arch Fault Circuit Interrupters (AFCI) Receptacle Replacement

AMENDMENT:

Delete the entire scction




Purpose of or Reason for the amendment:

The last time the list of locations within a dwelling requiring AFCIs was changed was in the 2014 NEC,
and 1t was substantiated by pointing to the decision to add them to the code in the 1990s. Since then,
that original decision has not been revisited despite mounting evidence that these devices do not offer
the benefits they were intended for.

AFCls were first introduced in the 1999 edition of the National Electrical Code (NEC) with an effective
date of Jan. 1, 2002, The approval of the code change was based on the U.S. Consumer Product Safety
Commission (CPSC) report Revised Residential Fire Loss Estimates: 1980 ~1998. However, the number of
incidents cited at the time was nearly five times higher than in the later CPSC report 2010-2012
Residential Fire Loss Estimates (see Table 1). This significant change is not duc to any effect from the
slow rollout of AFCls after 2002 which was limited to bedroom circuits until the 2008 NEC and only

where the latest edition was adopted.

Table 1: Change in Electrical Distribution Fire Estimates

CPSC Report 2015 CPSC Report Percentage of
1980-1998 2010-2012 Original Estimate

Total Estimated Fires

Attended by the Fire 47,000 9,600" 20%
Service (Annual Average)

T The properties that were included in the analysis were single/multifamily dwellings, any type of
boarding houses, dormitories, sorority/fraternity houses, hotels/motels, and mobile and motor homes
not in transit.

[t is important to note that the lower number from the later report includes mobile (manufactured)
homes and motor homes (RVs) that are not in transit. [t is unclear to what extent these particular
property types contribute to the overall number of fires, and the proposed exception does not exempt
them.

Where the data showed that AFCls would have a minimal benefit, the results were ignored. The
resulting expected benefits led to AFCI requirements being included in the NEC, but they were
overblown. Today, the data bears this out, AFCls have now been protecting electrical systems in homes
for Lwo decades and that protection has grown to cover an extensive area of the home. If they were
effective, one should reasonably expect to see fire data showing a steady decline in fires involving

electrical wiring and related equipment. However, that is not the case.

The Fire Protection Research Foundation (FPRF), an affiliate of NFPA, concluded there is no practical
method to collect relevant data in their report Residential Electrical Firc Problem: The Data
Landscape. The FPRF investigated the available data in 2018 and concluded the following:
“Unfortunately, there are inherent challenges and barriers to the effective collection of the applicable
data Traditional data collection approaches have shortcomings that make their ultimate value
questionable (c.g , lack of detail and quality on fire department collected residential fire events)

Further, not all existing datasels are openly accessible, is lacking specific important details, or is




insufficient in quality.” There is no known data indicating that the expansion of AFCI requirements in the
NEC has resulted in a quantifiable reduction of residential fires due to electrical malfunctions.

The problems with the original rationale were so evident that even electrical manufacturers spoke

against the proposal at the time. During the 1998 code development cycle comment period,
manufacturers’ representatives stated that a large body of information was available to support

rejecting an AFCI mandate. The main issue: the electrical problems AFCls are designed to prevent oceur
overwhelmingly in older dwellings.

The July 2021 issue of the U.S. Fire Administration’s Topical Fire Report Series reported “A strong
relationship between housing age and the rate of clectrical fircs has been observed, with housing over

40 years old having the strongest association with electrical distribution fires [emphasis added].” This
finding is from the 1988 CPSC study, “Residential Electrical Distribution System Fires,” so it is comparing
homes that are now 80 years old with those that were new at that time of the study. No

similar study has been made to compare the previous findings with homes built in the last four decades.
When the home was built is important: The median age of one- and two-family housing in the U.S. is 40
years. The share of housing units built before 1970 is 38%, and those built before 1950 is 18%. According
to a study conducted by the U.S. Consumer Product Safety Commission, dwellings built before 1965 may
still have fuses instead of circuit breakers, and those built before 1945 may still have knob and tube
wiring,

No data is collected on the age of a home when a fire occurs, and the vast majority of residential fires
may occur in these older homes. The CPSC study showed that 85% of fires of electrical origin occur in
homes that are more than 20 years old at the time of the study. This means that the bulk of these

homes were wired in accordance with the 1965 or earlier editions of the NEC. Further, they were wired
with products manufactured to product safety standards of a similar vintage. In the years since this

study was produced, numerous changes have been made in both the NEC and product safety standards
which mitigate against similar fires in newer homes—even as they age.

These older homes were also wired with a very limited number of receptacle outlets, resulting in
extensive use of extension cords or improper alterations and additions to the original electrical system,
both recognized fire hazards. In addition, they are more likely to have outdated appliances, space

heaters or other characteristics that might lead to a greater risk of a fire starting. Newer homes have fire
blocking, hardwired smoke alarms and egress windows installed to today’s codes, all of which increase
the chances of surviving a fire if one does start. Even as homes built to today's residential code get

older, they will continue to provide protection for families through their improved safety.

From 1980 to 2013, data shows there has been a significant drop in the number of reported fires,

injuries and fatalities in the United States. During that time period the number of fires has dropped by

50 percent and fatalities have dropped by about the same margin, even as the population increased.

The decline was sharpest during the 1980s before AFCls were introduced. This further supports the

23

importance of encouraging homeowners to move up to newer homes without the added burden of
incrcased regulation.

| Ttis clear that requiring ATCIs in new construction will not prevent all dumage This is due to the fact




that AFCIs cannot prevent all fires and, more importantly, that clectrical fires occur overwhelmingly in
older houses. While questions regarding construction codc requirements intended to increase the safety
of homes cannot, and should not, be decided solely on the issue of cost, it is reasonable to ask il there is
a demonstrated need for the requirement or if an acceptable level of safety can be achieved through
other, less expensive means. The cost of an mcremental increasc in the margin of safety can be quite
high.

The lack of data to support AFCI expansion caused the leadership of the governing code-making panel
to ask the NFPA Research Foundation (an affiliate of NFPA who publishes the NEC) to analyze existing
fire data and make recommendations on next steps. Its report “Residential Electrical Fire Problem: The
Data Landscape” acknowledged that “data and data analytics is lacking to guide the optimum
approaches to minimize residential electrical fires and related hazards.” The report also observes that
“while proving the effectiveness of preventative measures (e.g., AFCIs) is a challenging task, the
significant limitations associated with the existing traditional data sources presents serious concerns.” It
is clearly not the time to expand AFCI coverage in the home when the benefits cannot be verified.
Higher regulatory costs have real consequences for working American families. These regulations end up
pushing the price of housing beyond the means of many teachers, police officers, firefighters and other
middle-class workers. Nationally, for every $1,000 increase in the price of a home, about 140,500
houscholds are priced out of the market for a median-priced new home. (These houscholds would

qualify for the mortgage before the price increase, but not afterward. In Utah for every $1000 increase about 1498
households are priced out of the market.

Mandating costly incremental increases in safety will only protect those who can afford them and will
often decrease safety for those who cannot. Families who cannot qualify to purchase homes due to the
increcased costs from mandatory code requirements such as AFCIs will have to live in housing that is less

safe, because (hat housing was built to less stringent code requirements.

Cost or Savings Impact of Amendment:

The cost will vary depending on size of home and number of devices, but it is estimated to gencrate a savings of over
$300 per home

Compliance Costs for Affected Persons (APerson@ means any individual, partnership, corporation, association,
governmental entity, or public or private organization of any character other than an agency.) (You must break out
the impact cost to State Budget, Local Government and you must state aggregate cost to other persons {cost per
person times number of persons affected}):

This amendment will have no cost change for affected persons




Signature:

Date: 6/6/2024

For Division Use:

Date Received:

Committee Action:

A Approved enied
A Approved with revisions

A Referred to:

A Tabled

UBC Commission Decision for Hearing:
A Approved for hearing A Denied

A Approved with revisions

A Referred to:

A Tabled

Date Filed:

Public Hearing Date:

A Approved L_’\/bcnied
A Approved with revisions :
A Referred to:

A Tabled

UBC Commission Decisitp,l for Adoption:

Effective Date:




Jtah Code

Part 6
Statewide Amendments to National Electrical Code

15A-3-601 General provisions.
The following are adopted as amendments to the NEC to be applicable statewide:

(1) The IRC provisions are adopted as the residential electrical standards applicable to residential
installations under the IRC. All other installations shall comply with the adopted NEC.
(2) InNEC, Section 210.8(A), the words "through 250-volt" are deleted.

(3) InNEC, Section 210.8(A)(5), the word "Basements" is deleted and replaced with "Unfinished portions
or areas of the basement not intended as habitable rooms."
(4) NEC, Section 210.8(F), is deleted.
(5) NEC, Sections 210.52(C)(2) and (3) are deleted and replaced with the following:
"210.52(C)(2) Island and peninsular countertops and Work Surfaces. Receptacle outlets, if installed to
serve an island or peninsular countertop or work surface, shall be installed in accordance with
210.52(C)(3). If a receptacle outlet is not provided to serve an island or peninsular countertop or work
surface, provisions shall be provided at the island or peninsula  for future addition of a receptacle
outlet to serve the island or peninsular countertop or work surface.
210.2(C)(3) Receptacle outlet location. Receptacle outlets shall be located in one or more of the

following:
(a)On or above, but not more than 500 mm (20 inches) above a countertop or work surface.

(b)In a countertop using receptacle assemblies listed for use in countertops.
(c)In a work surface using receptacle outlet assemblies listed for use in work surfaces or listed for use
in countertops.
Receptacle outlets rendered not readily accessible by appliances fastened in place, appliance
garages, sinks, or range tops as covered in the exception to 210.52(C)(1 ), occupying assigned
spaces shall not be considered as these required outlets.
Exception: In dwelling units designed to be accessible to persons with disabilities, receptacles shall be
permitted to be installed not more than 300 mm (12 inches) below the countertop or work surface.
Receptacles installed below a countertop or work surface shall not be located where the countertop or
work surface extends more than 1 50 mm (6 inches) beyond its support or base. *

(6) NEC, Section 210.12, is deleted.

(7) NEC, Section 210.65, is deleted.

(8) NEC, Section 230.67, is deleted.

(9) NEC, Section 230.71, is deleted and replaced with the following: "230.71 Maximum Number of
Disconnects. (A) General. The service disconnecting means for each service permitted by 230.2, or
for each set of service-entrance conductors permitted by 230.40, Exception No. 1, 3, 4, or 5 shall
consist of not more than six switches or sets of circuit breakers, or a combination of not more than six
switches and sets of circuit breakers, mounted in a single enclosure, in a group of separate enclosures,
or in or on a switchboard or in switchgear. There shall be not more than six sets of disconnects per
service grouped in any one location. For the purpose of this section, disconnecting means installed as
part of listed equipment and used solely for the following shall not be considered a service
disconnecting means:

(1) Power monitoring equipment;



(2) Surge-protective device(s); Utah Code Page 2

(3) Control circuit of the ground-fault protection system; or

(4) Power-operable service disconnecting.

(B) Single-Pole Units. Two or three single-pole switches or breakers, capable of individual operation,
shall be permitted on multiwire circuits, one pole for each ungrounded conductor, as one multipole
disconnect, provided they are equipped with identified handle ties or a master handle to disconnect all
conductors of the service with no more than six operations of the hand.

(C) Beginning on July 1, 2027, Section 230.71(B) is no longer in effect.

(10) NEC, Section 314.27(C), is deleted and replaced with the following: "314.27(C) Boxes at Ceiling-
Suspended (Paddle) Fan Outlets. Outlet boxes or outlet box systems used as the sole support of a
ceiling-suspended (paddle) fan shall be listed, shall be marked by their manufacturer as suitable for
this purpose, and shall not support ceiling-suspended (paddle) fans that weigh more than 32 kg (70
1b). For outlet boxes or outlet box systems designed to support ceiling-suspended (paddle) fans that
weigh more than 16 kg (35 1b), the required marking shall include the maximum weight to be

supported.”
(11) NEC, Section 406.9(C), is deleted and replaced with the following: "406.9(C) Bathtub and Shower
Space. Receptacles shall not be installed within or directly over a bathtub or shower stall.”

Amended by Chapter 209, 2023 General Session

Page 2



Jtah Code

Part 6
Statewide Amendments to National Electrical Code

15A-3-601 General provisions.
The following are adopted as amendments to the NEC to be applicable statewide:
(1) The IRC provisions are adopted as the residential electrical standards applicable to residential
1nsta11at10ns under the IRC. All other installations shall comply with the adopted NEC.

: : 210.8(A)the-words "through250-velt"are-deleted:

3 rL_LNEC Section 210.8(A) number (5) the word “Basements” is deleted and replaced with “Unfinished
portions or areas of the basement not intended as habitable rooms.'

(3) In NEC. Section 210.8(A) number (6). the following is added after the word Kitchens: ©“ — where
the receptacles are installed to serve the countertop surfaces”.

(4) In NEC. Section 210.8(A) number (7) is deleted”.

(5 )In NEC. Section 210.8(D) numbers (8) through (12) are deleted.

{—L)L__In NEC Sectlon 210 8(F) is deleted

s -@-}(——}—M—ﬂﬂd—ﬁﬂ%ﬁﬁﬁ—l—ﬁ%ﬂ%ﬂmﬁq—&ﬁd l&e%k—‘&umeeﬁ—fé’ceteﬁmhnmaﬁ%
nstabes H%fﬁ%maWMae&ah&H—meHHedﬁ%me

l-countertopor werk

(2} In-a countertop-using receptacle-assemblies listed for-use-in-counter lef}fr
(3+1n-a werk-surface usine receptacle-outlet-assemblies listed foruse-in-work-surfaces-or listed for

use-ir-eountertops:
Reeewaele—emlels—mﬁde} ed—not—readilyaccessibleby—apphanees—as ’
e-sriith '.9%—!—&!4*18—}(}}%—&%—69*13! -ec-in-the-exeepton-te 212 ‘—EE}(—I—)—UthJ}‘r—H%H*M“ﬂetl—tﬁa&C—‘-
sipsicher erequtred-outiets

Exceptlou—hkd%eﬂmu—tm&t&rdewned—m—beﬂweﬁ lete 5 : ~shal

WML%WHW&%M&W%}H%WP&W
eptae ' G Top-aewerk- %HM&#MM&%E@%&%?H{W

WEH&&E—%&H&%hMﬁ%—{@—%ﬁE%}E&GH&—M

(63 NEC Section 21012 -is-deleted.

(7 NEC Section 210.65, is deleted.

(§)NEC. Section 215.18, is deleted.

(9) NEC, Section 225.42 is deleted.

£23(10) NEC, Section 230.67, is deleted.

(93(11) NEC, Section 230.71, is deleted and replaced with the following: "230.71 Maximum Number of
Disconnects. (A) General. The service disconnecting means for each service permitted by 230.2, or
for each set of service-entrance conductors permitted by 230.40, Exception No. 1, 3,4, or 5 shall consist
of not more than six switches or sets of circuit breakers, or a combination of not more than six switches
and sets of circuit breakers, mounted in a single enclosure, in a group of separate enclosures, or in or
on a switchboard or in switchgear. There shall be not more than six sets of disconnects per service




grouped in any one location. For the purpose of this section, disconnecting means installed as part of
listed equipment and used solely for the following shall not be considered a service disconnecting
means:
(1) Power monitoring equipment;
(2) Surge-protective device(s); Utah Code Page 2
(3) Control circuit of the ground-fault protection system; or
(4) Power-operable service disconnecting.
(B) Single-Pole Units. Two or three single-pole switches or breakers, capable of individual operation,
shall be permitted on multiwire circuits, one pole for each ungrounded conductor, as one multipole
disconnect, provided they are equipped with identified handle ties or a master handle to disconnect all
conductors of the service with no more than six operations of the hand.
© Beglnmng on July 1,2027, Section 230.71(B) is no longer in effect
oy In NECS 27y s-deleted-and replaced-witht . L 2T Beoxesat Cerhire
wcﬁm&a&&a—bﬁ%%w—@a%w&ukﬁba%&w—mﬂk—mpw
eeiling-suspended-(paddle)-fan-shall be-listed—shall -be ' s-suitablefor
this-purpese—and-shall not-suppert-ceiling-suspended{ :
MMHWHWHﬂ%%%WBé&FWWMWW%%%
weigh-more-than—16-keg {35 1b)—the required-marking shall include the-maximum-—weightto-be
(12) In NEC. Section 334.24. the last sentence is deleted and replaced with the following: “For flat cables.
the minor diameter dimension of the cable shall be used to determine the bending radius when bending
on the flat side of the cable. For all other bends. the major diameter dimension shall be used.”
(13) In NEC, Section 338.24. the last sentence is deleted and replaced with the following:
“For flat cables. the minor diameter dimension of the cable shall be used to determine the bending
radius when bending on the flat side of the cable. For all other bends. the major diameter dimension
shall be used.”
(14) In NEC. Section 406.9(B)(2). the words “be listed weather-resistant type, and installation shall” are
deleted.
i H%%M%%MM&:W&%&M&&W%&#H%MMM
Space—Reeceptacles-shall-not-be- i-or-directh-overa-bathtub-orshowerstall”
(15) NEC. Section 700.3(A) is deleted and replaced with the following: “700.3(A) Conduct or Witness

Test. The authority having jurisdiction shall conduct or witness a test of the complete system upon
installation and periodically afterward.

_n-\ v

Tw

Amended by Chapter 209, 2023 General Session

Page 2



Support

Rafect

Modify

Overview imarselal mpract as-written

EdAmlA 3

7 =

Ritlos st of Sefinglon

1103 Cybersscucity concerns 1
e Jei il : | .
rrat sl werhimanfiie™ % new
11012 i none L
Perhaps an Impact, although moat facliities are doing it lo
i 1. This only applies to 1,000A rated
7 design An
erginens Tikrly akcary s Wi asNwars i doihe
110.16 Art flish uign ne i n e Inutances L L)
‘Servicing and rmaintenance require p: it for the
1037 [applleatian, perfarmed by gualified peisans |1ibwt proame, 2 b g dant x
Potentially a financial impact o he cost of reconditioned
o il 4 prkiat I i but probably already being dane. Very rarely
11020 it stanilards wd ptentially b *
The thi vl i
11021 ﬂ“oﬁ._ or dessoved i
Disconnecning means must be marked with Lheir
pETET seipply nsisice ¥

11026 £ 110 34

anufacturers are currently
1o maximize fioor space
have a minimal financial imp:

Egress obstruction c
clarications o resi
rust be flat, ded
£qypment

d and expanded,
aceess rules, working space
space expanded to the service

X
11039 Ciatsficatian 1o “within Sght” rutes w
008 Claiitications o toibiczzes [
108 i i
I i X

-
GFCls must be lhted, and g0 through

iz windows now ¥

TB.4{A7)

Current arnndmant b i and suareen mengy

Dwnlling GFLE rides evpanded s " secepiacion
biihan i |

Cout savings

Echeli uppresamatnhy STOE pev prvud
GFCls now required for buffet serving areas of other  |areas. Thi scenario does not present i .,
210 8(B}){4) than dwellings however. [

il v ihveye

The rules for GFCI near sinks of olher than dwellings | Potes ‘adds appro
units were expanded 1o include the distance supplles these areas, ugh ofien this change does not
1 LAY A 2dd any new orotection, i
Adily wppraamiatily 13000 per o sappbrs (i
GFEI e el arnas, This seertac fers it mreve) el oo aften,
o el romtalivery, tueh ot however .
210 8{0)
H0 8
o i i il
non required receptacles (iike the apeners), and any | This results in 3 cont saving. should the installer choase to
200 TUr4 outdaor recentacle may now ha on the clreuit take advantage.
21012
21017 circuiting rules of hotels.
Ten ampere branch circuils are now allowed in limited
rnas ieari
Changes made lo correlate with 210.18 and 10A
21023 LLILSTE
Residential hitch ertops rules for islands and
21052 I i
062 s [ shasiind




Support

Sactian/Article Ovarview Finandial Impact Raject Modify
21065 1 wete e U e .
Battery-operated wall-mounted control devices
imiar 1o light switches} must fail in the “closed”
23170 tion Hoeie, the targ v
VEgting ot 15 frow s erjusmad i Liisnubrg arean of i B withet @ gl in
210 70/AH1) gy scr jiften
A addnzal T, an ey Fow Eresil s i
the fst place Those that did were nat likely to
1ake advantage anyway. The exception for bulkhead doors
The required outdoor Humination must now be Iomevpsamat f apone wan applying the coe fhet flim sy
provided by an outdoor lighting outlet, an exception | {doubtiul), The revision to the dimmer requirements al
‘wat added for bulkhend enclosure stairways, and the | stalt ey 12 ahuo  conl savrigs fe arvpers that tesd und
200 AL imenar ollewance 32 wais mas revn el apglied th s ||ty [itsaditad],
Minimal if any cost impact, as the panelboards addressed in
Barriers over the lugs of panelboards supphied by » | this section are almos) always golng o be maln breaker as
iransformer secondary or feeder Lap are naw opposed Lo main lug. Could add $2 00, ahhough the
21515 miued. sl s oy bt sttty previded iy the manufactures.
Surge protection i now required for dwellings,
suites, and patient
21518 od care [acHlities and nursing homes «
iy st inatallatinis,
the driving factor for
construction of dwellings. Keeping up with the Jonses s
|more often the drlver, and large garages are likely to have
house, which coutd ultimately Increate the rating of 3
The square foolage of dwelling Unit garages i now | kerwice if the load cakulation was that close ta requirlng a
2205 It il i 4k ! 10 hegln with

Lghting laad calculation for schooks and arenas were

22042 lseduced

S0 deerrans i gl Fad reqement
for schools and arenas, vielding significant cost savings.

The 7S% demand factor for dwelllng unh appiiances
0 tonger Includes electrical vehlcle supply

is could be a cont Inerease, but taken with other

lating changes the loads for electric vehicles have
uitimately been reduced Few peaple are using the standard
imethod of calculation anyway, 30 [n most instances this has

22083 equipment, s it 2 all
An EVSE Is now calcdlated at nameplate value or 7,200VA,
whichever is larger. This Is a standard calculation, not
optionsl method, sa it often will not apply. Regardiess, the
|nameplate was already used due to lack of a specific rule, so
22057 Piow srusion for sbetiri wilicle charping wai added  [thiy b |renjiitecd b9 thvm smat mageny of i
2960 Clanification to the A/C versus heat issue T, chorsicaran
. This has the potential to be the blggest cost reducnon in
decades, depending on the complenity of the energy
Energy management systems (EMS) are now allowed d, s0
22070 In lisw of 3 load caleulation TRvit il s ey s a8 malancrs Gl sme i sstidted
Clarification (0 the sealing requirement Lo maich
I other related sachons e, 0 o othus Ll pect
New rule mirrors the lan, 30,85 for “This could have cast impact, but in ne: ullations in
22541 Emarg ey e e Veriben i LS L by heseg un)
Surge protection requirements were added See
33842 21518
- | Mhis change will aimost certalnly have no impact, sithough,
should the isvue arkse, It would be an additional cost. Electric
Underground boxes containing service conductors | ublities fikely have requirements that prohibit what this rule
0.0 st oot Al eftin nrahibils anyway. so the paint s likely moot.
Clarification 10 the seal quirement Lo match
B 2308 other related sections Nene.
This rude sl i S asize i e 5 e eption = i
sectian, and lypieally the condutlors that are overhead are
The clearance for overhead serwce conductors above | ublity-owned 10 begin with and therefore NEC exempt No
1934 naf o iy 5
23030 Type TEER cabbe v aBsan I
Type TC-ER cable and flexrble bus systems are now
Il 23043 Mtonwed in come applications.
Surge protection requirements were expanded to
include dor , guest rooms, guest suites, and
patient sle ms of nursing homes and
23067 tytad-care facilitiss.
Additional types af equipment are now recognized in
23071 1his sechinn. ac are sxisting InstallaHons
New marking requirements for the neutral disconnect | T s emar T il and ware
llnk of multi section switchgear and switchbaards | replaced in this edifion No cost Impact, as the tule Is for
230,74 were added
Tha sllirmalle smiing seve dlirified, ned marking This sk bty wranatmd practics m Wk fur davades,
23085 regitirinesity serre added it beme lnilud e althaugh the slgnage could add perhaps $5 00 per dwelling
Minimal if ay cort impact, a3 these allowances were
Adjustable trlp clrcult breakers may now utlize the | prabiably already being used, albeit Incorrectly. 8y the letter
40401 “next standard size” allowsnce of Lhis sectan ol bl i i &gt iovmal
No coil effect until 14 AWG copper-clad conductors are
Copper-clad conduclors are now discussed Inthe | allowed That could happen in 2026 or 2029, In which case
740 4411) for 104 devicer this is a cost benefit
Doubtful that this has any financlal, as the facilities that
[Remintely afjustable whnr v ipeoti
240 6{D} for security.
Overcurrent devices, GFCly, and prolective relays
2407 1 now be listed Mo, il iy foe s amielad tusese.




Support
Section/Article Ovendew 7! Financlal impact as-written
T selective coordinanan is required {emergency Wity il AL wilT Bmeted sppiealib p I gssiil
[systems, legally required standby, and el the |simpty require adjusting an adjustabl breaker, it
[coordination must now extend 1o feeder could cost pechaps $4,000 f a unique avercurrent dewce
24013 supglied by that serviee needs to be used 0
This is already required by the praduct slandard, 50 no cost
24016 | Ml g 1atiigs stwmew sutahlished  |impact. 0
Likely no real-world impact, as thit wat probably already
The allowale use of tools for enclosures containing  |allawed by Inspectors. By the letter of the law, however, itis
| joygme dewiees s erdianded, st bt .
Tty ws 3 prac e e shat man quite rare, and s ne
Overcurrent devices are na longer allowed In the burthar 4ot is
pLLEL A hath il cernereul uldag, .
These products are typwally already listed, and they are
240 60 i v sl Lo Bvied ratgly ay Exteeanely emall mpace. .
piviL] | Bl et A i, izt mms L lateel  Brin e, thes o8 e i .
No cost impacl, a3 recondibioning Is never required and for
Eire ] S i SEDY ity 10t peeenditivied, | SPDs it would likely be impostible. .
Hry M1 5P nrad e beatar bt new Stamr, this i i it b .
ion of what is considered “objectionable Not likely to have an impact, b it does it could only yield
2506 disg, x
Several clarifications were made to the rules
250 3§ e {#ta financial impact. *
Ventilation openings in a tranyformer (of other}
250 64{G) enclosure must not be obstructed r-l._..r alvesiby il =t "
TarER Clarification on haw 10 measure waler pipe memn, clasificatinn B
No direct cost impact, although the added Informational
el ravesions worn madde, wll b formasen. [Note is likely (@ arm Inatallers wilh informabion Lhat could
25070 |Note was added. <ave them money. 0
The bonding requirements in hazardous locations | No costimpact, as 501,30, 502,30, or 503 30 already
250100 were revised for accuracy. [ equired this 0
Uting a metal enclosure for part of the effectve
ground-fault current path ks still allowed, but None, as this does not require anything that 250.4[A}(3) did
250109 s not ulimately require =
kers must now be connecled to an equipment | They almost certainly already were, bul in very rare cases
250114 ding conductar ths could cost money. x
Very seldom is FMC or LFMC used as the EGC. Furthermore,
nless steel FMCand LFMC are very rare, so
Staintess steel FMC and LFMC have restrictions on  [litlle impact. This would add a maximum of $2 00 in the rare
250.118 ceeiinrmne re that i wildd anpeal, .
mtallations withoutan | Inspectars were likely already atlowing this, but if they
30130 wrtan't this would e 2 cost henefit. *
[Existing ranges and dryess can use the uninsulated | This is a cosl saving in the somewhal rare instance that it
250140 neutral of SE cable as the Gult cucrent path omes up, N
M8 £54 i 8- b vt v by vithc it wachy dithyer L
The exception for rail plates was increased 10 allow
reinfoced thermosetring resin conduit without the
3004 extra protection i
E et T at |Possible substantial cort savings if used. IL could be argued
300.4(E) pristallcoerigated rpaf decl e code already alliwed iz, hewres .
Imsulating bushings for raceways mustbe in piace
300.4G} before the cands are inytalled 300.18 already required thi. .
This could only be viewed as a cost savingy, as previous
300 5(A) Caownr [l o]} dhejetn fior EMT wan agdded, wyriienn il mot seem i alles th pretics. o
Minimral cest, o inidesgrecind ztallatons of dervice
are ingly rave. Usually an
[ Warning ribbons for undergraund service conductors |Instaltation on the line side of the service is a service lateral,
300 5{D}{3] |are now required for raceway i which 1 NEC esempt via 90 2 "
i ements were expanded to
L. 3005 Sstional Vs of epuirient _Mb_iw-nr hin e s raly rrguied by pibet code tyles. e
Class 3 cables may now ine the same permistions for | Potential cast1avings, although a Class 3 circuit is somewhat
300.11{C)2] vt o4 Elins 2 caliles pa R
Clarification was made 1o the free conductor length
300.14 is v
hardship in the rare
[ Whatrretlusdd G mraitiEng a0 e vl iy
30035 3ddrrveed. 4
None, this wat already required by lhe 3a1 22 section of the
200,17 Calilis sre s Dighidied i thesace sy Aifsnction, | applicable raceway article. o
[An exxepBian was added o allow wiring me
300.25 ay exit diseharge lighting in an esit stairway. Thes couild ol be yoweed it & T o
New section clearly states 1he requirements for M dfirect eonl jmpart, oo sws raney dus b3 clanficontin
0050 v s Lt vt naisiesd i slgiali requirements. .
Tes vapperel e
3103 warz added | o o
TR T T {Llaiifieatnis b abocn.t patalhah o ool [ ksl et .
The temperature correction factor for raceways on | Depending on the support method used, Lhis could be a cost
I ISE [rctioge il beneht x
This change is specific to sphiced canductors that are 4 AWG
the rule is followed, no cost impact, If the rute is
J1384AHT) iy foaorting i in gmrianiers was charifi A
Specific requirements for fasteners entering It they were misplaced, there is now specific guidance on
31210 addeld what 10 use "
Enclosures regulated by Article 312 now must have il |1t can eastly be argued that this was already required by
ELTAt S gy, 11027, o
No coat impact, as the fasteness come with the equipment,
Specific requirements for fasteners enteling Il they were misplaced, here is now specific guidance on
Mas arnbeaprey mere adied what to uye. .




Support
VfArtiele Overview Financial Impact ae-writlen
Terminal blocks In baxes must now be cansidered | perhaps be required, although it wauld be easy o design
214 160M6) wlven calgiliting s 1) around the rule B
3T H kol prvhaliris de for sivLy o bnjeaae J
This could have a cort Impact of $5 00 or 50, but most
Pandant bones that contain 2 hub must now utilze a | people already do it this way (o satisfy ather requirements.
14 23(HpLY listed card grip. It Falrly welt known that OSHA requires this .
This was never addressed before, but it was also seldom
[Baxes wilh cables entering through the side naw have |inatalled  remaves an ophion, but does not require
31424 frpecitie di thad st ko samibieil, vyl urdeds odin abinoces 1o et the alde sf o sl ke |y
Conduit bodies muat now have a cover, faceplate,
AWL2E tannoy efe B e f, $anri fawwn with The prodict. .
5upport methods for baxes that support ceil
314 27(C) weie clarlfied .
e Hing cell les and
312 Netangs writ e el for calieg fam Mo, *
o ware cuade b [
32023 in acceusible atfies .
NM cable s now allowed in the detached garages of
32490031 mutitamily dwellings B
T Chanifieatinn on 00 eabiey i apesnys waz made | This bs already required in 300.15. e
The sheath of NM cable munt continue al Ieast 174~ | This was already required at baxes, now apples to things like
33419 21t any cahle connactac eahiun hens smd Labliers Ne limpart. "
33424 e wani oty vuibliss b HLY el wae clarfied
Previous versions of the NEC only allowed NM eable
to beusedin ed applicatians or
toncealed for repalrs, Now new construction can use them
The restrictions for splicing NM cable without a bax | exposed. Could save large amounts of meney in Instances of
33440 wars lpasanad. .andalism or damare. 3
| Type TG-ER eable is now allowed for service under
336, 10417) tertain conditinns THiia s & rvewe allgwiiee, et ebivn bl Gl wave thoney |4
15834 [ Thit bamsiai 1idiim o Z5 1alile i claidied
sapmm Type IMC may now be manufacturad In larger sizet | This |i i s sBeatics, terkfne soull waly ok miney. ts
Type IMC in fished walls Is no longer required to he
342 30 recued [ Thin it i pii alieminee, thersfare v L]
Type RMCin fished walls Is no longer required to be
344,30 resund Thuis e, L. b wily eale money. s
Ey] fype FMC s not permitted 1o e revonditioned. Mete_ il it v
Clarifications on PVC where subject to physical
LNl damage were made B imgea & i eaplanating st .
£ rpantlon Betings ire v s st ansdergremd
installations where the conduit enters an enclosure
AL afles ersergng o grads. Beone, This i alinady raguied n S35 )
Frpe LENC m bires jreniNaally sltmard i focatuim wth
356.10(8) tmiply snrrsslve mllusrses Ncsse, (il vt ali guiby wisdreed. '
Fittings must be (dentfied for direct burlal If they are | Type EMT Is very seldom buried, and most prolecnion Irom
358 10(a}11) buried deteriaration is already required by 300.6. No Impact. .
FAADARY wirlng syrtems may new e EMT. Thit is a new allowarice. ther efore could only save money. |
1520 Tyisd ERIT sy F Thiges slivs.  Thin |y i rew sflowance; thersfors £5: Iy A saw roerey. [
Type ENT s now specifically allowed where
16210 unsd Thes 143 e Sllwanee, thestivs rauld set s v |
Insulatad Bun Pipe Is a new wiring method allowed in
Article 369 the MEC [This in @ e allemaind e, theredire sk boby st imsnies [0
Fleulble Bus System s a new wiring method allowed in
Aiticie 371 e NEC Thitinx cruld oniy aees reney. |x
TR A wiremay i sfowed wi an T2 ksbed. This is already allowed in 250 118 .
4041 Claimication i seops {wivatesi devion bof indeder] | name "
Very minimal increase, as this alfowance was seldom utilized
Enception that allows the installer 1o omat the neutral |and has a very narrow ap| ty. Could add $5 00 per
404,2(C) a1 cwitches redured. aieuit whars (b was predoely afseel, x
Back wire tevminah only allowed for 154 clrcuits with | This wat already part of the product standard, no effect on
404 18403 14 AWG wire [tost 0
At 1AEF| el ey o danmar 15 finaneal it B
s U] —|‘- .
New requirement to limit access to live paris In some
404 30 witch enclosures x
i) s reconditioning this equipment was palentally
406 2 R e . uresy L alienil imposuble anvwav. "




T Support
Sectian/article Overview _ Financal Impact avwritien | Enject Mudity
Tlanifications on types of ceceplacies for vanous
406 3{D} nndictil sors sddud none. .
Replacing 2 CO-ALR receptacle no longer requires a | Polential cot saving, aleit only in homes with aluminum
206 4(DUS) tamper-resistant receptacle branch cireut wiring .
GFPE i 4 maifed 8od depluremeits of seveytaaies that
06.4tD)E} require GFPE iy pegund v 557, »
rport terminabs,
GFClis now required al lloor receptacles in passenger tppkring fose
A0 ALG) 1 partation facilipes 0
| ——"
Viritetany = e camtntion of [seeylgies wih
406.6{D! [imtwgral nightlighs e UEH chargees aen, Thein ure optidnal 0
The cover of receptacles In damp or wet locations
408 S{AIRI0] must he capable of fully oening (i
406 9(A) 1 eptaries vy wed foc gBum o Fepe Wit M
Emep ware seibed 13 the ridey for reeeptath
406.9tC) mear Batletish sl shasers
Tamper-resistant receptacles are now required for
forter care 3, nuning homes, paychiatric
hospitals, and areas of agricultural facilities accessible
40612 10 the public | Additional 50 50 per device specified In this section "
Circuit directaries for swatchbaards and switchgear
108 30 were clarified nane s
The prsseeined frdlgtags 5t parefiosds san
408 4(B) slighisy lrrwavesd 15 20quiss byl Lotion nane or very fittle as signage It already required .
Replacement paneiboards and enciotures are
4089 ddrassed None. Lhis was added in 2020 and relocaled in 2023 x
The available fault current must be consldered when
4anA 18 selecting an enclosure | Hame dhis o slbpaty togured |y 18010 i
None, iLis very doubtiul that an AHJ would ever have
40843 amtulboniibe adw et itk med 4o b o fasitiy | allawed for even seen] this [
None, as these can be used in lieu of wire cannectors for
aandi terminations .
SPGFCl s required for 277V lighting at horticullural | None, as 277V luminaires were ultimately not permitied in
210184 faciiiies 1he 2020 NEC due to UL 943 limitations. 0
300 Hird BN T Padt 100 for germmucidal irradiation |umsimasies | nae, s aie siptionsl +
Perhaps $1 00 per house Lhat house a irath compactor with
New requirement for grommet in cabinetif a Wash |a cord-and-plug connection to an adjacent receplacle It
422 16{B} At cord el iatin i could be argued Lhat this already applies "
g fans near bathtubs and showers are now None, as this practice is extremely rare and was likely
A L) addrevsed et this, wa wed Arbifle 4100 .
anda Hastieg cabiies e now allowed 0 walls s oohanal. A
11578 Tha GFFE setfing for hast tape js rlkfied None. 110.3t8) O
None, reconditioned molors are optionsl and no guidance
4302 |Reconditianed mators are addsessed =xitted previowly. a
ad0n i Non, thiv ¢4 haating or poeding e e o
Exposed live parts for disconnects must have locking
44011 | preapaste e vinquine  tosd M, Wy mre Dl i way slioidy, 0
None, this was likely already enforced and provides uniform
a0 1 Cleasanies Iiw AT itcsinezts werk sddrl it g .
sTamary guivesasers seceeding Te' mast noe e This will impact manulacturers directly, so Utah's action or
4456 ) ety dees pat chanpe avdhing. x
larificatians o the generalor disconnect rule weie
24518 main e, alfifestion .
[Clarifications Lo the generalor emergency Very minlmal, Some generators must now have a sign, which
A48 sule st mside and ugnags o sequirnd will likely be provided by the L]
4801 ol for charily nonn ]
5005 lieatueri ow e Eleardy defined Muine "
These are new ways to satisfy existing requirements, 1o
500.7 ertign feutwliinn et sddnd +ould save monev. "
5008 s ultisately shesdy resuired 0
0130 Contrd INC bi1d BAK 308 ham i Noow, Wieg wera alinady dllessd, o
Eirmiinding 4bd Lesding i Dac | incatives wis
50130 clusitind none, editorial only .
Minimal, EMT s only allowed in Class Il, Divislon 2 locations,
#1+ locations
ol IMC and RMC are now specifically addsessed, |fitting This inslallation Lechnigue is optional, however, so it
502 10 EMAT fiatgs mmusd 1 deen not prerini ity “add ey et -
Eictrial sealing patty 1 op et Acally shpeed fur
50215 vealing i Nane, clarificanan "
[Grounding and banding in Class [l locations was
502 30 clardtinit none, adilorial anly :
lieae, th sticral .
Grounding and bonding In Qass Iil focanons was
503 30 clarlfied .
o cot, as this atricle only provides guidance on how the
fatcln 517 i artscle fior cammuhis ol patyection area is 10 be clasified .
none, thete aren't pabient care spaces 3o Parl Il didn't apply
517.10 L ary iy .
Nat likely 10 have an impact, 5 previous versions gave no
Part ¥ now includes several Lypet of equipment
Article 517.Part V. |hesides ¥ Pay .




Overview

Financlal Impact

Support,
as-written

Reject

Modity

Nonmutalic cibles st nct dllswerd in'conesaled

Could be a potennal cast increase lor farms with adpcent
o = b ! bl

siiza farlaes b it abieadly $108.00 5300 000 .
Service equipment for marinat, bostyards, and similar
now have requirements relating 1o the location of the |Likely none, a5 the service equipment it typically much
5554 #lecisical datum plane furiher than S feet (1om 1he dock X
55513 Tl Tttt .
35004 e added %
_ tions regarding existing equipment were
555 15 imade. "
The GFC) el GFFT o4 quitsvnerna ter @acbs andaniinr
ey e il None 5
[y " e
55536 power outlets L s .
HESEL | Lindpi muter bormnaires ave niw sddreaied i, 1 Hly 450 Land 110 48} .

o e for cyirrord-firniting svehi serent deviees wis
redierd

G300 LMY Iy Ho allos o fior

Ceat vavngy fur same lage terspuiary
i, 1w gt S e

25 A% Thie cornt epspiireirants fis E¥4E Lot saangs for small thargem ’
‘managemenl systems (EMS) are naw allowed | Very significant cou saungs (polentially teny of thousands or
62542 ere) .
Signage now required if the EVSE dinconnect is in a
62543 remate locarian Adey 550041 .
Adids $I00 friv deewptache it neal welden, £ ifie oo
does not already incorporate GFCl protection Noimpact in
(37 Receptacles near welders must be GFC prolected .
The GECl and SPGFCI for pooks,
fountaing, etc. now have general reguirements in thus | Itirs s=tid be tshad a3 3 werh armpd, foraawsr,
6405 o aavtios defer back ta it Lould ba zet0 impact .
A0 Hrw wactzn wypesof poal huwtery srwatty ilfrrared shaestves m the NIC. @
ions thal used direct burial
Previous edition allowed a conduil sleeve near the ceways, which is quite
68011 prol, novw e emmdied st bin 8 issnplate pitem 1are_Denending on the pool, $10.00 1a $200 00 .
Corrosive Iocations are more clearly defined, and the
[LERT] | eusmient mast L pltable, Ay el by 304 O
Additional cost {$50 00-5100 00} for repaired molars. this
eady required for replacemen 5, 30 this would
only apply to malors that are repaired wilhoul being
6871 Repaired molors must be GFCl-arotected ed d, Letsemythy pie. 0
B8O 26 Eraemens slarifed small cost savings due 1a clarificati 0
ements expanded if tMah | The first printing of the 2023 NEC shalll be the code of
68026 aczepes ik recned
anh
680.41 |ethor byses ul ulestilal equipment ¥ splies, ik ali ity e .
Tha<lnazances arsund  Bniam wepn imreaned
#8050 Vary peieleen appie; pradabiy altmudy erforenif this wep, e
[T fome. .
likely none, engineering is almosL certainly going to be
PV equipment on flosting siructures are now required for a floating building and/or floating PV array ona
690 41G} addressed body of water .
Exceptions 1o he rapid shuldown re
69012 addsbrd tor rifigiles | St uwdiig .
Clarification that pumps for one-and lwo
5 not fire pumos sy S i BT &
Y o e o {55500 pan imstallation o firs puire T
whibsiiuagh Vi inatalinhionn b Bhaly slivady devgeed andfor
enforced this way anyway as many consider fire pump rooms
6956 Wit fgcation haTeigs nos pequered a0 e gimps | damp or wet Inzaton *
Voltage drop requirements lor fire pumps were
€95.7 clarified 3 .
Diesel powered fire pumps no longer require surge
69515 i | Cout savin .
e A s e witedm S0 comemio s of (e
7003 syptem “
4 Parallsl epesstion uf pmesgency i diliesseil lafie st .
i, 7114 nmep b cannet he Eaba adeardage
Redundant tranifer equipment is naw required in utnrsnally add $15k or mare to emergency
005 sultme #ivel gy vadeim .
swilchgear. An SPD is already required for panelboards and
7008 it pesb e skl i wuntchboards. .
1L Dlane 2 bghting bs e 1l none, Class 2 ix ophonal .
Mz | lntifdtion en what tadiswes Mting rvane, tlarifsalion .
Hezd Clans 3 Aghiting psset niow bem buted none, Clays 2 15 ophonal x
et g dinstion et be maintalied
70032 et dewites i vl noar, clarfication 0
(o] A signin, ety for snididaely haslegt | Adiby §5 001 t 1 sl B
mLid Line-sidd pimrymy N v e cdadfind e &
Potential increase of $100 00-200,00, although an ESS with
An €55 with separate batieries now munt have a 1eparale batieries is quite rare. It is also worth noting that
706 15 i ore are e pegaitied, '
likely none, as these systems are very rare and hikely already
7081 Cubert ronitity et esrs hot CO75 vyitemi were added |frer tyb e in plecs .
Ratyrha 771 Piese mapicte fiom peiviing requirsmers [ x
Mevicle 320 st v
Manche TiR e antivy for Clpvs Acusists . culd uely Luve money, »




Section/Article Overview Finanelal Impact

JEbE Enntpy 1 TEMS) st e Bt it dyul il S0E ripves TRidInd, 10 60 cort imppet,

Vbt are rever requeed, 30 m oot it A,
EMS access requirements relocated from 732and | manufactwers will need to comply, s0 Ulah's action on this

75030 Elalifind thange wauld nol change anything in reality.
‘Adds about $100.00 to a fi i
Surge protection is required for power-fimited fire
76033 L 1r0l panels
L mmg Tile of article revised for clarity none




