UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION
MEETING

December 13, 2023 6:00 AM

meet.google.com/tct-ojfd-gwyg
Join by phone
{US) +1 317-936-9529 PIN: 112 486 451#

Anchor Location
Room 474
Heber M Wells Building
160 E 3008

—t

Roll call
Approve minutes from the November 8, & 29, 2023
3. Review proposed amendments

2021 IRC Section R105.2

2021 IMC Section 505.4.1

2021 IRC Chapter 11
4. Approve corrections and additions for Title 15A for public hearing
5. Discussion item

Title 10-9a-538 Modular Homes
Advisory Committee Reports
Mechanical Advisory Committee — 12-4 & 12-8-23
Structural Advisory Committee - 12-7-2023

L

Next meeting date: December 20, 2023

Pleasc call Sharon at 530-6163 if you do not plan on attending the meeting.

In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, individuals
needing special accommodations (including auxiliary communicative
aids and services) during this meeting should notify Carol Inglesby,
ADA Coordinator, Division of Occupational and Professiona! Licensing,
160 East 300 South, Salt Lake City UT 84111, Phone 530-6626, at
least three working days prior to the meeting.




MINUTES

UTAH
UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION

November 8, 2023

9:00

Convened: 9:03

STAFT:

Stephen Duncombe, Bureau Manager

Sharon Smalley, Board Secretary
Nicole Herrera, Board Secretary

COMMISSIONERS:
Thomas Peterson

Josh Blazzard
Lorianne Bisping
Travis Dalley (absent)
Trent Hunt

Ken Adams

Gary Bullock

VISITORS:

Ross Ford, Utah HBA

Don Simons, Bountiful City
Bryce McConkie, Lindon City
Brock Dael

Lynn Nielsen

John Little

Robert Glass

Ryan Jackson, Electrical Advisory
Jim Hardy

Katherine Nelson, Herriman City

ELECT A NEW CHAIRMAN
AND VICE CHAIRMAN

MINUTES

Adjourned: 12:21

Chris Hendrickson
Art Anderson

Karl Mott (excused)
Joerg Ruegemer
Scott Carpenter
Steve Dailey

George Reid

Hans Hoffman, Architectural Advisory
Chris Weintz, Architectural Advisory
Leslie Garland

Rick Sturm, Unified Code Analysis
Ron McArthur, McArthur Homes
Jerry Thompson

Jennifer Youngfield

Cloe Nixon, Dorsey & Whitney
Jeremy Moser, Alpine Homes

A motion was made by Lorianne Bisping to re-
elect Tom Peterson as chairman. The motion
was seconded by Joerg Ruegemer and passed
unanimously. Ken Adams voluntcered to be vice
chairman and Josh Blazzard seconded. The
committsion voted unanimously to accept Ken
Adams as vice chait.

A motion was made by Scott Carpenter to ap-
prove the minutes from the June 14, 2023, meet-



Page 2 of §

Minutes

Uniform Building Code Commission
November 8, 2023

CORRECTIONS FOR TITLE 15A

IBC SECTION 304.1

IBC CHAPTER 35 UNDER ICC

IRC SECTION R109.1.5 & R109.1.5.2

IRC SECTION R310.7
IRC SECTION R314.2.2
IRC SECTION 315.2.2

IRC TABLE N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2)

IRC SECTION N1102.2.13
(R402.2.13)

IRC CONVERSION FACTORS USED
FROM SEER 2

ing as written. The motion was seconded by
Joerg Ruegemer and passed unanimously.

Tom Peterson explained each of the corrections
and additions that need to be made to Title 15A.
Each item was reviewed and discussed individu-
ally by the Commission and those present. The
following are the motions that were made for
each proposal.

A motion was made by Josh Blazzard to approve
this new proposal to this section. The motion
was seconded by Scott Carpenter and passed
unanimously.

A motion was made by Scott Carpenter to ap-
prove this new amendment as modified by add-
ing the words “The 2017 ICC A117.1-17 can be
used as an alternative.” The motion was second-
ed by Steve Dailey and passed unanimously.

A motion was made by Josh Blazzard to approve
the deletion of the current amendment and re-
placing it with the new proposal. The motion
was seconded by Scott Carpenter and passed
unanimously.

A motion was made by Josh Blazzard to approve
all three of these corrections to the current
amendments. The motion was scconded by Ken
Adams and passed unanimously.

A motion was made by Ken Adams to approve
this new proposal. The motion was scconded by
Steve Dailey and passed with a vote of nine in
favor and Ken Adams voting in oppositiorn.

A motion was made by Scott Carpenter to ap-
prove this proposal. The motion was scconded
by Steve Dailey and passed with a vote of nine in
favor and Ken Adams voting in opposition

A motion was made by Scott Carpenter to ap-
prove the proposal for R1102.2.13 for the con-
version chart. The motion was seconded by
Trent Hunt and passed unanimously.



Page 3 of 5
Minutes

Uniform Building Code Commission

November 8, 2023

IRC SECTION P2902.1

IRC SECTION E3601.7

IRC SECTION E3902.15-.21

IMC SECTION 1101.2

NEC SECTION 230.71
NEC SECTION 230.72

IECC SECTION R406

[EBC SECTION 305.4.2 #7
SECTION 705.1 AND
SECTION 1011.7.3

REVIEW NEW PROPOSED
AMENDMENTS

iBC SECTION 1010.2.4

IFC CHAPTER 10 SECTION
1010.2.3.1

A motion was made by Josh Blazzard to approve
the corrections to the five section numbers. The
motion was seconded by Lorianne Bisping and
passed unanimously,

A motion was made by Josh Blazzard to approve
this new amendment. The motion was seconded
by Trent Hunt and passed unanimously.

A motion was made by Trent Hunt to approve
these corrections to Sections E3902.17,
E3902.18 , and E3902.19 The motion was se-

conded by Art Anderson and passed unanimous-
ly.

A second motion was made by Ken Adams to
approve the corrections for Sections E3902.20
through E3902.22. The motion was seconded by
Steve Dailey and passed unanimously.

A motion was made by Josh Blazzard to approve
the deletion of the current amendment for this
section. The motion was seconded by Scott Car-
penter and passed unanimously.

A motion was made by Scott Carpenter to ap-
prove the proposal for Section 230.71 and deny
the proposal for Section 230.72. The motion the
motion was seconded by Art Anderson and
passed unanimously.

A motion was by Scott Carpenter to approve the
proposal for this section. The motion was sc-
conded by Ken Adams and passed unanimously.

A motion was made by Josh Blazzard to approve
deletion of two sections and renumbering the
third section of the current amendments. The
motion was seconded by Scott Carpenter and
passed unanimously.

This new proposal is being presented 1o help
align the requirements of the Department of
Health and Human Services with the building
code. A motion was made by Josh Blazzard to



Page 4 of 5

Minutes

Uniform Building Code Commission

November 8, 2023
approve this new amendment. The motion was
seconded by Scott Carpenter and passed unani-

mously.

A second motion was made by Scott Carpenter
to approve amendment for the IFC. The motion
was seconded by Lorianne Bisping and passed
unanimously. :

IRC SECTION R109.2 A motion was made by Josh Blazzard to deny
this proposal. The motion was seconded by Lo-
rianne Bisping and passed unanimously.

IRC SECTION R109.4 A motion was made by Josh Blazzard to deny
this proposal. The motion was seconded by Lo-
rianne Bisping and passed with a vote of eight in
favor and Ken Adams and Steve Dailey voting in
opposition.

IRC SECTION R311.3 A motion was made by Lorianne Bisping to deny
this proposal. The motion was seconded by Art
Anderson and passed with a vote of nine in favor
and Ken Adams voting in opposition.

IRC SECTION E3401.2 Ryan Jackson asked the Commission to review
the proposal for this section even though it is out
of order of the agenda. During the discussion, it
was recommended that the proposal be modified.
A motion was made by Art Anderson to approve
the proposal as modified by adding the words
“Such as, but not limited to,” before the list of
items not covered. The motion was seconded by
Trent Hunt and passed unanimously.

[EBC SECTION 104.10 A motion was made by Josh Blazzard to deny
the proposal. The motion was seconded by Scott
Carpenter and passed unanimously.

IEBC SECTION 104.11.2 A motion was made by Josh Blazzard 1o deny
the proposal. The motion was seconded by Lo-
rianne Bisping and passed unanimously.

[EBC SECTION 109.3.8 A motion was made by Lorrianne Bisping to de-
ny the proposal. The motion was seconded by
Scott Carpenter and passed unanimously.

IEBC SECTION 109.3.9.1 A motion was made by Josh Blazzard 1o deny
the proposal. The motion was seconded by Lo



Page 5 of 5

Minutes

Uniform Building Code Commission
November 8, 2023

IEBC SECTION 110.4

IEBC SECTION 115.1
IEBC SECTION 117

IEBC SECTION 202

IEBC SECTION 302.3

N1102(R402)

Chapter 11

The meeting adjourned at 12:21.

rianne Bisping and passed unanimously.

A motion was made by Lorianne Bisping to deny
the proposal. The motion was seconded by Josh
Blazzard and passed unanimously.

These two proposals were reviewed together, A
motion was made by Josh Blazzard to deny both
proposals. The motion was seconded by Scott
Carpenter and passed unanimously.

These two proposals were reviewed together. A
motion was made by Gary Bullock to approve
both proposals as modified by adding the words,
“or independent third-party licensed engineer or
architect and submitted to the building official”.
The motion was seconded by Lorianne Bisping
and passed unanimously.

A motion was made by Josh Blazzard to approve
the proposal. The motion was scconded by Scott
Carpenter and passed unanimously.

The item was inadvertently not reviewed.

Note: These minutes are not intended 10 be a verbatin transcript but are infended to record the significant features of the business con-

ducted in this meeting, Discussed items are not necessarily shown in the chronclogical order they occuirred.



MINUTES

UTAH
UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION

November 29, 2023

Convened: 9:03

STAFE:

Stephen Duncombe, Bureau Manager

Sharon Smalley, Board Secretary
Nicole Herrera, Board Secretary

COMMISSIONERS:
Thomas Peterson

Josh Blazzard
Lorianne Bisping
Travis Dalley (absent)
Trent Hunt (excused)
Ken Adams

Gary Bullock

VISITORS:
Ron McArthur
Leslie Garland
Craig Hassell
Curtis Gillins
Jeramy Bristol

MINUTES

REVIEW PROPOSED AMEND-
MENTS
2021 IRC CHAPTER 11

9:00

Adjourned: 10:37

Chris Hendrickson {excused)
Art Anderson (absent)

Karl Mott (excused)

Joerg Ruegemer

Scott Carpenter (excused)
Steve Dailey

Rob Durfee
Kam Valgardson
Jerry Thompson
Bryce McConkie
Ted Black

A motion was made by Gary Bullock to approve
the minutes from the November 8, 2023, meeting
as written. The motion was seconded by Josh
Blazzard and passed unanimously.

Ron McArthur spoke to those present in connec-
tion with this proposal. He gave a detailed ex-
planation of how the proposals for the amend-
ments were developed by the ad hoc committee.
Following Mr. McArthur’s presentation, the
Commission and those present discussed the
proposals. Mr. McArthur explained that these
proposals would replace all of the current



Page 2 of 2

Minutes

Uniform Building Code Commission
November 29, 2023

IRC SECTION R105.2

IMC SECTION 505.4

DISCUSSION ITEM
TITLE 10-9A-538 MODULAR
HOMES

The meeting adjourned at 10:37.

amendments in Title 15A for IRC Chapter 11.

At this point in the meeting, the Commission lost
their quorum and could not vote on the proposal.

Craig Hassell presented this proposal to those
present. During the discussion, a recommenda-
tion was made that the Structural Advisory _
Committee review the proposal before a decision
can be made.

Craig Hassell presented this proposal to those
present. Since there was not a quorum present, it
was decided to send the proposal to the Mechan-
ical Advisory Committee for their recommenda-
tion.

Those present discussed the proposed legislation
for modular construction in the state. Tom Pe-
terson gave the background for this proposed
legislation. Kam Valgardson and Jeramy Bristol
spoke to those present in connection with this
legislation.

Note: These minutes are nof intended to be a verbatim transcript but are intended 10 record the significant features of the business con-

ducted inn this meeting. Discussed items are rot necessarily shown in the chronological order they occurred.



UTAH DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE
DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL AND PROFESSIONAL LICENSING
160 East 300 South Salt Lake City UT 84111

PO Box 146741 Salt Lake City UT 84114-6741
E-mail: b§@utah.gov
Web: www.dopl.utah.gov

REQUEST FOR CODE AMENDMENT

Requesting Agency/Person: Utah Home Builders Date:11-20-23

Street Address:38W 13775 S suite 120

City, State, Zip: Draper, Utah, 84020

Contact Person: Ross Ford Phone:801-352-8266

Code to be Amended: 2021 IRC

(Include edition)

Section:R105.2

Section Title: Work exempt from permit

AMENDMENT:

Type proposed amendment in rule change form. (Using strikeout on portions being removed and underline on all new wording

1R 105.2 In the [ist under the titie “building:” delete number 3 and replace with Retaining walls supporting less than 4 feet (1219mm) of unbalanced

full, unless supporling a surcharge




Purpose of or Reason for the amendment:

There is confusion between inspectors and builders as to when a permit is required. This amendment helps clarify that a
wall with balanced fill does not constitute a retaining wall requiring a permit.

Cost or Savings Impact of Amendment:

This will save the cost of a permit and the cost associated with preparing an application and waiting for ils approval.

Compliance Costs for Affected Persons (APerson@ means any individual, partnership, corporation, association,
governmental entity, or public or private organization of any character other than an agency.) {You must break out
the impact cost to State Budget, Local Government and you must state aggregate cost to other persons {cost per
person times number of persons affected}):

This amendment will save the government money. Curreatly there is confusion as to when a permit is required, as a
result many projects are permitted that shouldn’t be. This amendment saves money by removing the requirements fos
plan check and inspections on retaining walls that do not need a permit.

Signature: Date;

For Division Use:

Date Received:

Committee Action: UBC Commissien Decision for Hearing:
A Approved A Denied A Approved for hearing A Denied

x Approved with revisions iﬁpproved with revisions

A Referred to: A Referred to:

A Tabled A Tabled

Date Filed: Public Hearing Date:

UBC Commission Decision for Adoption:
A Approved A Denied
A Approved with revisions

A Referred to:
A Tabled Effective Date:




UTAH DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE
DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL AND PROFESSIONAL LICENSING
160 East 300 South Salt Lake City UT 84111

PO Box 146741 Salt Lake City UT 84114-6741
E-mail: b8@utah.gov
Web: www.dopl.utah.gov

REQUEST FOR CODE AMENDMENT

Requesting Agency/Person: Utah Home Builders Date:12-4-23

Street Address:38W 13775 S suite 120

City, State, Zip: Draper, Utah, 84020

Contact Person: Ross Ford Phone:801-352-8266

Code to be Amended: 2021 IMC

(Include edition)

Section: 505.4

Section Title: Make up air required

AMENDMENT:

Type proposed amendment in rule change form. {Using strikeout on portions being removed and underline on all new waording

I505.4 — A new section is added 505.4.1 Makeup air is not required in residential dwetling units where gas, liquid or solid fuel-burning appliances

located within a unit's air barrier are al! direct-vent or use a mechanical draft venting system




Purpose of or Reason for the amendmaent:

This amendment will bring the residential portion of the IMC in line with the mechanical section of the IRC,

Cost or Savings Impact of Amendment:

This amendment will save thousands per unit, when it applies.

Compliance Costs for Affected Persons (APerson@ means any individual, partnership, corporation, association,
governmental entity, or public or private organization of any character other than an agency.) (You must break out
the impact cost to State Budget, L.ocal Government and you must state aggregate cost to other persons {cost per

person times number of persons affected}):

This amendment will have cost impact for government,

Signature:

Date:

For Division Use:

Date Received:

Committee Action:

UBC Commission Decision for Hearing:

A Approved A Denied A Approved for hearing A Denied
}i\Approved with revisions A Approved with revisions

A Referred to: A Referred fo:

A Tabled A Tabled

Date Filed: Public Hearing Date:

UBC Commission Decision for Adoption:

A Approved A Denied

A Approved with revisions

A Referred to:

A Tabled Effective Date:




Utah Code

Effective 7/1/2024
15A-3-203 Amendments to Chapters 11 of IRC.

(1) In IRC , Sections N1101.4 (R102.1.1), a new section N1101.4.1 is added as follows:
N1101.4.1 National Green Building Standard. Buildings complying with ICC 700-2020 National
Green Building Standard and achieving the Gold rating level for the energy efficiency category
shall be deemed to exceed the energy efficiency required by this code. The building shall also
meet the requirements identified in table N1105.2 and the building thermal envelope efficiency is
greater than or equal to levels of efficiency and solar heat gain coefficients (SHGC) in Tables
N1102.2.2 andN1102.1.3 of the 2009 IRC.

(2) In IRC, Section N1101.5 (R103.2), all words after the words "herein governed." are deleted
and replaced with the following: "Construction documents required for building permits shall
include only those items specified in 10-5-132(8) of the state building code”

(3) in IRC, Section N1101.10.3 (R303.1.3) the following changes are made:
(a) The following is added at the end of the first sentence "or EN 14351-1:2006 + A1:2010.”
(b) The word “accredited” is replaced with “approved” in the third sentence
(c} The following sentence is added after the third sentence: “A conversion factor of 5.678 shall be used to
convert from U values expressed in Sl units: ()/5.678 = .7
(d) After “NFRC 200" the following words are added : “or EN 14351-1:2006 + A1:2010", and in the same
sentence the word “accredited” is replaced with approved.

(e) The following new sentence shall be inserted immediately prior to the last sentence: “Total Energy
Transmittance values may be substituted for SHGC, and Luminous Transmission values may be
substituted for VT~

{4) In IRC, Section N1101.12 (R303.3), all wording after the first sentence is deleted.

(5) In IRC, section N1101.13 (R401.2) in the first sentence, the words “Section N1101.13.5
and” are deleted

(6) In IRC, Section N1101.13.5 (R401.2.5) is deleted

(7) In IRC, Section N1101.14 (R401.3) Number 7 the words “and the compliance path used”
are deleted.

(8) In IRC, Table N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2),

(a) in the column titled Fenestration U-Factor the following changes are made:
(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 3" delete 0.30 and replace it with 0.32
(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4” delete 0.30 and replace it with 0.32
(iii) In the row titled “Climate Zone 6” delete 0.30 and replace with 0.32

(b) in the column titled Glazed Fenestration SHGC the following changes are made:
(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 3” delete 0.25 and replace it with 0.35

(¢) in the column titled Ceiling U-Factor the following changes are made:
(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 3" delete 0.026 and replace it with 0.033
(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4” delete 0.024 and replace it with 0.030
(iii) In the row titled “Climate Zone 6" delete 0.024 and replace with 0.030

(d) in the column titled Wood Frame Wall U Factor the following changes are made:

Page 1



Utah Code

(i) Inthe row titled “Climate Zone 3" delete 0.060 and replace it with 0.065
(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4" delete 0.045 and replace it with 0.065
(iii) In the row titled “Climate Zone 6” delete 0.045 and replace with 0.065

(e) In the column titled “Basement Wall U-Factor” the following changes are made: ,
(i) in the row titled “Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4" delete 0.050 and replace it with 0.078 .
(ii) in the row titled “Climate Zone 6" delete 0.050 and replace it with 0.065

(f) Inthe column titled “Crawl Space Wall U-Factor” the following changes are made:
() In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4" delete 0.055 and replace it with 0.078
(it) In the row titled “Climate Zone 6” delete 0.055 and replace it with 0.065

(REVISED SEP 2023}
TABLE R1102.1.2 (R402.1.2)

MAXIMUM ASSEMBLY U-FACTORS *AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS

WOOD MASS BASEMENT! CRAWL
GLAZED FRAME WALL WALL SPACE
CLIMATE | FENESTRATION | SKYLIGHT | FENESTRATION |CEILING E- WALL U-FACTOR { FLOOR U- {U-FACTOR WALL
ZONE U-FACTOR ' U-FACTOR SHGC* FACTOR [U-FACTOR FACTOR 1-FACTOR
3 0.32 0.35 0.35 0,033 0.065 0,098 0.047 ¢.001 0135
s and 0.620
= an 0.32 0.55 NR .065 0.082 0.033 0.078 0.078
Marine 4
0.030
6 0.32 0,55 NR 0.065 0.060 0.033 0.065 0.065

(9) In IRC, Table N1102.1.3 {(R402.1.3) the following changes are made:
(a) In the column titled Fenestration U-Factor the following changes are made:

(i) In the row titled "Climate Zone 3” delete 0.30 and replace it with 0.32.
(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 & Marine 4" delete 0.30 and replace it with 0.32
(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 6" delete 0.30 and repiace it with 0.32 (b)In the

column titled Glazed Fenestration SHGC the following changes are made:
(i) Inthe row titled “Climate Zone 3" delete 0.25 and replace it with 0.35.
(c)In the column titled Ceiling R-Value the following changes are made:

(i) Inthe row titled "Climate Zone 3" delete 49 and replace it with 32.
(i} In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 & Marine 4” delete 60 and replace it with 38
(iii) In the row titled “Climate Zone 6” delete 60 and replace it with 38

(d)in the column titled Wood Frame Wall R-Value the following changes are made:

(i) Inthe row titled “Climate Zone 3" delete all values and replace with 19 + Oci or 11 +
5c¢ior 0 + 15¢i.

(i} In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 & Marine 4" delete all values and repiace with 19 +
Ocior 13 + 5cior 0 + 15¢i

(iii) In the row titled “Climate Zone 6" delete all values and replace with 19 + Oci or 13 +

5ci or 0 + 15¢i
(e)in the coiumn titled Basement Wall R-Vaiue the following changes are made:

(i) Inthe row titled “Climate Zone 5 & Marine 4” delete all values and replace with 15 +
Ocior 0 + 11cior 11 + 5¢i
(i) Inthe row titted “Climate Zone 6" delete all values and replace with 19 +0ci or 0 +

13cior 11 + 5¢i
(f) In the column titled Slab R-Value and Depth the following changes are made:

(i} Inthe row titled “Climate Zone 3" delete “10ci, 2ft" and replace it with NR..

(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 & Marine 4” delete “4ft” and replace it with “2 ft".
(9)In the column titled Crawl Space Wall R-Value the following changes are made:

Page 1



Utah Code

(i) Inthe row titled “Climate Zone 5 & Marine 4" delete all values and replace with 15 +
Ocior G+ 11ci or 11 + 5ci
(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 6" delete all values and replace with 19 +Qcior 0 +
13ci or 11 + 5ci
(REVISED SEP 2023)

TABLE N1102.1.3 (R402.1.3)
INSULATION MINIMUM R-VALUES AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT *

GLAZED WOOoD CRAWL
BASEMENT
FENESTRATI FRAME MASS oy SPACE:,
N WAL WALL SLAB |l
CLIMATE | FENESTRATION | SKYLIGHT ® s | CEILING | g o [RVALUE" IFLOORR-| WALL | RAVALUE |,
SHGC RVALUE R-VALUE
ZONE U-FACTOR ® U-FACTCOR R-VALUE VALUE R-VALUE | & DEPTH
NR
19+ Gcior
3 0.32 0.55 0.33 32 |[1+5cior| 813 19 Scior 137 Scior 13t
0+ 15¢i
15+ 0ciorf 10ci,2 1t 15+ ci
58 19 + Oci or 0+ Feior or fh+
Martne 4 0325 0.55 0.40 38 [13+S8cior| 13717 30 11 + Sci tieior 11
ne 0+ 15¢i + el
19 + Oci or 19 +0ci or "gf)]c; or
6 032 0.55 NR 38 [13+5cior| 15720 30 [0+ 13cior| 10eh 40| T i’
0+ 15¢i 11 + 5ci sci

(10) In IRC, Table N1102.1.3 add footnote: . Log walls complying with ICC400 and with a
minimum average wall thickness of 5 inches or greater shall be permitted in Zones 5

thorough 8 when overail window glazing has 0.30 U-factor or lower, minimum heating
equipment efficiency is for gas 85 AFUE, or, for oil, 84 AFUE, and all other component
requirements are met.”

{(11) In IRC, a new subsection N1102.1.5.1 (R402.1.5.1) is added as follows:

1102.1.5.1 (R402.1.5.1) RESCheck 2012 Utah Energy Conservation Code. Compliance with
section N1102.1.5 (R402.1.5) may be satisfied using the software RESCheck 2012 Utah Energy
Conservation Code, which shall satisfy the R-value and U-factor requirements of N1102.1,
N1102.2, and N1102.3, provided the following conditions are met:
a. In Climate Zone 5 and 6 the software result shall show “5% better than code”, and
b. In Climate Zone 3, the software resuit shall show “5% better than code” when software
inputs for window U-facter = 0.65 and window SHGC = 0.40, notwithstanding actual
windows installed shall conform to requirements of Tables N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2) and
N1102.1.3 (R402.1.3).

(12) In IRC, Section N1102.2.1 (R402.2.1), a new Section N1102.2.1.1 (R402.2.1) is added as
follows: "N1102.2.1.1. Unvented attic and unvented enclosed rafier assemblies.
Unvented attic and unvented enclosed rafter assemblies conforming to Section R806.5
provided with an R-value of R-22 (maximum U-Factor of 0.045) in Climate Zone 3-B or an
R-value of R-26 (maximum U-factor of 0.038) in Climate Zones 5-B and 6-B shall be
permitted provided all the following conditions are met:

Page 1



Utah Code

1. The unvented attic assembly complies with the requirements of the
International Residential Code, R806.5.

2. The house shall attain a blower door test result < 2.5ACH 50.

3. The house shall require a whole house mechanical ventilation system that
does not rely solely on a negative pressure strategy (must be positive, balanced or
hybrid).

4. Where insulation is instalied below the roof deck and the exposed portion’
of roof rafters are not already covered by the R-20 depth of the air-impermeable
insulation, the exposed portion of the roof rafters shall be wrapped (covered) by
minimum R-3 unless directly covered by drywall/finished ceiling. Roof rafters are
not required to be covered by minimum R-3 if a continuous insulation is instalied
above the roof deck.

5. Indoor heating, cooling and ventilation equipment (including ductwork)
shall be inside the building thermal envelope.”

(13) In IRC, section N1102.2.9.1 (R402.2.9.1) the numeral (i) is added before the words “cut at
a 45-degree” and the following is added after the words “exterior wall”: “, or (i} lowered
from top of slab 4" when a 4” thermal break material such as, but not limited to, felt or
asphait impregnated fiber board, with a minimum thickness of 4" is installed at the upper
4" of slab.”

(14) In IRC, Section N1102.4.1 (R402.4.1), in the first sentence, the word "and"” is deleted and
replaced with the word "or".

(15) In IRC, Section N1102.4.1.1 (R402.4.1.1), the second and last sentences are deleted and
replaced with the following: "Where required by the code official, the builder shall certify
compliance with criteria indicated in Table 1102.4.1 for items which are not readily visible
during regularly scheduled inspections."

(16) In IRC, Table N1102.4.1.1 (R402.4.1.1) in the column titled COMPONENT, the following
changes are made:
(a)In the row "Rim Joists” the word “exterior” in the first sentence is deleted, and the second
sentence is deleted.
{b)In the row “Electrical/phone box on the exterior walls” the last sentence is deleted and
replaced with: “Alternatively, close cell foam, caulking or gaskets may be used, or
airsealed boxes may be installed.”

(17) In IRC, section N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2} the following changes are made:

(a)In the fourth sentence, the word “third” is deleted;

(b)The following sentence is added after the fourth sentence: “The following parties shall be
approved to conduct testing: Parties certified by BPI or RESNET, or licensed contractors
who have completed training provided by Blower Door Test equipment manufacturers or
other comparable training.”

(c)In the first Exception the second sentence is deleted.

(18) In IRC, Section N1102.4.1.3 (R402.4.1.3) the following changes are made:

Page 1



Utah Code

{(a)In the first sentence, the words “5.0 air changes per hour in Climate Zones 0, 1 and 2, and
3.0" are deleted and replaced with “4.0.”, and the words “in Climate Zone 3 through 8” are
deleted.

(b)In the first sentence of the Exception, “0.28" is replaced with “5.0 air changes per hour or
0.30” ‘

(c)in Number 2 the words “of conditioned floor area” are inserted before the words “or
smaller”.

(19) In IRC, Section N1102.4.6 (R402.8) is deleted.

(20) In IRC, Section N1103.3.1 (R403.3.1) is deleted and replaced with the following: “Ducts
located outside conditioned space. Supply and return ducts in attics shall be insulated
to a minimum of R-8 where 3 inches (76.2 mm) in diameter and greater and R-6 where
less

than 3 inches (76.2 mm) in diameter. Supply and return ducts in other portions of the
building shall be insulated to a minimum of R-6 where 3 inches (76.2 mm) in diameter or
greater and R-4.2 where less than 3 inches (76.2 mm) in diameter.
Exception: Ducts or portions thereof located completely inside the building thermal
envelope.”

(21) In IRC, Section N1103.3.3 (R403.3.3) is deleted.

(22) In IRC, Section N1103.3.3.1 (R403.3.3.1) is deleted.
(23)

(24) In IRC, Section N1103.3.5 (R403.3.5) the following changes are made:

(a)In the first sentence of the second Exception, the words following “required” are replaced
with “for any system designed such that no air handlers or ducts are focated within
unconditioned attics”.

{b)And the following is added at the end of the Section:

“The following parties shall be approved to conduct testing:

1. Patties cerdified by BPI or RESNET.
> L | hol leted traini ided by Duct T

equipment manufacturers or other comparable fraining.”

(25) In IRC, Section N1103.3.6 (R403.3.6):

(a) in Subsection 1, the number 4.0 is changed to 6.0, the number 113.3 is changed to 170, the
number 3.0 is changed to 5.0, the number 85 is changed to 141; and

(b) in Subsection 2: the number 4.0 is changed to 5.0 and the number 113.3 is changed to 141,
(c) Subsection 3 is deleted.

(26) In IRC, section N1103.3.7 (R403.3.7) the words “or plenums” are deleted.

(27} In IRC, section N1103.5.1.1 (R403.5.1.1) the words “Where installed,” are added at the
beginning of the first sentence.

(28) In IRC, section N1103.5.2 (R403.5.2) (a)Subsections 5 and 6 are deleted,

Page 1



Utah Code

(b)Subsection number 7 is renumbered to 5.

(29) IRC, Section N1103.6.2 (R403.6.2), is deleted and replaced with the following: "N1103.6.2
(R403.6.2) Whole-house mechanical ventilation system fan efficacy. Fans used to provide
whole-house mechanical ventilation shall meet the efficacy requirements of Table
N1103.6.2 (R403.6.2).

Exception: Where an air handler that is integral to tested and listed HVAC equipment is used
to provide whole-house mechanical ventilation, the air handler shall be powered by an
electronically commutated motor."

(30) In IRC, Section N1103.6.2 (R403.6.2), TABLE N1103.6.2 (R403.6.2) is deleted and
replaced with the following:
"TABLE N1103.6.2 (R403.6.2)
WHOLE DWELLING MECHANICAL VENTILATION SYSTEM FAN EFFICACY

FAN LOCATION AIR FLOW RATE MINIMUM AIR FLOW RATE
MINIMUM (CFM) EFFICACY MAXIMUM (CFM)
(CFM/WATT)

HRYV or ERV Any 1.2 cfm/watt Any

Range hoods Any 2.8 cfm/watt Any

In-line fan | Any 2.8 cfm/watt Any

Bathroom, utility 10 1.4 cfm/watt <90
room

Bathroom, utility 90 2.8 cfimiwatt Any"
room

(31) In IRC, Section N1103.6.3 (R403.6.3) is deleted:

(32) In IRC, Section N1103.7 the word "approved" is deleted in the first sentence and the
- following is added after the word methodologies ", complying with N1103.7.1 (R403.7.1)".

(33) In IRC, a new Section N1103.7.1 (R403.7.1) is added as follows:

"N1103.7.1(R403.7.1) Qualifications. An individual performing load calculations shall be
qualified by completing HVAC training from one of the following:

1. HVAC load calculation education from ACCA,;

2. Arecognized educational institution;

3. HVAC equipment manufacturer's training; or

4. Other recognized industry certification.”

(34) In IRC, Section N1104.1 (R404.1), The word “Al{” is replaced with “Not less than 20
percent of the lamps in".

(35) In IRC, Section N1104.1.1 (R404.1.1) is deleted.

Page 1



Utah Code

(36) In IRC, section N1104.2 (R404.2) is deleted:
(37} In IRC, Section N1104.3 (R404.3) is deleted:

(38) In IRC, section N1135.2 (R405.2) the following changes are made:
(a)In Subsection 3 the words “approved by the code official” are deleted, and
(b)In Subsection3 the following words are added at the end of the sentence: “when
applicable and readily available”.

(39) In IRC, Section N1106.3 (R406.3) Building thermal envelope is deleted, and replaced with
“Building thermal envelope and on-site renewables. The proposed total building thermal
envelope UA, which is the sum of U-factor times assembly area, shall be less than or
equal to the building thermal envelope UA using the prescriptive U-factors from Table
N1102.1.2 multiplied by 1.15 in accordance with Equation 11-4. The area-weighted
maximum fenestration SHGC permitted in Climate Zones 0 through 3 shall be 0.30.

UAProposed design — 115 X UAPrescriptive reference design
(Equation 11-4}
{40) In IRC, Section N1106.3.1 (R406.3.1) is deleted:
{(41) In IRC, section N1106.3.2 (R403.3.2) is deleted:

(42) In IRC, Section N1106.4 (R406.4) the following changes are made:

(a)In the first sentence, the words “in accordance with Equation 11-5” are deleted and
replaced with: “permitted to be calculated using the minimum total air exchange rate for
the rated home (Qtot) and for the index adjustment factor in accordance with Equation
11.5.7,

(b)In equation 11-5, the words “Ventilation rate, CFM" are deleted and replaced with: “Qtot”, .
and

{c)In the last sentence the number “5” is deleted and replaced with “15”.

(43) In IRC N1106.5, in the column titled “ENERGY RATING INDEX” of Table R406.5, the
following changes are made:
(a)ln the row for Climate Zone 3, “51” is deleted and replaced with 65
(b)In the row for Climate Zone 5, “55” is deleted and replaced with 69
(c)In the row for Climate Zone 6 “54” is deleted and replaced with 68

(44) In IRC, Section N1108 (R408) is deleted

(45) In IRC, Section M1307.2, the words "In Seismic Design Categories DO, D1, and D2, and
in townhouses in Seismic Design Category C", are deleted, and in Subparagraph 1, the
last sentence is deleted.

(46) In IRC, Section M1401.3 the word "approved" is deleted in the first sentence and the
following is added after the word methodologies ", complying with M1401.3.1".

(47) A new IRC, Section M1401.3.1, is added as follows: "M1401.3.1 Qualifications. An
individual performing load calculations shall be qualified by completing HVAC training
from one of the following:

1. HVAC load calculation education from ACCA;

Page 1



Utah Cede

2. Arecognized educational institution;
3. HVAC equipment manufacturer's training; or
4. Other recognized industry certification.”

(48) In IRC, Section M1402.1, the following is added at the end of the second sentence: "or
UL/ CSA60335-2-40." ,

(49) In IRC, Section M1403.1, the characters "/ANCE" are deleted.
(50) In IRC, Section M1411.9, is deleted.

(51) In IRC, Section M1412.1, the characters "/ANCE" are deleted.
(52) In IRC, Section M1413.1, the characters "/ANCE" are deleted.

Amended by Chapter 209, 2023 General Session

Page 1



Added text
(Deleted iext)

15A Chapter 1T (No changes recommended)
15A-2-101, 102 (No changes recommended)

Chapter 2
15A-2-103 Specific editions adopted of construction code of a nationally recognized code
authority.

(1) Subject to the other provisions of this part, the following construction codes are
incorporated by reference, and together with the amendments specified in Chapter 3,
Statewide Amendments Incorporated as Part of State Construction Code, and Chapter 4,
Local Amendments Incorporated as Part of State Construction Code, are the construction
standards to be applied to building construction, alteration, remodeling. and repair, and in
the regulation of building construction, alteration, remodeling, and repair in the state:

{(a) the 2021 edition of the International Building Code, including Appendices C and J,
issued by the International Code Council;

(b} [execeptasprovidedin-Subsection-(Iek) the 2021 edition of the International
Residential Code, issued by the International Code Council

He)-the-residentinl-provisions-of ChapterHr-Enerpyv-EHicieney-of the 201 5-editionolthe

lnternational-Residential-Code—issued-by-the-Internatienat-Code-Couneil:

fy-therestdential provisions-ofthe 201 5-editionet-the International-Erergy-Conservation

Codeissued-byv-the-lnternational- Ceode-Louneils]

(remaining sections are renumbered accordingly)

Chapter 3
15A-3-102 Amendments to Chapters 1 through 3 of IBC

(1Y In IBC, Section 304.1. add the words “and technical colleges who also educate.
high school students as part of their student body.” after the words “Educational
gccupancies for students above the 12th erade including higher education laboratories.”

(Remaining sections are renumbered.)

15A-3-105 Amendments to Chapter 10 through 12 of IBC.
(1) In1BC, Section 1010.2.4, number (2), the following is added at the end of the
sentence: “Blended assisted living facilities shall comply with Section 1010.2.14.1.”

{2) A new IBC Section 1010.2.14.1 is added as follows: 1010.2.14.1 Blended assisted
living facilities. In occupancy Group I-1, Condition 2 or Group 1-2. a Type-Il assisted
living facility licensed by the Department of Health and Human Services for residents




with Alzheimer's or dementia, and having a controlled egress locking system to

prevent operation from the egress side shall be permitied to also house residents

without a clinicai need for their containment where all of the following provisions are

met:

1. Locks in the means of egress comply with all IBC reguirements for controlled egress
doors

2. All residents without a clinical need for their containment shall have the keys, codes
or other means necessary to operate the locking systems.

3. Residents or their [egal representative acknowledge in writing that they understand
and agree to living in a facility where egress is controlied.

4. The number of residents housed in a smoke compartment with conirolled egress
shall not be greater than 30.

(remaining scctions are renumbered as needed)

15A-3-113. Amendments to Chapters 32 through 35 of IBC.

(3) In IBC Chapter 35 under 1CC, “ICC A117.1-17: Accessible and Usable Buildings
and Facilities” is deleted and replaced with “ICC A117.1-09: Accessible and Usable Buildings

15A-3-202 Amendments to Chapters 1 through 5 of IRC.
(3) InIRC Section R105.2, [nwmber H-is-deletedt-under Building, the following changes are
made:
1. Number 3 is deleted and replaced with the following: “3. Retaining walls retaining
less than 4 feet (1219mm) of unbalanced fill, unless supporting a surcharge or requiring
design per Section R404 .4,
2. Number 10 is deleted and replaced with the following: 10. “Decks that are not more
than 30 inches (762mm) above grade at any point and not requiring guardrails, that do
not serve exit door required by Section R311.4.”

{5y HRG-Seetion-109 1 S5ris-deleted-and-replaced-with-the fellowing - "RI09 15 Weather-
resistant-extertor-watl-envelope-inspeetions.—An-inspectionshall-be-made-of-the weather-
resistant-exteriorwall-envelope-asrequired-by-Seetion-R703L-and-Hashinps-as-requived
by-Section R703-4-to-preventwalerFrom-entenna-the-weatherresistve barer]

(5) IRC Section R109.1.5. is deiected and replaced with the following:

“R109.1.5 Other inspections. In addition to the inspections listed in R109.1.1 through
R109.1.4, the building official shall have the authority 1o inspect the proper installation of
insulation.

(6YR109.1.5.1 Weather-resistant exterior wall envelope inspections. An inspection shall be
made of the weather-resistant exterior wall envelope as required by Section R703.1 and
flashings as required by Section [R703.8] R703.4 to prevent water from entering the weather-
resistive barrier,

(7¥R109.1.5.2 Fire-resistance-rated construction inspection. Where fire-resistance-rated

2



construction is required between dwelling units or due to location on property, the building
official shall require an inspection of such construction after lathing or gypsum board or
oypsum panel products are in place, but before any plaster is applied. or before board or
panel joints and fasteners are taped and finished.

(Remaining sections are renumbered)

233€26) In IRC, Section R310.7, [in-the-exception] the words "or accessory dwelling units" are
added after the words "sleeping rooms".

29 (30)n IRC, Section R314.2.2, the words "[e#] “, accessory dwelling units” are added after

N

the words ["sleepinprooms”| “Where alterations, repairs”.

2831 In TRC, Section R315.2.2, the words [es} “, accessory dwelling units”, are added after
the words [sleepingroomst “Where alterations, repairs”.

15A-3-203 Amendments to Chapters 6 through 15 of IRC.

(1) IRC, Section R609.4.1, is deleted.

() In IRC, Section N1101.4 (R102.1.1), a new section N1101.4.1 (R102.1.1) is added as

follows:

N1101.4.1 National Green Building Standard. Buildings complying with ICC 700-2020
National Green Building Standard and achieving the Gold rating level for the energy
efficiency category shall be deemed to exceed the energyv efficiency reguired by this
code. The building shall also meet the requirements identified in table N1105.2 and the
building thermal envelope efficiency is greater than or equal to levels of efficiency and
solar heat gain coefficients (SHGC) in Tables N1102.2.2 andN1102,1.3 of

the 2009 IRC.

{2(3)In IRC, Section N1101.5 (R103.2), all words after the words "herein governed." are
deleted and replaced with the following: "Construction documents include all
documentation required for building permits shall include only those items specified in
10-5-132(8) of the Utah Municipal Code. [te-be-submitted-in-order-to-issue-a building
perpxit]”

(4) InIRC, Section N1101.10.3 {R303.1.3) the following changes are made:
(a) The following is added at the end of the {irst sentence “or EN 14351-1:2006 +
A1:2010.7
(b) The word “accredited” is replaced with “approved” in the third sentence.
(c) The following sentence is added after the third sentence: “A conversion factor of
5.678 shall be used to convert from U values expressed in SI units: ()/53678="

(d) After “NFRC 200 the following words are added: “or EN 14351-1:2006 + A1:2010”,
and in the sentence the word “accredited’ is replaced with the word “approved”.
{e)_The following new sentence shall be inserted immediately prior to the last sentence:

“Total Energy Transmittance values may be substituted for SHGC. and Luminous
Transmission values may be substituted for VI™.

3



6335 In IRC, Section N1101.12 (R303.3), all wording after the first sentence is deleted.
(43(6) In IRC, Section N1101.13 (R401.2), in the first sentence. the words “Section N1101.13.5
and™ are deleted, [add-Exeception-astolovs:
12 Exeeption-A-projectcomphies-if the project-demensirates-comphianee-using-the
software-RES-Cheeke2012-Utah Enerpy-Conservation-Coder-of:

{ayon-erafter-January 12017 and before-danuary 1520193 percent-better-than-code™
hy-en-or-alter-January-152010-and-belore January-1-2024-—"4-percent-betterthan-eode™:
el

(e)-afterJanvary1 202 - 5-percent-betterthan-code |~
(7) InIRC, Section N1101.13.5 (R401.,2.5) is deleted.
(8) In IRC, Section N1101.14 (R401.3) Number 7, the words “and the compliance path used”
are deleted,
(9) InIRC, Table N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2)
{a} in the column titled Fenestration U-Factor the following changes are made:
(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 3” delete 0.30 and replace it with (1,32
(i1) In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 and Marine 47" delete 0.30 and replace it with
0.32
(iii)_In the row titled "Climate Zone 6 delete 0.30 and replace it with 0.32
(b) in the column titled Glazed Fenestration SHGC, the following changes are made:
(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 37 delete 0.25 and replace il with 4.35
(¢) in the column titled “Climate U-Factor the {ollowing changes arg made:
(1) In the row titled “Climate Zone 37 delete 0.026 and replace it with 0.033
(i1)_In the row titled "Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4” delete 0.024 and replace it with
0.030
(i) In the row titled "Climate Zone 6 delete 0.024 and replace it with 0.030
(d) in the column titled "Wood Frame Wall U Factor”, the following changes are made:
(i} In the row titled “Climate Zone 3" delete 0.060 and replace it with 0.065
(it} In the row titled "Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4” delete0.045 and replace it with 0.065
(il In the row titled "Climate Zone 6” delete 0,045 and replace it with 0.065
{e) in the column titled "Basement wall U-Factor” the following changes are made:
(i} Inthe row titled “Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4 delete 0.050 and replace it with 0.075
{ii} In the row titled * Climate Zone 6” delete 0.5 and replace it with0.G65
{f) In the column titled "Crawl Space Wall U-Factor” the following changes are made:
{i) Inthe row ttled “Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4 delete 0.055 and replace it with 0.078
{ii)_In the row titled “ Climate Zone 6” delete 0.55 and replace it with 0.065
(10 In IRC, Table N1102.1.3(R402.1.3) , the following changes are made”

,,,,,

added and at the bottom of the fooinotes the following footnote “i” is added,
“i In climate zone 3 and 5. an R-15. and in climate zone 6, an R-20 shall be
accepiable where air-impermeable insulation is installed in the cavity space,”
(i) add a new footnote “k™ as follows:
“k. Log walls complying with ICC400 and with a minimum average wall thickness of 5
inches or greater shall be permitted in Zones 5 through 8 when overall window




glazing has 0.30 U -factor or lower. minimum heating equipment efficiency is for
gas 95 AFULE Lor for oil, 84 AFUE. and all other components requirements are
(11) In IRC, Table N1102.1.3 (R402.1.3) the following changes are made:
(a)_In the column titled Fenestration U-Factor the following changes are made:
(1) In the row titled “Climate Zone 3" delete 0.30 and replace it with 0.32
(i) In the row titled "Climate Zone 35 and Marine 47 delete 0.30 and replace 1t with
0.32
(iii) In the row titled "Climate Zone 6” delete 0.30 and replace it with 0.32
(b) In the column titled Glazed Fenestration SHGC the following changes are made:
{i) Inthe row titled "Climate Zone 3" deleted 0.25 and replace it with 0.35
(c} In the Column R-Value the followine changes are made:
{i} In the row titled "Climate Zone 3" delete 49 and replace it with 32
{ii}_in the row titled "Climatie Zone 5 and Marine 4” delete 60 and replace it with 38
{iii} In the row titled "Climate Zone 6” delete 60 and replace it with 38
(d) In the Column titled Wood Frame Wall R-Value the following changes are made:
(i} Inthe row titled “Climate Zone 3” delete all values and replace with “19+ Oci or 11
+5¢i or 0 +15ci”
(i} In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 or Marine 4” delete all values and replace with
“19+ Ocior 13 + 5¢i or 0 +15c¢i”
(iii)_In the row titled “ Climate Zone 6" delete all values and replace with “19 + Oci or
13 4+ 5cior O+ 15¢t”
(e} In the column titled “Basement Wall R Value” the following changes are made:

(i) in the row ttled “Climate Zone 5 or Marine 4” delete all values and replace
with “15+ Oci or 0+ 11ci or 11 +5¢i”
(i) In the row titled “ Climate Zone 6” delete all values and replace with "19 +

QOcior 0+ 13cior 11 +5¢i”
{f) In the column titled “Slab R Value and Depth” the following changes are made:

(i) In the row titled "Climate Zone 3” delete “10ci. 2ft” and replace it with NR”
(ii) In the row titled "Climate Zone 5 & Marine 4” delete “4 ft” and replace it
with “2 ft”

{g) In the column titled "Crawl Space Wall R-Value” the following changes are made:
{i} inthe row titled “Climate Zone 5 or Marine 4” delete all values and replace with
“15+ Ocior 0+ 11ci or 11 +5¢i”
(i) In the row titled “ Climate Zone &” delete all values and replace with “19 + Oci or
O+13cior0+1i1+5¢d”
{12) In IRC, a new subsection N1102.1.5.1 (R402.1.5.1) 1s added as follows:
1102.1.5.1 (R402.1.5.1) RESCheck 2012 Utah Energy Conservation Code. Compliance
with section N1102.1.5 (R402.1.5) mav be safisfied using the software RESCheck 2012 Utah
Enercy Conservation Code. which shall satisfv the R-value and U-factor requiremeitts of
N1102.1, N1102.2. and N1102.3, provided the following conditions are met:
{(a) In Climate Zone 5 and 6 the software result shall show “5% better than code”, and

5



(b) In Climate Zone 3, the software result shall show “5% better than code” when
software inputs for window U-facter = (.65 and window SHGC = (.40,
notwithstanding actual windows installed shall conform 1o requirements of Tables
N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2) and N1102.1.3 {(R402.1.3).

6){13) In IRC, Sections N1102.2.1 (R402.2.1), a new Section N1102.2.1.1 is added as follows:
"N1102.2.1.1. Unvented attic and unvented enclosed rafter assemblies. Unvented attic and
unvented enclosed rafter assemblies conforming to Section R806.5 [shall-be} provided with
an R-value of R-22 (maximum U-Factor of 0.045) in Climate Zone 3-B or an R-value of R-
26 (maximum U-factor of 0.038) in Climate Zones 5-B and 6-B shall be permitied provided
all the following conditions are met:

1. The unvented attic assembly complies with the requirements of the International
Residential Code, R806.5.

2. The house shall attain a blower door test result <2 5ACH (50).

3. The house shall require a whole house mechanical ventilation system that does not rely
solely on a negative pressure strategy (must be positive, balanced or hybrid).

4. Where insulation is installed below the roof deck and the exposed portion of roof rafters
are not already covered by the R-20 depth of the air-impermeable insulation, the exposed
portion of the roof rafters shall be wrapped (covered) by minimum R-3 unless directly
covered by drywall/finished ceiling. Roof rafters are not required to be covered by
minimum R-3 if a continuous insulation is installed above the roof deck.

5. Indoor heating, cooling and ventilation equipment (including ductwork) shall be inside the
building thermal envelope.”

{14} A new IRC, Section N1102.2.1.3(R402.2.1.3) is added as follows:

N1102.2.13(R402.2.1.3) Walls with Air-Impermeable Insulation. Where IECC Table
R402.1.2 or IRC Table N1102.1.2 requires R-20 for wood framed walls in climate zones 3-
B and 5-B or R-20+5C] for climate zone 6-B, an air-impermeable insulation installed in the
wall cavity with R-value of R-15 for climate zones 3-B and 5-B or R-20 for climate zone 6-
B shall be deemed equivalent to the provisions in IECC Table R402.1.2 or IRC Table
N1102.1.2. provided the home attains a blower door test < 2.5ACH.

(15) InIRC, Section N1102.2.9.1 (R402.2.9.1) the numeral (1) is added before the words “cut at

a 45 degree” and the following is added after the words “exterior wall”: . or

(i) lowered from top of slab 4 when a 4” thermal break material such as, but not limited
10, felt or asphalt impregnated fiber board. with a minimum thickness of %4 is installed
at the upper 4” of slab.”

116} InIRC, Section N1102.4.1 (R402.4.1), in the first sentence, the word "and" is deleted and
replaced with the word "or."

8117 In IRC, Section N1102.4.1.1 (R402.4.1.1), the second and the last sentence [is} are deleted
and replaced with the following: "Where [altewed] required by the code official, the builder
[may] shall certify compliance [te-compenents] with criteria indicated in Table N1102.4.1
(R402.4.1) for items which [may} are not [be-inspeetedd readily visible during regularly
scheduled inspections.”

{(18) In IRC. Table N1102.4.1.1 (R402.4.1.1) in the column titled "COMPONENT™. the

6



following changes are made:

(a} In the row “Rim Joists” the word “exterior” in the first sentence is deleted. and the
second sentence is deleted.

(b) In the row “Electrical/phone box on the exterior walls” the last sentence is deleted and
replaced with: “Alternatively, close cell foam, caulking or gaskets may be used. or air
sealed boxes may be installed.

19)(19) In IRC, Section N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2), the following changes are made:
(2) In the [Hrst] fourth sentence:. the word “third” is deleted.
" The-buitding-or-dwellingunit-is-deleted-and replaced-vath-“A-sinplefamily

{i}-afterJanuery—1-2019 replace-the-word-"Hvewith-'3-5"—and
Li-the-vords-Yin Climate-Lones-Hand Land-three-nir-changes-per-houwr-in-Glimate Lones
3-through-8"are-deleted—]

(b) The following sentence is [inserted-afterthe-firstsentence—Acmulti-family-dwelling
and-tevwnhouse-shall be tested-and-verified-as-hoving-an-air-leakagerate-ofnet
exeecding-five air changes-per-hourInthe-third-sentencerthe-word "third "5 deteted|
added after the fourth sentence:
Thefolowing sentenee-is-inserted-atterthe-third-senteneces] "The following parties
shall be approved to conduct testing: Parties certified by BPI or RESNET, or licensed
contractors who have completed training provided by Blower Door Test equipment
manufacturers or other comparable training."
{¢) In the first Exception the second sentence is deleted.
(20) Tn IRC, Section N1102.4.1.3 (R402.4.1.3) the following changes are made:
(2) In the first sentence, the words “5.0 air changes per hour in Climate Zones (0, 1
and 2, and 3.0 are deleted and replaced with “*4.0.”, and the words “in Climate
Zone 3 through 8" are deleted.

(b) In the first sentence of the Ixception, “0.28” is replaced with “*5.0 air changes per
hour or 0.30”

(¢) In Number 2 the words “of conditioned floor area” are inserted before the words
“or smaller”.

(21) IRC, Section N1102.4.6 (R402.6) 1s deleted.

(22) In IRC, Section N1103.3.1 (R403.3.1) is deleted and replaced with the following:
“Ducts loeated cutside conditioned space. Supplv and return ducts in aitics shall be
insulated to a minimum of R-8 where 3 inches (76.2 mm) in diameter and greater
and R-6 where less than 3 inches (76.2 mm) in diameter. Supply and return ducts in
other portions of the building shall be insulated to a minimum of R-6 where 3 inches
(76.2 mm) in diameter or greater and R-4.2 where less than 3 inches (76.2 mm) in
diameter.

Exeeption: Ducts or portions thereof located completely inside the building thermal
envelope.”

£30)(23) #= IRC, Section N1103.3.3 (R403.3.3), [the-exceptiontor-duet-air-leakape-testing-is

deleted and replaced-with-the-follewine] is deleted.




fa)-ton-or-alter January 1. 2017, and before January-1, 2019, with the-following:
Mixeeptions-he-duetatr-leakagetestisnotreguireddor-systems-with-all-ate-handlers
and-atleast-6 3% -ofall-dusts-bneaswred-byv-lenpth)-located-entirehewithinthe building
thermal-envelope™:

{b) on-er-after-tanuvaryI- 209 and-beforeJanvary—202 b-with-the-fellowing:
Tixecepton—The-ductairleakagetestisnotreqguireddor systemswith-at-air-handlers
andatleast 5% ol al-ducts-tmessured-by-lenpthH-located-entirebwithinthe buildme
themmal-enveloperand

(¢)-on-orafter-Janvary1- 202 —vdth-the following " Exception-Fhe-duet-atr-leakace-test-is
netrequiredforsystems-with-alair-hondlers-and-at-least 0% of all duets fmeasured by

leapti-ecated-emtire—vathinthe buldimpthermal-envelope
{adin IRC Seetion-PAHE53-3-L403:5 3 - thefoHowinp—is added-adter-the-second-oxeeption:
“Fhe feHowingparties-shali-be-appreved-to-conduet-testing:-Lartics-certified - by-BP-or

RESMNET ~or-Heensed-contractorsnheo-havecompleted-either-reining-provided-by-Buoet-Test
cauipmentmantretrers-orother-comparable-tratnmp—

(24) IRC Section N1103,3.3.1 (R403.3.3,1) is deleted.

HED - HCrSeetion-hIH033- 440334

far—in-Subsectiont—the-rumber4-is-chenged-to-dthe number H33-is-chanpedte 170 the
pusrber3-is-changed-to-6thenumber35-is-chanped-teti4d-6-and
(HronorafterJannar 2017 and before-Jamary 1 2019 the number-4-is
chanped-to-8-and-the- number-113-3-is-chansed-to-2:26:5;
{B-enrorafierdantary- 2010 and-beforeJantan 202 —the-numberd-ts-chanved-te-F
and-thenuwmber33as-chanped-te-1982-and

{onerafterdonuart- 202 the sumber-d-is-changed-to-6-and-the-mumber H-3-3-is

{23)(25) In IRC, Section N1103.3.5 (R403.3.5), the [words"orplenums"are-deleted] the
following changes are made:

{(2) A second Exception is added as follows: “A duct leakage test shall not be

required for anv svstem designed such that no air handlers or ducts are located
within unconditioned attics.”

{b) The following is added at the end of the section: “The following parties shall be
approved to conduct testing:

1. Parties certified by BPT or RESNET

2. Licensed contractors who have completed training provided by Duct Test
equipment manufacturers or other comparable training.”

(26) In IRC. Section N1103.3.6 (R403.3.6) the followine changes are made:
{a) in Subseciion I

(1) _the number 4.0 is changed to 6.0,
(i1) the number 113.3 is chanved to 170
(ii1) the number 3.0 is changed to 5.0,
(iv)_the number 85 js changed to 141

8



(b} in Subsection 2,
(1) the number 4.0 is changed 10 5.0
(i1) the number113.3 is chanped to 141
(¢} Subsection 3 is deleted,
(27) In IRC, Section N1103.3.7 (R403.3.7) the words “or plenums” are deleted.
(28) InIRC, Section N1103.5.1.1 (R403.5.1.1) the words “Where installed” are added at the
beginning of the first sentence.
(29) InIRC, Section N1103.5.2 (R403.5.2) the following change is made:
(a) Subsections 5 and 6 are deleted and Subsections number 7 is renumbered to 5.
4 I RESection NA03:53-(R403-5:3)-Subsection-S4s-deleted-and-Subseetions-6-and-7
£25)(30) IRC, Section [N1103:6:1-(R403:6-131 N1103.6.2 (R403.6.2), is deleted and replaced
with the following:
"INHE3:6-R403-6-131 N1103.6.2 (R403.6.2) Whole-house mechanical ventilation
system fan efficacy. Fans used to provide whole-house mechanical ventilation shall meet
the efficacy requirements of Table [N1103.6.1 (R403.6.1)1 N1103.6.2 (R403.6.2).
Exception: Where an air handler that is integral to tested and listed HVAC equipment is
used to provide whole-house mechanical ventilation, the air handler shall be powered by
an electronically commutated motor."
{46)(31) In IRC, Section [NHO3-6-1-{RA403:6-13{N1103.6.2 (R403.6.2), the table is deleted
and replaced with the following:
"TABLE [MNAH36-1-R403.6-13EN1103.6.2 (R403.6.2)

MECHANICAL VENTILATION SYSTEM FAN EFFICACY

FAN LOCATION AIR FLOW RATE MINIMUM AIR FLOW RATE
MINIMUM (CFM) EFFICACY MAXIMUM (CFM)
(CFM/WATT)
HRYV or ERV Any 1.2 cfm/watt Any
Range hoods Any 2.8 cfm/watt Any
In-line fan Any 2.8 cfim/watt Any
Bathroom, utility room 10 1.4 cfim/watt <90
Bathroom, utility room 90 2.8 cfm/watt Any"

(323 IRC, Section N1103.6.3 (R403.6.3) is deleted.
AR e -Section NLLHO6:4-{R406-4)the-tablets-deleted-and-replaced-with-the following:
MTABLE N1106.4 (R406:4)

MAXIMUNMIDNERGY-RAFING INDEX



CEAMATE ZONE ENERGY-RAHNG-INDEX
3 65
5 &9
6 6844

{28)(33) In IRC, Section N1103.7(R403.7) the word "approved” is deleted in the first sentence
and the following is added after the word methodologies ", complying with N1103.7.1
(R403.7.1H".

£9)(34) A new IRC, Section N1103.7.1(R403.7.1) is added as follows: "N1103.7.1

Qualifications. An individual performing load calculations shall be qualified by completing

HVAC training from one of the following:

1. HVAC load calculation education from ACCA;
2. Arecognized educational institution;

3. HVAC equipment manufacturer's training; or
4. Other recognized industry certification.”

L2M-TnIRC, Section-M13072 the-words-n-Seismie Destgn-Categories- D0 and Dland
Intewnhousesin-Seismic Design-Catepory £ are-deleted,-and-in-Subparapraph-trthe dast
sentencets-deleted]

(35) InIRC, Section N1104.1 (R404.1), the word “All” is replaced with “Not less than 90
percent of the famps in”.

(36) IRC, Section N1104.1.1 (R404.1.1) is deleted.

(37)_IRC, Section N1104.2 (R404.2) is deleted.

(38) IRC, Section N1104.3 (R404.3) is delcted.

(39) InIRC, section N1105.2 (R405.2) the following changes are made:

(a) In Subsection 3 the words “approved by the code official” are deleted. and
(b) In Subsection3 the following words are added at the end of the sentence; “when
applicable and readily available”.

(40) In IRC. Section N1106.3 (R406.3) Building thermal envelope is deleted, and replaced
with “Building thermal envelope and on-site renewables. The proposed total building
thermal envelope UA. which is the sum of U-factor times assembly area, shall be less
than or equal to the building thermal envelope UA using the prescriptive U-factors
from Table N1102.1.2 multiplied by 1.15 in accordance with Equation 11-4. The arca-
weighted maximum fenestration SHGC permitted in Climate Zones 0 through 3 shall
be 0.30.

UAProposed design = 1.15 x UAPrescriptive reference design
(Eguation 11-4)

(41) In IRC, Section N1106.3.1 (R406.3.1) is deleted:
(42) InIRC, section N1106.3.2 (R403.3.2) is deleted:
(43} InIRC, Section N1106.4 (R406.4) the following changes are made:
(a) In the first sentence, the words “in accordance with Equation 11-5" are deleted and
replaced with: “permitted to be calculated using the minimuim total air exchange
rate for the rated home (Qtot) and for the index adiustment factor in accordance

10



with Equation 11.5.”,
(b) In equation 11-5. the words “Ventilation rate, CFM” are deleted and replaced with:
“Qtot”, and
{c) In the last sentence the number “5” is deleted and replaced with ©“15™.
(44) In IRC N1106.3, in the column titled “ENERGY RATING INDEX?” of Table
R406.5, the following changes are made:
{)In the row for Climate Zone 3. “517 1s deleted and replaced with 63
{b)n the row for Climate Zone 5, “55” 15 deleted and replaced with 69
{c)in the row for Climate Zone 6 “54” is deleted and replaced with 68
(45) InIRC, Section N1108 (R408) is deleted

(remaining sections are renumbered as necded)
15A-3-206 Amendments to Chapters 36, 37, 39 and 44 and Appendix F of IRC.
(21) Anew IRC, Chapter 44, the standard for ANSI/RESNET/ICC 201-2019 section 4.4.4 is
added follows: 4.4.4. Air Source Heat Pumps and Air Conditioners.
For Heat Pumps and Air Conditioners with the more recent Manufacturer’s Equipment
Performance Ratines (HSPI2 or SELER2)Y available, and HSPIF and SEER are not available
these ratings shall be converted o HSPF and SEER values by dividing HSPTF2 or SEER2 by
The conversion {actors in Table 4.4.4.1(1). If the tvpe of equipment is not determined. the
conversion shall defauli to the “Ducted Split System” factors. Al calculations, including
Eguation 4.1-1a shall use HSPFF or SEIER values as made available by the Manufacturer or
converted as specified in this section,

Table 4.4.4.1(1) SEER2 and HSPF2 Conversion Factors3

Eguipment Type SEERZ/SEER | HSPFZ/HSPF
EER2/EER?

Ductless Systems 1.00 1.00 0.90

Ducted Sphit System 0.95 0.95 0.85

Ducted Packaged System 0.95 0.95 (.84

Small Duct High Velocity System 1.00 Not Appnlicable 0.85

Ducted Space-Constrained Ailr 0.97 Not Applicable Not Apnlicable

Conditioner

Ducted Space-Constrained Heat 0.99 Not Applicable 0.85

Pump

(Remaining sections are renumbered.)

15A-3-205 Amendments to Chapters 26 through 35 of IRC.
(11} In IRC, Section P2902.1, the following subsections are added as follows:
2902124 P2902.1.1 General Installation Citeria.

22902124 P2902.1.2 Specific Installation Criteria.
2290242 P2902.1.3 Reduced Pressure Principle Backflow Prevention Assembly.
[1229023-221 P2902.1.4 Double Check Valve

11



JR2902.12.31 P2902.1.5 Pressure Vacuum Break Assembly

15A-3-206 Amendments to Chapters 36, 37, 39, and 44 and Appendix F of IRC.
{1) In IRC, Section IF3401.2 the second sentence is modified by adding the words “townhouses,”
after the word “dwellings”™ and the word “their” before the word “accessory’” and the following is
added after “NFPA 707 “such as. but not limited to the following equipment:
Fixed outdoor electric deicing and snow-melting eguipment;
motors;
generators,
transformers:
phase converters;
stationary standby batteries;
elevators:
dumbwaiters:
platform lifts;
10. stairway chairlifts;
11. electric vehicle power transfer systems;
12, electric welders:
13. audio signal processing, amplification, and reproduction equipment;
14, information technology equipment;
15. solar photovoltaic (PV) systems;
16. optional standby systems:
17. interconnected electric power production sources;
18, energy storage systems: and
19. enerpy management systems.

(& [o0 [ & i [ 2 e |

(3) IRC, Section E3601.7 is deleted and replaced with the following: E3601.7 Maximum
number of disconnects. The service disconnecting means shall consist of not more than six
switches, or six sets of circuit breakers mounted in a single enclosure or in a group of separate
enclosures. This provision has a sunset date of 7-1-2027.”

(Remaining sections are renumbered.)

(17) InIRC. Section E3902.15 Craw] space lighting outlets is deleted.
(75 (18) IRC, Section E3902.16 Equipment requiring servicing is deleted.
18y (19) IRC Section E3902.17 Qutdoor outlets is deleted.
HEO-IRE-Seetion-E3002 1 8-s-deleted-]
{20) IRC Section £3902.19 Location of arc-fault circuit interrupters, is deleted.
{21} IRC Secton E3902.20 Arc-fault circuit interrupter protection is deleted.
{22) IRC Section E3902.21 Arc-fault circuit interrupter protection for branch circuit extensions
or modification is deleted.
(Remaining sections are renumbered.)

12



eyl iMErSeetion 1012, the words-24 7 1-0e-1995 -are-deleted-and-replaced -with
25514711995 ~op UACEA60335- 2407

{Remaining sections are renumbered)

15A-3-601 General provisions,

(N NEC Section 230.71, is deleted and replaced with the following: 230.7]1 Maximum Number
of Disconnects.

(A) General. The service disconnecting means for each service permitted by 230.2. or

for each set of service-entrance conductors permitted by 230.40, Exception No. 1, 3, 4,

or 5, shall consist of not more than six switches or sets of circuit breakers, or a

combinafion of not more than six switches and sets of circuit breakers, mounted in a

single enclosure, in a group of separate enclosures, or in or on a switchboard or in

switchgear, There shall be not more than six sets of disconnects per service grouped in

any one location.,

For the purpose of this section, disconnecting means installed as part of listed equipment and
used solelv for the following shall not be considered a service disconnecting means:

(1) Power monitoring equipment

(23 Surge-protective device (s)

(3) Control circuit of the ground-fault protection system

(4) Power-operable service disconnecting means

(B) Single-Pole Units. Two or three single-pole switches or breakers, capable of individual
operation, shall be permitted on multiwire circuits, one pole for each ungrounded conductor. as
one multipole disconnect, provided they are equipped with identified handle ties or a master
handle to disconnect all conductors of the service with no more than six operations of the hand
This provision has a sunset date of 7-1-2027..

(10) In NEC. Section 230.72. Section 230.72(A) 1s deleted and replaced with the {ollowing:
230.72 Grouping of Disconnects.

(A) General. The two to six disconnects as permitted in 230.71 shall be erouped. Each
disconnect shall be marked to indicate the load served.

Exception: One of the two to six service disconnecting means permitted in 230.71. where used
only for a water pump also intended to provide fire protection., shall be permitted to be located
remote from the other means. If remotely installed in accordance with this exception, a plaque
shall be posted at the location of the remaining grouped disconnects denoting its location. This
provision has a sunset date of 7-1-2027.

{Remaining sections are renumbered.)

15A-3-701 General provisions.
Part 7

Statewide Amendments to International Energy Conservation Code

13



15A-3-701 General provisions.
The following is adopted as an amendment to the IECC to be applicable statewide:

(1) IECC, Section C405.11, is deleted and replaced with the following: "C405.11 Automatic
receptacle control. Automatic receptacle control to be optional and decided by property
owner."

(2) In IECC, Section R102.1.1, a new section R102.1.1 is added as follows:

R102.1.1 National Green Building Standard complying with 1CC 700-2020

National Green Building Standard and achieving the Gold rating level for the energy

efficiency category shall be deemed to exceed the energy efficiency required by this

code. The building shall also meet the requirements identified in table N1105.2 and the

building thermal envelope efficiency is greater than or equal to levels of efficiency and

solar heat gain coefficients (SHGC) in Tables N1102.2.2 andN1102.1.3 of

the 2009 IRC.,

3(3) In IECC, Section R103.2, all words after the words "herein governed." are deleted and
replaced with the following: "Construction documents include all documentation required [to-be
submitted-in-order-to-issue a building-penmit] for building permits shall include only those items
specified in 10-5-132(8) of the Utah Municipal Code."
(4) In IECC, Section R303.1.3 the following changes are made.
(a) The following is added at the end of the first sentence “or EN 14351-1:2000 +
Al1:2010.”
(b) The word “accredited” is replaced with “approved”™ in the third sentence.
(¢) The following sentence is added after the third sentence: “A conversion factor of
5.678 shall be used to convert from U values expressed in ST units: ()/53678=."

(d) After “NFRC 200 the following words are added: “or EN 14351-1:2006 + A1:2010”,
and in the sentence the word “accredited’ is replaced with the word “approved”.

(e) The following new sentence shall be inserted immediately prior to the last sentence:
“Total Energy Transmittance values may b e substituted for SHGC, and Luminous
Transmission values may be substituted for VT7.

333) InTECC, Section R303.3, all wording after the first sentence is deleted.
“43(6)In IECC, Section R401.2, [a-nevwnumber4-is-added-as follows: in the first sentence, the
words “Section R401.13.5 and”™ are deleted.
14— Compliasce-may-be-shown-by-demonstratingaresuhusingthe-seftware- RS
Cheele 2002 Utah-Energy-Conservation Coderof:

{a) [en-or-aflerJapuaryt:201 7 -and-beforeJanvary 2040 3-pereent-better than
code:
{b}-en-eraftertanuary-12019-and-before-January1-2024—4-pereent better than
codelandle)-after Janvary- 12021 S-pereent-better-than-code™ " |
(7) In IECC. Section R401.2.5 is deleted.
(8) In IECC. Section R401.3 Number 7. the words “and the compliance path used” are deleted.
(9 In IECC Table R402.1.2, the following changes are made:
{(a) in the column titled Fenestration U-Factor the following changes are made:
(i)_In the row titled “Climate Zone 3” delete 0.30 and replace it with 0.32

14



(i1} _In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4” delete 0.30 and replace it with

0.32
i) In the row titled "Climate Zone 6 delete .30 and replace it with (.32

{b) in the column titled Glazed Fenestration SHGC, the following changes are made:
(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 37 delete 0.25 and replace it with 0.35
{¢) in the column titled “Climate U-Factor the following changes are made:
(1) In the row titled “Climate Zone 3” delete 0.026 and replace it with 0,033
(ii) In the row titled "Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4” delete 0.024 and replace it with
0.030
(111} In the row titled "Climaite Zone 6” delete 0.024 and replace it with §.030
(4} in the column titled "Wood Frame Wall U Factor”, the following changes are made:
(1} Inthe row titled "Climate Zone 3" delete 0.060 and replace it with 0.065
(i) _in the row titled "Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4” delete0.045 and replace it with 0.065
(iii) In the row titled "Climate Zone 6” delete 0.045 and replace it with 0.065
(e} inthe column titled "Basement wall U-Factor” the following changes are made,
(i) _In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4 delete 0.050 and replace it with 0.075
(i) In the row titled ” Climate Zone 6” delete 0.50 and replace it with0.065
{f) in the column titled "Crawi Space Wail U-Factor” the following changes are made:
(i) _In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4 delete 0.055 and replace it with 0.078
(i) In the row titled “ Climate Zone 6" delete 0.55 and replace it with 0.065
(10) In IECC, Table R402.1.3 the following changes are made:
(a) In the colummn titled Fenestration U-Factor the following changes are made:
(1) In the row titled “Climate Zone 3” delete 0.30 and replace it with 0.32
(i1} In the row titled "Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4" delete 0.30 and replace it with
0.32
(i11) In the row titled "Climate Zone 6" delete 0.30 and replace 1t with §.32
(b)_In the column titled Glazed Fenestration SHGC the following changes are made:
{i) Inthe row fitled “Climate Zone 3” deleted 0.25 and replace it with 0.35
{¢) In the Column R-Value the following changes are made:
{i} _In the row titled "Climate Zone 3” delete 49 and replace it with 32
{ii} In the row titled "Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4” delete 60 and replace it with 38
{iii} In the row titled "Climate Zone 6" delete 60 and replace it with 38
{d) In the Column titled Wood Frame Wall R-Value the following changes are made:
(i) Inthe row titled “Climate Zone 3” delete all values and replace with “19+ Ocior 11
+ 5¢i or 0 +15¢i”
(i) In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 or Marine 4” delete all values and replace with
“19+ Ocior 13 + 5¢i or 0 +15¢”
{iii} In the row titled ” Climate Zone 6” delete all values and replace with “19 + Qci or
13 + 5cior 0+ 15ci”
{2} In the column titled “Basement Wall R Value” the following changes are made:
(iii) In the row titled “Climatie Zone 5 or Marine 4” delete all values and replace
with “15+ Oci or 0+ 11c¢i or 11 +5¢i”

15



{iv) In the row titled " Climate Zone 6” delete all values and replace with “19 +
Ocior 0+ 13cior 11 + 5¢i”
{f) In the column titled “Slab R Value and Depth” the following changes are made:
(iit) In the row titled "Climate Zone 3” delete “10ci. 2ft” and replace it with NR”
(iv} In the row titled "Climate Zone 5 & Marine 4” delete “4 ft” and replace it
with “2 ft”
{g) Iin the column titled "Crawl Space Wall R-Value” the following changes are made:
{i} In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 or Marine 4” delete all values and replace with
“15+ Ocior 0+ 11ci or 11 +5¢i”
fit) In the row titled “ Climate 7one 6” delete all values and replace with “19 + Oci or
0+13cior0+11+5¢ci”
(h) {5) In IECC, Table R402.2, in the column titled MASS WALL R-VALUE, a new footnote
j is added as follows:
j Log walls complying with ICC400 and with a minimum average wall thickness of 5
inches or greater shall be permitted in Zones 5 through 8 when overall window glazing
has a .31 U-factor or lower, minimum heating equipment efficiency is 90 AFUE (gas)

or 84 AFUE (oil), and all other component requirements are met.
(11) In IECC, a new subsection R402.1.5.1 1s added as follows:

R402.1.5.1 RESCheck 2012 Utah Energy Conservation Code. Compliance with section
N1102.1.5 (R402.1.5) may be satisfied using the software RESCheck 2012 Utah Energy
Conservation Code, which shall satisfy the R-value and U-factor requirements of N1102.1
N1102.2. and N1102.3. provided the following conditions are met:

{a} In Climate Zone 5 and 6 the software result shall show “5% better than code”, and

(b} In Climate Zone 3, the software result shall show “5% better than code™ when
software inputs for window U-facter = 0.65 and window SHGC = 0.40
notwithstanding actual windows installed shall conform fo requirements of Tables
N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2) and N1102.1.3 (R402.1.3).

E(1DIn IECC, Section R402.2.1, a new section is added as follows: "R402.2.1.1. Unvented
attic and unvented enclosed rafter assemblies. Unvented attic and unvented enclosed rafter
assemblies conforming to Section R806.5 shall be provided with an R-value of R-22
(maximum U-Factor of 0.045) in Climate Zone 3-B or an R-value of R-26 (maximum U-
factor of 0.038) in Climate Zones 5-B and 6-B shall be permitted provided all the following
conditions are met:

1. The unvented attic assembly complies with the requirements of the International
Residential Code, Section R806.5.

2. The house shall attain a blower door test result <2.5ACH 50.

3. The house shall require a whole house mechanical ventilation system that does not
rely solely on a negative pressure strategy (must be positive, balanced or hybrid).

4. Where insulation is installed below the roof deck and the exposed portion of roof
rafters are not already covered by the R-20 depth of the air-impermeable insulation,
the exposed portion of the roof rafters shall be wrapped (covered) by minimum R-3
unless directly covered by drywall/finished ceiling. Roof rafters are not required to be
covered by minimum R-3 if a continuous insulation is installed above the roof deck.

16



5. Indoor heating, cooling and ventilation equipment (including ductwork) shall be inside
the building thermal envelope.
(13) A new IECC, Section R402.2.1.3 is added as follows:
R402.2.1.3 Walls with Air-Impermeable Insulation. Where IECC Table R402.1.2 requires
R-20 for wood framed walls in climate zones 3-B and 5-B or R-20-+5C] for climate zone
6-B. an air-impermeable insulation installed in the wall cavity with R-value of R-15 for
climate zones 3-B and 5-B or R-20 for climate zone 6-B shall be deemed eguivalent to the
provisions in IECC Table R402.1.2, provided the home attains a blower door test
<2.5ACH.
(14) In IECC, Section R402.2.9.1 the numeral (1) is added before the words “cut at

a 45 degree” and the following is added after the words “exterior wall™: , or

(i) lowered from top of slab 47 when a 47 thermal break material such as, but not limited
to, felt or asphalt impregnated fiber board, with a minimum thickness of 4" is installed
at the upper 4” of slab.”

EHAHIN TECC, Section R402.4.1, in the first sentence, the word "and” 1s deleted and replaced
with the word "or".
£(16)In IECC, Section R402.4.1.1, the second and the last sentence [is] are deleted and
replaced with the following: "Where [allowed] required by the code official, the builder
[mey} shall certify compliance [te-eomponents] with criteria indicated in Table

R1102.4.1for items which [may} are not [be-nspeeted] readily visible during regularly

scheduled inspections.”

(17) InIECC, Table R402.4,1.1 in the column titled "COMPONENT™, the

following changes are made;

(a) In the row “Rim Joists” the word “exterior” in the first sentence is deleted, and the
second sentence is deleted.

(b} In the row “Electrical/phone box on the exterior walls” the last sentence is deleted and
replaced with: “Alternatively, close cell foam, caulking or gaskets may be used. or air
sealed boxes may be instalied.

(18)In IECC, Section R402.4.1.2, the following changes are made:
(a) In the [frest] fourth sentence, the word “third” is deleted.

—"Fhe-buildingor dwellingonit"is-deletod-and-replaced-with-"A-single-family
dwelting™:
fiafter-January 152009 replacethe-word-Hivewith—3-5"%and
Giiythe-words-in-ChimateZenes-l-and 2-end-three-air-changes-per-hevrin-Chmate Zones
3-through-8 are-deletedd
(b)The following sentence 1s [iserted-after-the-Hrst-senteneer"A-multt-family-dwelling
and-townhouse-shall-be-tested and verified as having an air leakage rate-of not-exeeeding
Pee-nir-changes-per-hour] added after the fourth sentence.”
Ha-the-third-sentenee-the-weord-"third" 15-deleted.]
[Thefolowing-sentenec-is-inserted-after the-third-senteneer] "The following parties
shall be approved to conduct testing: Parties certified by BPl or RESNET, or licensed

-

17



contractors who have completed training provided by Blower Door Test equipment
manufacturers or other comparable training."
(c) In the first Exception the second sentence is deleted.
(19) In IECC, Section R402.4.1.3 the following changes are made;
(a) In the first sentence, the words “5.0 air changes per hour in Climate Zones 0. 1
and 2, and 3.0 are deleted and replaced with “4.0.”, and the words “in Climate
Zone 3 through 8” are deleted.
(b) In the first sentence of the Exception, “0.28” is replaced with “5.0 air changes per
hour or 0.307
(¢) In Number 2 the words “of conditioned floor area” are inserted before the words
“or smaller”.
(20)_1ECC, Section R402.6 is deleted.
(21) InIECC, Section R403.3.1 is deleted and replaced with the following:
“Ducts located outside conditioned space. Supply and return ducts in attics shall be

insulated to a minimum of R-8 where 3 inches (76.2 mm) in dlameier and

and R-6 where less than 3 inches (76.2 mm) in diameter. Supply and return ducts in
other portions of the building shall be insulated to a minimum of R-6 where 3 inches
(76.2 mm) in diameter or greater and R-4.2 where less than 3 inches (76.2 mm) in
diameter.
Exception: Ducts or portions thereof located completely inside the building thermal
envelope.”

-HB(19]n IECC, Section R403.3.3, [the-execeptionfor duetairteakape-testing! is deleted.

[end-replaced-with-thetoleovwing:

{a)-on-or-after-dantery—- 20 1-and-before Janvary 2019 with-the following:
“Hxeeption: The total leakage test 1s not-required-for-systemsvith-alhairhandlers-and
{measured-by-length}located entirely within-the-butlding-thermal-envelopes

byon-oratiertanuary-+-2049and-before January 1202 with-the-follewing:
"Lxeception: The duet-aiv-leakage-testisnotrvequired-for-systerasvath-alb-eir-handlers
apd-ateast oot el duets-tmeasured-bylenpth-eeated-entivelywithinthe building
thermal-epvelopeand
{6)-on-eraftertanuary 20 wdth-the-follovwings-Exeeption: The ductair-teakage-testis
notrequiredtorsystems-with-allairhandlersand-at least- 0% of all ducis-tmeasured-by
lenpthi-ecated-entirelrvithinthe-building-thermal-envelope.
H T TECE Seetion-R403:3:3- the-feHowing is-added-after the exception:
————The-folewingpartiesshell-be-approved-to-conducttesting:
FPartiescertitied-by BPler RESNET:

Z-1ieensed-contractors-whoe-have-sompleted-training provided- by DuetTesteguipment
megttacturers-or-other comparable training

(22) IECC, Section R403.3.3.1 is deleted.

18



A G0 SectionR403.53-4-
(ayin-Hubscetion 1, the number 4 1s changed o 8, the number-133-4s-changed-to
170;-the-number-3-is-changed-te-6r-and-the-number-85-is-changed to- 146 and-{b)in
Subsectiorn2:
(i) eneoraflerJanvaryt+201 7 and-beforeJanvary 120419 the nnmaber 4-is-changed to-§
(i) en-orafierJanvaryt 2019 and-before-Janvary 12021 +the-nuwmber-4-is-ehanped-to-7
(1} en-eradterdampry 202 —thenumberdas-chanped-to-6-and-the number 113.3 1s

changedte69:94
H33(23)In IECC, Section R403.3.5, the [werds"erplenums™are-deleted} following changes are
made:

(a) Asecond Exception is added as follows: “A duct Jeakage test shall not be
required for anv svsiem desiened such that no air handlers or ducts are located

within unconditioned attics.”
{(t) The following is added at the end of the section: “The following parties shall be
approved to conduct {esting:
1. Parties certified by BPT or RESNET
2. licensed contractors who have completed training provided by Duct Test
equipment manufacturers or other comparable training.”
(24) InIECC, Section N1103.3.6 (R403.3.6) the following changes are made:
fa) in Subsection 1,
{1} _the number 4.0 is changed to 6.0,
(i1} the number 113.3 is changed to 170,
(iii) the number 3.0 is changed to 5.0,
{iv) the number 85 is chansed to 141
(b) in Subsection 2.
(1) the number 4.0 is changed to 5.0
(ii} the number113.3 is changed to 141
{c) Subsection 3 is deleted.
(235) InJECC, Section N1103.3.7 (R403.3.7) the words “or plenums’” are deleted.
(26) InIECC, Section N1103.5.1.1 (R403.5.1.1) the words “Where installed” are added at the
beginning of the first sentence.
(27 InIEEC, Section N1103.5.2 (R403.5.2) the followine change is made:
{a) Subsections 5 and 6 are deleted and Subsections number 7 is renumbered to 5.

(13) HaHEC - Seeton-RA03:-53 Subsection-S-is-deleted snd-Hubsections-band Tare
revumbered:}

H352IECC, Section [R403.6.1{R403.6.2, is deleted and replaced with the following:
"[R403.6.1HR403.6.2 Whole-house mechanical ventilation system fan efficacy. Fans used
to provide whole-house mechanical ventilation shall meet the efficacy requirements of

Table [R403-6-1{R403.6.2

19



Exception: Where an air handler that 1s integral to tested and listed HVAC
equipment is used to provide whole-house mechanical ventilation, the air handler shall be
powered by an electronically commutated motor."

H62NIn TECC, Section [R403-6-1, R403.6.2 the table is deleted and replaced with the
following:
"TABLE [R463-61HR403.6.2

MECHANICAT VENTILATION SYSTEM FAN EFFICACY

FAN LOCATION AIR FLOW RATE MINIMUM AIR FLOW RATE
MINIMUM (CFM) EFFICACY MAXIMUM (CEM)
(CFM/WATT)
HRYV or ERV Any 1.2 cfim/watt Any
Range hoods Any 2.8 cfm/watt Any
In-line fan Any 2.8 cfm/watt Any
Bathroom, utility room 10 1.4 cfim/watt <90
Bathroom, utility room 90 2.8 ctm/watt Any"

(30) IECC. Section R403.6.3 is deleted.
G I ECC-Section-R406-5-the-table-is-deleted-andveplaced-vith-the-following:

MAXIMUM ENERGY-RATING INDEX

CLIMATE ZONE—— e ENERGY RATING INDEX
3 P
5 69
6 68"

(B1yIn IECC, Section R403.7 the word “approved: is deleted in the first sentence and the
following is added after the word methodologies “complying with R403.7.1.

H83(32)A new IECC, Section R403.7.1, is added as follows: "R403.7.1 Qualifications. An
individual performing load calculations shall be qualified by completing HVAC training f
from one of the following:

1.HVAC load calculation education from ACCA;
2. A recognized educational institution;

3.HVAC equipment manufacturer's training; or
4.Other recognized industry certification.

(33) In IECC, Section R404.1. the word “All” is replaced with “Not less than 90

20



percent of the lamps in”.
(34) IECC. Section R404.1.1 is deleted.
(35) IECC, Section R404.2is deleted.
(36) IECC, Section R404.3 is deleted.
(37) In IECC, section R405.2 the following changes are made:
(a) In Subsection 3 the words “approved by the code official” are deleted, and
(b) In Subsection3 the following words are added at the end of the sentence: “when
applicable and readily available™.
(38) In IECC, Section R406.3 Building thermal envelope is deleted, and replaced
with “Building thermal envelope and on-site renewables. The proposed total
building thermal envelope UA. which is the sum of U-factor times assembly area,
shall be less than or equal to the building thermal envelope UA using the
prescriptive U-factors From Table N1102.1.2 multiplied by 1,15 in accordance with
Eguation 11-4. The area-weighted maximum fenestration SHGC permitted in
Climate Zones 0 through 3 shall be (.30.
UAProposed design = 1.15 x UAPrescriptive reference desien
(Equation §1-4)

(39) In IECC, Section R406.3.1 is deleted:
(40) In IECC, Section R403.3.2 is deleted:
(41 In IECC, Section R406.4 the following changes are made:

(a) In the first sentence, the words “in accordance with Equation 11-5” are deleted
and replaced with: “permitted to be calculated using the minimum totaj air
exchange Rate for the rated home {(Qtot) and for the index adjustment factor in
accordance with Equation 11.5.7,

() In equation 11-5, the words “Ventilation rate, CEM” are deleted and replaced
with: “Qtot”, and

(¢) In the last sentence the number 57 is deleted and replaced with 157,

(42) InIECC, Section R406.5 in the column titled “ENERGY RATING INDEX” of
Table R406.5, the following changes are made:
{a)In the row for Climate Zone 3, “51” is deleted and replaced with 65
(b)In the row for Climate Zone 5, “35” is deleted and replaced with 69
{c)In the row for Climate Zone 6 “347 is deleted and replaced with 68
(43) In IECC, Section R408 is delete.
(44) In IECC, Chapter 6. the standard for ANSI/RESNET/ICC 201-2019 section 4.4.4 is

added follows:
4.4.4, Air Source Heat Pumps and Air Conditioners.

Performance Ratings (HSPI'2 or SEER2Y available, and HSPFE and SEER are not
available, these ratings shall be converted to HSPF and SEER values by dividing HSPF2
or SEER2 by the conversion {actors in Table 4.4.4.1(1). If the type of equipment is not
determined. the conversion shall default 1o the “Ducted Split System” factors. All
calculations, including Equation 4.1-1a shall use HSPF or SEER values as made
available by the Manufacturer or converted as specified in this section.

21



Table 4.4.4,1(1) SEER2 and HSPFEF2 Conversion Factors3

Eguipment Type SEERZ/SEER | HSPFZ/HSPF
EER2/EER?

Ductless Svstems 1.00 1.00 0.90
Ducted Split System 0.95 0.95 0.85
Ducted Packaged System 0.95 0.95 0.84
Small Duct High Velocity System 1.00 Not Applicable 0.85
Ducted Space-Constrained Air 0.97 Not Applicable Not Applicable
Conditioner
Ducted Space-Constrained Heat 0.99 Not Applicable 0.85
Pump

Part4

15A-3-401 General provisions

(2) In IMC, Section 505.4, a new subsection 505.4.1 is added as follows:
505.4.1 Makeup Air. Makeup air is not required in residential dwelling units where gas,
liquid or solid fuel-burning appliances located within a unit’s air barrier are all direct-vent or
use a mechanical draft venting systém.

15A-3-801 General provisions.

(1) In IEBC, Section 202. The definition for “Approved” is modified by adding the words “or
independent third-party licensed engineer or architect and submitted to the building official”
after the word “official™,

{5} In IEBC, Section 302.3 the following is added after the words “code official” in the last
sentence: “or independent third-party licensed engineer or architect and submitted to the
building official ”

HSHn-Seetion 305425 number-THs-added-alternumber-basFollews/When-a
change of-oecupaney-ina-bulldinger-portion-et-a-buildingresulsin-a-Group-R-2-oceupaney;
got-less-than 20%-of the-dwelhng-orsleepingunits-shall-be-bype-B-dwelling-or-sleepingunits:
These-dwelling-orsleepingunits-may-be-loeated-onany-Hoor-ofthe building previded-with-an
aceessible route-Twe-percent-but-notless-than-one-unitr of-the-dwelling-er-sleepnguntts-shall
bebype-A-dwellngunits]

HA-tn-Seetion 7051 Exeeption-number--the foellowangis-added-at- the-end-of-the-exeepton:
This-exeeption-doesnetapphif-the-exstinp-faciity-is-wndergeing achange-of secupaney
elassiieation ™

(Remaining sections are renumbered as needed)

22



MINUTES

UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION

Convened 3:00 PM

STAFF:

Steve Duncombe, Bureau Manager
Sharon Smalley, Board Secretary

MECHANICAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE

Meeting

December 4, 2023 3:00 pm

Adjourned 4:00

MECHANICAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE.:

David Wilson (excused)
Clay Monroe

Terry Palmer

Martin Carrillo

VISITORS:
Craig Hassell
A J Lowry

ELECT A CHAIR AND
VICE CHAIR

MINUTES

REVIEW PROPOSED
AMDENDMENT FOR
IMC SECTION 505.4

Chris Jensen
Alyssa Wahlin
Trent Hunt, Commission Liaison (absent)

Ryan Rentmeister
Ross Ford

A motion was made by Terry Palmer to elect Martin
Carrillo as chairman and Chris Jensen as vice chair.
The motion was seconded by Clay Monroe and passed
unanimously.

A motion was made by Terry Palmer to approve the
minutes from the June 28, 2022, and October 10, 2023,
meetings as written. The motion was seconded by Alyssa
Wahlin and passed unanimously.

Those present reviewed the proposed amendment flor this
section. During the discussion several concerns were
raised, and a recommendation was made to modify the
section number by changing it to new section number
505.4.1. The proponents agreed to resubmit the
amendment for the committee to review. A motion was
made by Terry Palmer to table the decision until the



Page 2 of 2

Uniform Building Code Commission
Mechanical Advisory Committce
December 4, 2023

DISCUSSION ITEM
2021 IRC CHAPTER 11
AMENDMENTS

The meeting adjourned at 4:00,

modified proposal could be reviewed. The motion was
seconded by Clay Monroe and passed unanimously,

The committee discussed this proposal to adopt

Chapter 11 of the 2021 IRC along with the amendments.
Ross Ford pointed out that several corrections needed to be -
made to several of the numbers. The commitiee agreed that
they would like to see the corrections before they could
decide. A motion was made by Martin Carillo to table the
discussion until the next meeting. The motion was
seconded by Alyssa Wahlin and passed unanimously.

The committee will review both items at a meeting set for
Friday, December 8.

Note: These minutes are nol intended to be a verbatio transcript but are intended to record the significant features of the business conducted in
this meeting. Discussed itews are not necessarily shown in the chronological order they occurred,



MINUTES

UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION

Convened 3.04 PM

STAFFL:

Steve Duncombe, Bureau Manager
Sharon Smalley, Board Secretary

MECHANICAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE

Meeting

December 8, 2023 3:00 pm

Adjourned 4:49

MECHANICAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE:

David Wilson (excused)
Clay Monroe

Terry Palmer

Martin Carrillo

VISITORS:
Craig Hassell
Ken Adams

MINUTES

REVIEW PROPOSED
AMDENDMENT FOR
IMC SECTION 505.4.1

DISCUSSION ITEM
2021 IRC CHAPTER 11
AMENDMENTS

Chris Jensen
Alyssa Wahlin
Trent Hunt, Commission Liaison (absent)

Ryan Rentmeister
Ron McArthur

A motion was made by Chris Jensen to approve the
minutes {from the December 4, 2023, mecting as written,
The motion was seconded by Clay Monroe and passed
unanimously.

Those present reviewed the proposal for the modified
amendment for this section. The proposal was changed

to read, add a subsection to IMC 505.4.1. Following the
review, a motion was made by Chris Jensen to approve the
modified proposal. The motion was seconded by Terry
Palmer and passed unanimously.

The committee discussed this proposal to adopt

Chapter 11 of the 2021 IRC along with the 52

proposed amendments. The committee felt that some of the
numbers that have been proposed were taking a step back
to the 2006 codes and not moving forward. Chris Jenscen
pointed out that the numbers in ceiling R value in climate



Page 2 of 2

Uniform Building Code Commission
Mechanical Advisory Committee
December 8, 2023

zone 6, Table 1102.1.3 and corresponding Table 1102.1.2
for the U factor and the R factor have gone backwards from
the current requirements. Ryan Rentmeister, Ken Adams,
and Ron McArthur spoke to the committee in connection
with these proposals. Many of the numbers are different
than what the committee originally recommended for these
tables.

Following all of the discussion, the committee did not make
a motion to approve, deny, or modify the proposal. They
felt that the current proposal differs from what was
previously approved. Specifically, the tables take the code
backwards to the 2006 code. The committee did not feel
they were in a position to make a recommendation.

The meeting adjourned at 4:49.

Note; These minutes are not intended 1o be a verbatim transcript but are infended to record the sighificant features of the business conducted in
this meeting. Discussed ifems are not necessarily shown in the chronological order they occurred.



Date: 2023-12-10
M. Carrilio

UBCC Mechanical Advisory Committee (MAC)

Home Builder’s Association (HBA) Proposed amendments document:
“Effective 7/1/2024”
“15a-3-203 Amendments to Chapters 11 of IRC”

Summary:

The below narrative and comments address the rational for a “No-Vote” and concerns of the
MAC presented in UBCC MAC meeting December 8, 2023 as Agenda ltem #3 — 2021 IRC Chapter 11
amendments.

NO-VOTE Comments:

The 7-page “15a-3-203 Amendments to Chapters 11 of IRC” document was first presented with
errors at December 4, 2023 UBCC MAC meeting for review and recommendations in anticipation {(of the
HBA). This document addresses major modifications to the IECC and IRC Chapter 11 Energy Codes.

The timeframe for review of said changes, to provide recommendations fo the higher
committee(s), did not allow for confident analysis of said changes to the code. Furthermore, in both the
December 4, 2023 and follow-up December 8, 2023 UBCC MAC meetings, no additional clarifying,
written, information on why the HBA has proposed these amendments was submitted for review and
analysis. Ross Ford did however provide corrected values for the error on first submitted document
{table values corrected).

Some examples of clarifying information may include {but are not limited to):

- Justifications for the need to have these changes incorporated into the Energy Code,
- HBA committees, members, contractors, and subcontracters who are invelved in compiling
the requested changes.
- Costing information for energy code change evaluations:
o Entity/Contractor/Supplier(s) providing cost data.
o Market research with multiple provider/supplier analysis for cross comparison.
o 3"party confirmation of costing information.
- Involvement of other interested parties.
- Meeting notes.
- Ete.

As such, the UBCC MAC was not willing to provide a “Yes” or “No” recommendation to the higher
commitiees for fault of:

- Time to review the gty. 52 proposed changes to the Code.
- Ample source and justification analysis of written proposed changes.



Date: 2023-12-10
M. Carrillo

Additional Concerns pertaining to “NO-VOTE”:

The UBCC MAC found within our timeframe to review the “15a-3-203 Amendments to Chapters
11 of IRC” document many items that were previously addressed in the 2022 UBCC MAC meetings
among many other, new items.

Upon extensive months-long analysis and work by Ross Ford & Ron McArthur (HBA), Brent
Ursenbach, Kevin Emerson (Utah Clean Energy), and many others, the UBCC MAC was able to make
recommendations both at May 24, 2022 and June 28, 2022 for energy code amendments proposed (see
associated meeting minutes & documents).

In comparison with the notes and items presented in 2022 as mentioned above, this new {Dec.
4, 2023) document for proposed changes does not appear to reflect the consensus ail parties came to in
2022, | will attempt to illustrate some major concerns below:

For Item #8 pertaining to Table N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2) the newly submitted amendments DO NOT align
with previous conversations and concessions to reduce building envelope insulation requirements.
Additionally, some of the proposed changes now reduce building envelope insulation requirement below
previously adopted Utah code (2015):

1} Some of proposed changes {2023) include: {see following pages and associated Color highlights)
i) €Z-3 increased slightly from 2018 U-factor (Better-than to 2015 Utah Adopted code)
ii) CZ-5 & 4 Marine: Equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code & 2021 IECC.
iif) CZ-6: Equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code & 2021 IECC.

b} Ceilings:
i) CZ-3 reduced to Pre-2012 levels (Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code)
ii) CZ-5 & 4 Marine: Reduced to 2009 levels (Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code)
iii} CZ-6: Reduced to 2009 levels (Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code)

i) CZ-3 reduce

if} CZ-5 & 4 Marine: Reduced to Pre- 2009 levels {Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted
code)

iif) CZ-6: Reduced to Pre-2009 levels {Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code)

i} C€Z-3 Equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code & 2021 IECC.

ii} CZ-5& 4 Marine: Reduced to Pre- 2009 leveis (Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted
code)

iii) CZ-6: Reduced to Pre-2008 leveis (Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code)

CZ-3 Equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code & 2021 IECC,



Date: 2023-12-10

M. Carrillo

ii) CZ-5 & 4 Marine: Reduced to Pre- 2009 levels (Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted

code)

iii) CZ-6: Reduced to 2009 levels (Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code)

Item #8 — table N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2)

(REVISED SEP 2023)

2023 - 15a-3-203 Amendments to Chapters 11 of IRC

TABLE R1102.1.2 (R402.1.2)
MAXIMUM ASSEMBLY U-FACTORS AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS

! WOoOoD [ s cpnproneys  CRAWL
. " BASEMEN
CLIMATE ! FENESTRATION | SKYLIGHT | __ GLAZED 1 oy yoe | FRAME MASS | oo | seAcE
ZONE U-FACTOR U-FACTOR | FENESTRATION |, 1 oroR WALL WALL U-FACTORU.FACTOR | WALL
; e L SHGEE T -FACTOR | YUFACTOR) T : U-FACTOR
3 (.55 0.35 (in 0.098 0.047
5and 30
Mm_‘i:c . 0.53 NR 0.082 0.033
6 058 NR Jus 0.060 0.033
Previously Utah adopted {2015 IECC code)
TABLE Nt102.1.4 (R402.1.4)
EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS?
CRAW
SKYLIGHT | CEILING | ' "AME MASS FLOOR | BASEMENT s‘:ce‘L
CLIMATE | FENESTRATION y U WALL WALL u WA LL WALL
ZONE U-FACTOR FACTOR | FACTOR u- v FACTOR | U-FACTOR u
FACTOR | FACTORP
FACTOR
] 0.50 0.75 0.035 0.084 0.197 0.064 0.360 0.477
2 ¢.40 0.65 0.030 0.084 0.165 0.064 0.360 0.477
3 0.55 (L3I0 0.098 0.047
4 except 035 0.55 0026 | 0080 | 0098 0.047 0.059 0.065
Marine
d
> an 0.55 0.082 0.033
Marine 4
6 0.55 RN 0.060 0.033 L 55e
7and 8 0.32 0.55 0.026 0.045 0.057 0.028 0.050 0.055




Date: 2023-12-10

M. Carrillo
2021 Table N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2)
TABLE N1142.1.2 (R402.1.2) MAXIRUR ASSEMBLY IAFACTORS? AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS
CLIMATE | FENESTRATION  SKYLIGHT " EN‘;;?Z;%ON CEILING \:ziﬁﬂ ﬁ MASS WALL  FLOOR U~ B;‘?LTZNT spﬁszm:u.
: ¢ . a ] . .
ZONE L-FACTOR FACTOR GO UFACTOR| o UFACTOR®  FACTOR FAGTOR LLFAGTOR
o .50 0.75 .25 0035 0,064 0187 0064 0360 0.477
1 Q.50 275 0.25 0.035 0.084 0447 0.064 4350 Q47T
? 0.0 168 .25 .24 (x84 0,145 64 (3.360 NATT
3 9 55 .25 0083 0047
& wiaspt 030 .55 .40 a2 0.098 D47 0,065
Marire
S ang .48 .40 > 482 e
[T |
3 955 i .06 043
7end 8 030 955 MR 0024 0.045 1057 .22 2.050 9,035
St 511 fon - MG
2015 Table N402.1.2 (R402.1.2)
TABLE R402.1.4 EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS?
F
CLIMATE FENESTRATION SKYLIGHT CEILING V:QE_E MASS WALL FLOOR BA;’ZTENT SP:E:‘:::LL
FACTOR z . OR UF b .
ZONE U-FAC U-FACTOR U-FACT LEACTOR AGCTOR U-FACTOR U-FACTOR UFACTOR
1 0.50 0.75 0.035 0.084 0.167 0.064 0 360 0.477
2 0.40 068 0.030 0.084 0.165 0.064 0.360 CATT
3 0.55 0.088 0.047
4 except Marine .58 0.088 0.047
5 and Marine 4 0.55 0.682 0033
5 055 0.060 0.085
7 and 8 0.55 0.026 0.057 0.028
2012 Table N402.1.2 (R402.1.2)
TABLE R402.1.3 EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS?
CLIMATE | FENESTRATION U. | SKYLIGHT L | CEILING (- | FRAME WALL | MASS WALL L] FLOOR (- | BASEMENTWALL| CRAWL SPAGE
ZONE FACTOR FACTOR FACTOR U-FAGTOR FAGTORP FACTOR U-FACTOR WALL U-FAGTOR
1 0.50 0.75 0.035 .082 0.167 0.064 0.360 0477
2 0.40 0.65 0.030 0.082 0.165 0.064 0.360 0.477
3 0.55 0.008 0.047
4 ex'?em 0.35 0.55 0.098 0.047 0.065
Marine
I 4
o e .55 ¢.082 0.033
Marine 4
6 0.55 0.060 0.033
7and 8 0.32 0.55 0057 0.028 0.055




Date: 2023-12-10

M. Carrillo
2009 Table N402.1.2 (R402.1.2)
TABLE 402.1.3
EQUIVALENT «-FACTORS?
CRAWL
BASEMENT SPACE
CLIMATE FENESTRATION SKYLIGHT CEILING ERAME WALL MASS WALL. FLOOR WALL WALL
ZONE U-FACTOR W-FAGTOR U-FACTOR U-FACTOR U-FAGTOR! U-FACTOR U-FACTOR UFACTORS
1 1.20 0.75 0.035 0.082 0.197 0.064 0.360 0477
2 0.65 075 0.035 0.082 0.165 0.084 0.360 0.477
3 0.65 st 0.141 0.047 g
4 except Marine .60 0.030 0.141 0.047 0.065
5 and Marine 4 .60 0.082 1.033
8 0.60 ; 0.060 0.033
7and 8 0.60 0.026 0.057 ooz8 0.050 0.065
Conclusion:

The above example is but one of a few that the UBCC MAC was able to analyze in this short time
frame. There are other examples of Insulation/code requirements within the amendment reducing
significantly below the currently adopted code. Adversely, the UBCC MAC did find some code
amendments to be proactively addressing 2021 IECC code confusion/deficiency.

With the limited time and information provided to the UBCC MAC, a “No-Vote” approach to
these amendments was taken. We believe that in order to provide a thorough and just recommendation
for the higher bodies and state of Utah, the amendments proposed require significantly more evaluation
3 party discussion, and justification than what has been provided. The 1-week timeframe that we
(UBCC MAC) had to analyze this amendment, as proposed, was inadequate for a recommended acton.

!



Typos that need to be adjusted in Legislative Language document:
(8) m IRC, Table N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2)....
(a) (1) In the row titled “Climate Zone 3” delete 0.30 and replace it with 0.032 0.32

(a) (11) In the row titled “Climate Zone 5 and Marine 4” delete 0.30 and
replace it with

0.032 0.32

(b) (iii)In the row titled “Climate Zone 6™ delete 0.024 and replace it with 0.30 0.030
(12) In IRC Section N1102.2.1 (R402.2.1) ....
2. The house shall attain a blower door test result < 25ACH-50 2. SACH(50)

(24) In IRC Section N1103.3.5 (R403.3.5) the following changes are made:

(a) Tirtiefirst sentence of the secomt Exception, A second Exception is added as

follows: “A duct leakage test shall not be required for any system designed such that
no air handlers or ducts are located within unconditioned attics.”

(25) In IRC,Section N1103.3.6 (R403.3.6):

(a) in Subsection 1, the number 4.01s 8.0 6.0,changed to the number
113.3 is changed to 170, the 6-0 5.0 number 3.0 is changed-, the number
85 is changed 141; and

FYI: The tables of R values and U values on pages 2 and 4 are redundant and only
provided for readability. They should be deleted prior to submitting to legislature.

The items numbered 45 to 52, can be ignored as these are not part of Chapter 11 and
were adopted previously.



MINUTES

UTAH

UNIFORM BUILDING CODE COMMISSION
STRUCTURAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE

MEETING

December 7, 2023 3:00

CONVENED: 3:05

STAFF:
Steve Duncombe, Bureau Manager
Sharon Smalley, Board Secretary

COMMITTEE MEMBERS:
Tim Strickland

Patrick Tomasino

John Saunders

Brent Maxfield

VISITORS:

ELECT A CHAIR AND VICE CHAIR

MINUTES

REVIEW PROPOSED AMENDMENT
TO IRC SECTION R105.2

ADJOURNED 4.37

Josh Blazzard, Commission Liaison
Oliver Burt
Tyler Wright

Craig Hassell
Ken Adams

A motion was made by Brent Maxf{icld to nominate
Tyler Wright as chair and Tim Strickland as vice
chair. The motion was seconded by John Saunders
and passed unanimously.

A motion was made John Saunders by to approve
the minutes from the June 30, 2022, meeting as
written. The motion was scconded by Patrick
Tomasino and passed unanimously.

Those present reviewed and discussed the
proposed amendment in detail. During the
discussion it was recommended that the proposal
be modified. Following further discussion, a
motion was made by Tim Strickland to approve
the proposal as modified by changing it to read,
“Retaining walls retaining less than 4 feet
(1219mm) of unbalanced fill, unless supporting a
surcharge or requiring design per Section R404.4.”
The motion was seconded by Patrick Tomasino.
During the discussion on the motion, it was
modified by changing the word “requires™ {o the
word “requiring”. Tim Strickland made a motion



Page 2

Uniform Building Code Commission
Structural Advisory Committee
December 7, 2023

to modify the proposal and Patrick Tomasino
seconded the amended motion. The amended
motion passed unanimously.

The meeting adjourned at 4:37.

Note: These minutes are nol infended 1o be a verbatim transcript but are intended to record the significant features of the business conducted in
this meeting. Discussed items are not necessarily shown in the chronological order they occirred.



Date: 2023-12-10
M. Carrillo

UBCC Mechanical Advisory Committee (MAC)

Home Builder’s Association (HBA) Proposed amendments document:
“Effective 7/1/2024”
“15a-3-203 Amendments to Chapters 11 of IRC”

Summary:

The below narrative and comments address the rational for a “No-Vote” and concerns of the
MAC presented in UBCC MAC meeting December 8, 2023 as Agenda Item #3 — 2021 IRC Chapter 11
amendments.

NO-VOTE Comments:

The 7-page “15a-3-203 Amendments to Chapters 11 of IRC” document was first presented with
errors at December 4, 2023 UBCC MAC meeting for review and recommendations in anticipation {of the
HBA). This document addresses major modifications to the IECC and IRC Chapter 11 Energy Codes.

The timeframe for review of said changes, to provide recommendations to the higher
committee(s), did not allow for confident analysis of said changes to the code. Furthermore, in both the
December 4, 2023 and follow-up December 8, 2023 UBCC MAC meetings, no additional clarifying,
written, information on why the HBA has proposed these amendments was submitted for review and
analysis. Ross Ford did however provide corrected values for the error on first submitted document
{table values corrected).

Some examples of clarifying information may include {but are not limited to}:

- Justifications for the need to have these changes incorporated into the Energy Code.
- HBA committees, members, contractors, and subcontractors who are involved in compiling
the requested changes.
- Costing information for energy code change evaluations:
o Entity/Contractor/Supplier(s) providing cost data.
o Market research with multiple provider/supplier analysis for cress comparisen.
o 3" party confirmation of costing information.
- Involvement of other interested parties.
- Meeting notes.
- Etc.

As such, the UBCC MAC was not willing to provide a “Yes” or “No” recommendation to the higher
committees for fault of:

- Time to review the gty. 52 proposed changes to the Code.
- Ample source and justification analysis of written proposed changes.



Date: 2023-12-10
M. Carrillo

Additional Concerns pertaining to “NO-VOTE":

The UBCC MAC found within our timeframe to review the “15a-3-203 Amendments to Chapters
11 of IRC” document many items that were previously addressed in the 2022 UBCC MAC meetings
among many other, new items.

Upon extensive months-long analysis and work by Ross Ford & Ron McArthur (HBA), Brent
Ursenbach, Kevin Emerson {Utah Clean Energy), and many others, the UBCC MAC was able to make
recommendations both at May 24, 2022 and June 28, 2022 for energy code amendments proposed (see
associated meeting minutes & documents).

In comparison with the notes and items presented in 2022 as mentioned above, this new {Dec.
4, 2023) document for proposed changes does not appear to reflect the consensus all parties came to in
2022, | will attempt to illustrate some major concerns below:

For Item #8 pertaining to Table N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2) the newly submitied amendments DO NOT align
with previous conversations and concessions to reduce building envelope insulation requirements.
Additionally, some of the proposed changes now reduce building envelope insulation requirement below
previously adopted Utah code (2015):

1} Some of proposed changes (2023) include: (see following pages and associated Color highlights)
5 o
i) CZ-3increased slightly from 2018 U-factor (Better-than to 2015 Utah Adopted code)
ii} CZ-5 & 4 Marine: Equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code & 2021 1ECC.

iii) CZ-6: Equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code & 2021 IECC.

b} Ceilings:
i} C€Z-3reduced to Pre-2012 levels (Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code)
ii) CZ-5 & 4 Marine: Reduced to 2009 levels {Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code)
iii} CZ-6: Reduced to 2009 levels (Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code)

ii) CZ-5 & 4 Marine: Reduced to Pre- 2009 levels {Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted
code)
iii) CZ-6: Reduced to Pre-20092 levels (Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code)

i} CZ-3 Equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code & 2021 IECC.

ii) CZ-5 & 4 Marine; Reduced to Pre- 2009 levels {Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted
code)

iii) CZ-6: Reduced to Pre-2009 ievels (Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code)

i} CZ-3 Equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code & 2021 IECC.



Date: 2023-12-10
M. Carrillo

ii) C€Z-5 & 4 Marine: Reduced to Pre- 2009 |levels (Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted
code)
jil) CZ-6: Reduced to 2009 levels (Not even equivalent to 2015 Utah Adopted code)

ltem #8 — table N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2)

2023 - 15a-3-203 Amendments to Chapters 11 of IRC

(REVISED SEP 2023)
TABLE R1102.1.2 {R402.1.2)
MAXIMUM ASSEMBLY U-FACTORS *AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS

) WOOD ASS BASEMINT  CRAWL
CLIMATE | FENESTRATION | SKYLIGHT GLAZED = cprigng | FRAME FLOOR WALL SPACE
ZONE U-FACTOR' | U-FACTOR | FENESTRATION | pacor|  WALL WALL  U-FACTOR gracT WALL
JEORE L UAtIoR (URACTOR L smece YR pactor | (U-FACTOR|UTACTORIUTACTOR by oo
3 055 0.5 0o 0.098 0.047
5and [ERFRE]
Marine 4 .55 NR 0,482 0,033
6 0.5 NR o | o060 0.033
Previously Utah adopted {2015 IECC code}
TABLE N1102.1.4 (R402.1.4)
EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS?
SKYLIGHTY | CEILING FRAME MASS FLOOR | BASEMENT CSI:":\\?EL
CLIMATE | FENESTRATION U u WALL WALL U ) "!JALL WALL
ZONE U-FACTOR FACTOR | FACTOR u- v FAC;’OR U-FACTOR u
FACTOR | FACTOR? ) )
FACTOR
1 0.50 G.75 0.035 0.084 0.197 0.064 0.360 0.477
2 0.40 .65 0.03C 0.084 .165 0.064 0.477
3 0.55 {31430 0,098 0.047
4 t
exc.ep 0.35 0.55 0.026 0.060 0.098 0.047 0.059 0.065
Marine
5 and
0.55 0.082 0.033
Marine 4
6 0.55% R 0.060 0.033
7and 8 0.32 0.55 0.026 0.045 0.057 0.028 0.050 G055




Date: 2023-12-10

M. Carrillo
2021 Table N1102.1.2 {R402.1.2)
TABRLE NA102.1.2 (R402.1.2) MAXIMUR ASSEMBLY U-FACTORS® AND FENESTRATION REQLHREMENTS
GLIMATE | FENESTRATION  SKYLIGHT FENGE;?@% on CEILING &Eiﬂﬂ 5 MASS WALL  FLOOR t- B&i?:?.r Sngm;LL
v i o | - b B
ZONE UFACTOR U-FACTOR GOt ¢ UFACTOR, . = (-FACTOR®  FACTOR FaCTOR FAGTOR
5 .50 175 025 0.055 1084 0.187 0,064 380 a477
1 .50 475 .25 £.035 0,084 o1e7 0.064 {350 Q477
3 040 188 028 043434 0165 081 0477
3 555 025 0088 0.047
A e 550 6.55 o0 .07 0,045 .08 0.047 0.050 8,065
Marine
Bare .56 Al 0002 £33
[Aezrine
[ 0.53 i 3050 £.053 ;
7and 5 .55 HR 0.024 0057 0023 a080 4,055
ERYERZ{FR IR FOAR g LR NI
2015 Table N402.1.2 (R402.1.2)
TABLE R402.1.4 EQUIVALENT LAFACTORS®
FR
GLIMATE FENES TRATION SKYLIGHT CEILING w:rf MASS WALL FLOOR BA‘i‘i“:fNT SPEEEA:VV;LL
ZONE U-FAGTOR U-FACTOR UFACT U-FACTOR? U-FACTOR
ACTOR U.FACTOR U-FACTOR U-EACTOR
1 0.50 0.75 0.035 0.084 0,197 0.064 0.360 0.477
2 0.40 0.65 0.030 0.084 0,165 0.084 0.360 0.477
3 0.55 ' 0.098 0.047
4 except Marine 0.55 0.026 0.088 0.047
5 and Marine 4 0.55 0.082 £.033
6 0.55 0.06G 0.033
7 and 8 0.55 0.026 0.045 0,087 0.026
2012 Table N402.1.2 (R402.1.2)
TABLE R402.1.3 EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS?
CLIMATE | FENESTRATION (4 | SKYLIGHMT U. | CEILING U. | FRAME WALL | MASS WALL U-] FLOORU- | BASEMENT WALL| CRAWL SPACE
ZONE FACTOR FACTOR FACTOR U-FAGTOR FAGTORP FACTOR U-FACTOR WALL U-FACTOR
1 0.50 075 0.035 0.082 0.197 0.064 0.380 0.477
2 0.40 0.65 0.030 0.082 0.165 0.064 0.360 0.477
3 0.55 {.008 0.047
# excent 0.35 0.55 0.026 0.057 Q.08 0.047 0.059 0.065
Marine
Sand "
° 0.55 0.082 0.033
Marine 4
6 ‘ 0.55 0.060 0.033
Tand @ 0.2 0.4% 0.026 0.048 0.057 0.028 0.055




Date: 2023-12-10

M. Carrillo
2009 Table N402.1.2 (R402.1.2)
TABLE 402.1.3
EQUIVALENT L.FACTORS®

CRAWL

BASEMENT SPACE

CLIMATE FENESTRATION SKYLIGHT CEILING FRAME WALL MASS WALL FLOOR WALL WALL

ZONE U.FACTOR U.FACTOR U-FACTOR U-FACTOR U-FACTORY U-FACTOR U.FACTOR U-FACTOR"
4 1.20 075 0.035% 0.082 0187 0.064 0.360 0477

I 0.75 0.035 0082 | 0185 0064 0.360 0477

3 ! 0.141 0.047
e SR T e
5 and Marine 4 0.082 0.033
5 - 0.060 0.033
e e T |
Conclusion:

The above example is but one of a few that the UBCC MAC was able to analyze in this short time
frame. There are other examples of Insulation/code requirements within the amendment reducing
significantly below the currently adopted code. Adversely, the UBCC MAC did find some code
amendments to be proactively addressing 2021 |ECC code confusion/deficiency.

With the limited time and information provided to the UBCC MAC, a “No-Vote” approach to
these amendments was taken. We believe that in order to provide a thorough and just recommendation
for the higher bodies and state of Utah, the amendments proposed require significantly more evaluation,
3" party discussion, and justification than what has been provided. The 1-week timeframe that we
{UBCC MAC) had to analyze this amendment, as proposed, was inadequate for a recommended action.



[~ {ex o ol [ ]

joo

O

Section 10-9a-538 is enacted to read:

10-9a-538. Modular Homes

() The regulations related to the construction, transportation, installation,

inspections, fees, enforcement. and all other regulations related to modular housing shall be

regulated by Utah Code Annotated Title 15A.

Section 15A-1-202 is amended to read:
15A-1-202, Definitions.

As used in this chapter:

(1) “Agricultural use” means a use that relates to the tilling of soil and raising of

crops, or keeping or raising domestic animals.
()

(a) “Approved code” means a code, including the standards and

specifications contained in the code, approved by the division under Section 154-1-204 for use

by a compliance agency.
(b) “Approved code” does not include the State Construction Code.

(3) “Building” means a structure used or intended for supporting or sheltering

any use or occupancy and any improvements attached to it.

(4) “Code” means:

(a) the State Construction Code; or (b) an approved code.

(5} “Commission” means the Uniform Building Code Commission created in

Section 154-1-203.



2
(=)

[l\J !m
e el ~3

]w
O

(6) “Compliance agency” means:

(a) an agency of the state or any of its political subdivisions which issues

permits for construction regulated under the codes;

(b) any other agency of the state or its political subdivisions specifically

empowered to enforce compliance with the codes; or

{c) any other state agency which chooses to enforce codes adopted under this
chapter by authority given the agency under a title other than this part and Part 3, Factory

Built Housing and Modular Units Administration Act.

(7} “Construction code™ means standards and specifications published by a
nationally recognized code authority for use in circumstances described in Subsection 154-

1204(1), including:

(a) a building code:

(b) an electrical code;

(¢) aresidential one and two family dwelling code;

(d) aplumbing code;

{e) amechanical code;

() afuel gas code;

{g) an energy conservation code;

{h) aswimming pool and spa code;

(i} amanufactured housing installation standard code; and



(i) ICC/Model Building Institute Standards 1200 and 1205. except as

modified by this Title 15A.

(8) “Construction project” means the same as that term is defined in Section 38-1a-

102.

(9) “Executive director” means the executive director of the Department of

Commerce.

(10) “Legislative action” includes legislation that:

(a} adopts a new State Construction Code;

(b) amends the State Construction Code; or

(¢} repeals one or more provisions of the State Construction Code.

(11) “Local regulator” means a political subdivision of the state or its designee

that is empowered to engage in the regulation of construction, installation, inspection, alteration,

remodeling, building, repair, and other activities subject to the codes.

(12) “Membrane-covered frame structure” means a nonpressurized building with a
structure composed of a rigid framework to support a tensioned membrane that provides a

weather barrier.

(13) “Not for human occupancy” means use of a structure for purposes other than

protection or comfort of human beings, but allows people to enter the structure for:
(a) maintenance and repair; and

(b) the care of livestock, crops, or equipment intended for agricultural use



which are kept there.

{(14) “Opinion” means a written, nonbinding, and advisory statement issued by the
commission concerning an interpretation of the meaning of the codes or the application of
the codes in a specific circumstance issued in response to a specific request by a party to the

issue.
(15) “Remote yurt” means a membrane-covered frame structure that:
(a) is no larger than 710 square feet;
(b) is not used as a permanent residence;

(¢} islocated in an unincorporated county area that is not zoned for
residential,

commercial, industrial, or agricultural use;
{(d) does not have plumbing or electricity;

(e) 1is set back at least 300 feet from any river, stream, lake, or other body of

water; and
(f)  1isregistered with the local health department.

(16) “‘State regulator” means an agency of the state which is empowered to engage in
the regulation of construction, alteration, remodeling, building, repair, and other activities subject

to the codes adopted pursuant to this chapter.
Section 15A-1-205 is amended to read:

15A-1-205. Division of Professional Licensing duties.

(1)



(@) The [¢] Division of Professional Licensing shall, except as specifically set

forth otherwise, administer the codes adopted or approved under Section 13A4-

1-204 pursuant to this chapter.

(b} Notwithstanding |Subsestien-Cak] any provision in Utah Code Annotated.

State Construction Code, or other applicable codes, the division, state

reeulator, and anv third party agencies and inspectors shall not have the

responsibility or authority, unless specifically granted by a local regulator per

Utah Code 15A-1-304, to |

(B—conduct-inspectionsto-determne-comphanee-vwith-the-codes:

(Y —Hsste-pernttror

@i--assess-building-permitfees] perform those duties reserved only to the local

regulator set forth in Utah Code 15A-1-304.

(2) As part of the administration of the codes, the [} Division of Professional Licensing

or state repulator shall:

(a) comply with Section 154-1-206;

(b) schedule appropriate hearings;

(¢) maintain and publish for reference:

(i} the current State Construction Code; and

(i) any approved code; [andt

{(d) publish the opinions of the commission with respect to interpretation and

application of the codes; and



—
O

—
e}

—
—
o

|

—
—
(3]

[y
Lad

,_u.
.

[
—
W

.
jo2

|

—
—
~]

o0

(e) license all inspectors, including third-party inspectors, and manufacturers of

modular units.

Section 15A-1-302 is amended to read:

15A-1-302. Definitions.

As used in this part:

(1) “Compliance agency” is as defined in Section 154-
1-202.

(2) “Decal” or “Insignia”™ means the approved form of

certification issued by the State, to be permanently attached to the

modular building. including each panelized svstem, certifving that it has

been constructed to meet or exceed the applicable building code

reguiremnents.

(3) “Division” shall mean the Utah Division of
Facilities Construction and

Management of the Utah Departiment of Government Operalions.

—
O

—
=]
)

—
[\
y—t

—
N
)

—_—
[\
7S]

,_.
]
g

—_—
b
Lh

—
N

(4) “Factory built housing” means a manufactured
home or mobile home.

(5} “Factory built housing set-up contractor” means an
individual licensed by the

division to set up or install factory built housing on a temporary or permanent basis.

(6) “HUD Code” means the National Manufactured
Housing Construction and

Safety Standards Act, 42 U.S.C. Sec. 5401 et seq.



127 (7) “Local regulator” is as defined in Section 154-1-
128 202.

129 (8) “Manufactured home™ means a transportable factory
130 built housing unit

131 constructed on or after June 15, 1976, according to the HUD Code, in one or more sections,

132 that:

133 (a)  in the traveling mode, is eight body feet or more in width
134 or 40 body feet

135 or more in length, or when erected on site, is 400 or more square feet; and

136 (b}  is built on a permanent chassis and designed to be used as
137 a dwelling with or without a permanent foundation when

138 connected to the required utilities, and includes the plumbing,
139 heating, air-conditioning, and electrical systems.

140 (9) “Mobile home™ means a transportable factory built
141 housing unit built

142  before June 15, 1976, in accordance with a state mobile home code which existed prior to

143  the HUD Code.

144 (10) “Manufacturing Plant” means the location other
145 than the building site at

146  which modular buildings, modules, and panelized systems are assembled or manufactured

147  prior to transport to the final construction site and have been approved and listed by the

148  Division as & location owned and operated by an approved licensed Modular

149  Manufacturer, Manufacturing Plant shall not include facilities used to manufacture or




150  construct modules or panelized system if they are located directly on the work site where

151  the proposed modules. panelized systems or modular components are to be installed.

152 (1) “Modular Manufacturer” means the entity

153 responsible for the

154  manufacturing of assemblies, panelized systems, modular buildings or modular components.
155 (12) “Modular unit” means a structure:

156 {a)  constructed from one or more modules, or constructed

15 using one or More

158  closed modular components or closed panels, manufactured at a location other than the

159  permanent building site, [built fronr-seetions-that-are-manutactured] in accordance with the
160  State Construction Code and transported to a building site;

161 (b}  the purpose of which is for human habitation, occupancy,
162 or use; and (e) is not a factory-built house, manufactured home,
163 or mobile home.

164 (13) Module means:

165 (a) athree-dimensional. volumetric section of a modular
166 building designed and

167 approved to be transported as a single section, independent of other sections, to a site for on-site
168  construction; or

169 (b}  apanelized system.

170 (14) “Offsite Construction” means a modular building,
171 modular component or




172 panelized system that is designed and constructed in compliance with this standard and is wholly
173  or in substantial part fabricated or assembled in manufacturing plants for installation—or

174  assembly and installation—or on a separate building site and has been manufactured in such a
175  manner that all parts or processes cannot be inspected at the installation site without disassembly,
176  damage to or destruction thereof

177 (15) “Onsite Construction” means the preparation of the
178 site, foundation

179  construction, construction of the supporting structure, assembly. connection of off-site or open
180  construction and completion of site related construction in accordance with the construction

181  documents and details.

182 (16) “Panelized System” means a closed wall, roof, or
183 floor commponents that are

184 constructed at a location other than the building site in a manner that prevents the construction
185  from being inspected at the building site without disassembly, damage, or destruction thereof.
186 (17) “State regulator” is as defined in Section 154-1-202.
187 {18) Third-Party Inspection Agency is a person or enfity
188 licensed by the Utah Division

189  of Professional Licensing and approved bv the Division of Facilities Construction and

190  Management to be qualified by reason of facilities, personnel. experience, demonstrated

191  reliability and independence of judgment to inspect modules for compliance with the

192 construction documents. compliance control program and applicable codes.

193 (19) “Third-Party Inspector” is a person who:

194 (a) is gualified by reason of experience, demonstrated

195 reliability and




|

196 independence of judgment to inspect modular buildings, and portions thereof, for compliance
197  with the construction documents, compliance control program, and applicable building code;
198 (b}  works under the direction of a third-party inspection

199 agency; and

200 (¢}  hasbeen licensed by the Division of Professional

201 Licensing pursuant to 15A-

202 1-307:and

203 (d)  approved by the Division of Facilities Construction and
204 Management.

205 Section 15A-1-304 is amended to read:

206 Section 15A-1-304. Modular units.

207 Modular unit construction, [setup| installation, issuance of permits for construction or
208 |setup| installation, and setup shall be in accordance with the following:

209 (1) Construction, installation, and setup of |&] modular units and panelized systems
210 shall be in accordance with the State Construction Code.

211 (2) Notwithstanding any provision in Utah Code, State Construction Code. or other
212 applicable codes, rules, and regulations, [4] a local regulator or its qualified
213 designee has the responsibility for and exclusive authority {for-planseview-and
214 msuanee-ol-permitstor construetion-modification or-setup-for-the politieal
215 subdivstonnehichthe-modularanitis-to-be-setup: | o0

216 (a) Review and approve plans, but only to the extent that such plans relate to
217  elements of onsite construction, as defined in ICC/MBI Standard 1205.

218 (b)  Issue permits for construction of the building and any building site




219

modification;

220 (¢) Perform onsite inspections;

221 (d)  Verify by inspection that all off-site components are installed onsite in
222 accordance with the approved plans. modular manufacturer’s instructions, the State

223 Construction Code, and applicable codes;

224 (&)  Verify that all manufacturing decals have been permanently affixed to
225  each component of the modular unit, module. and panelized system:

2260 (f)  Establish and assess fees, including building permil fees, inspection fees,
227  administrative fees, impact fees, and other fees related to the construction and installation of
228  modular ynits;

229 {g) Require a closed modular unit to be opened for further inspection upon
230  discovery of visible damage to the modular unit or, based on a non-destructive visual inspection.
231  identification of a modular unit not in compliance with the State Construction Code. applicable
232 codes, or approved plans;

233 () Notwithstanding any other provision in Utah Code, Construction Code
234 standards. rules, and regulations, prevent the use or occupancy of a modular unit that. in the
235  opinion of the building official. contains a serious defect or imminent safety hazard, and nofify
236 the action taken by the building official to the Division and Division of Professional Licensing;
237 {iy  Subject to this Part 304(7). perform all other duties and responsibilities
238  set forth in the ICC/MBI Standards 1200 and 1205 and not otherwise listed herein.

239 (3) Plan review and offsite and onsite As] inspections of the construction,




modification of, or [setup] installation of a modular unit shall conform with [this chapter.] the

241  State Construction Code and applicable codes, including site specific municipal codes.

242 (4) Subiject to this Part 304(1)h), (5), (6), and (7). iA] a local regulator shall [has
243 thevesponsibility-to] 1ssue an-approval for the political subdivisionin-which-s-medularunits
244 to-besetup-oris-setup-| a certificate of occupancy for a modular unit if the modular unit has all
245  reguired decals, has been installed and inspected onsite according to plans, and meets the State
246  Construction Code. the ICC/MBI Standards 1200 and 1205, and applicable municipal codes.
247 (5) |MNothnpin-this-seetion-preciudes:

248 {a)-—alacalregulator from-contracting with-a-qualified-third-partytorthe
249  imspechion-erpl-revieve-provided-n-this seetions or

250 (b} the-state-from-entering into an interstate compaet-tor-tnrd-party

251 inspection-ofithe-construetion-of-emodular-untt|

252 In addition to any immunity and protections set forth in the Utah

253 Governmental Immunity Act, municipalities shall not be Hable for claims solely arising from
254  construction and manufacturing of offsite construction elements.

255 (6) Any purchaser, future resident, and homebuver of a modular unit shall be

256  considered to be in privity of contract with the manufacturer and third party inspection apency
257  for the purposes of recovering damages for manufacturing and design defects and inspection
258  avency and inspectors’ errors and omissions.

259 (7) Alocal regulator may provide written notice within the certificate of

260  occupancy that explain or list the municipality’s limitations of liability pursuant to this Title and
261 the Utah Governmental Immunity Act.




262 (8) Alocal regulator may. in its sole discretion, contract with a qualified and licensed
263  third party agency or inspector that has been approved by the Division or another municipality to
264  perform the onsite inspection or plan review provided in this section.

265 Section 15A-1-306 is amended to read:

266 Section 15A-1-306. Factory built housing and modular units - Division

267 responsibility — Unlawful conduct.

268 1)  The division or state regulator:

269 a) shall maintain current information on the HUD Code and the portions of
270  the State Construction Code relevant to manufactured housing_and modular installation and will
271  provide at reasonable cost the information to compliance agencies, local regulators, or state
272  regulators requesting such information;

273 b) shall provide qualified personnel to advise compliance agencies, local
274  regulators, and state regulators regarding the standards for construction and setup, construction
275  and setup inspection, and additions or modifications to factory built housing and modular units;
276 ¢)  is designated as the state administrative agency for purposes of the HUD
277  Code;

278 d) may inspect factory built housing units and modular units in or out of the
279  state during the [eonstruetion] manufacturing process to determine compliance of the

280  manufacturer with this jehapter] title for those units to be installed within the state, and upon a
281  finding of substantive deficiency through such inspections or based on reports from approved
282  third-party inspection agencies:




283 i) suspend or stop the manufacturer’s construction of modular
284 units
285  to be sold or installed in the state of Utah:

286 11) issue a corrective order to the manufacturer [and provide-a
287 eopy-of
288  the-orderto-theloecalrepuintorin-the-stete’s-pelitical-subdbdsten-where the unit-is-to-be

289  installed]; or

290 ill})  require an increase in third-party factory inspections until such
291  ume that the Division and the third-party inspection agency is satisfied that the deficiency is
292 resolved,

293 e)  shall, if an action is taken pursuant to (1)(d)(i), (ii), or (iii), provide notice
294 of'its action or a copy of the corrective order to the local regulator in the state’s political

295  subdivision where the unit is to be installed: and

296 f)  shall have rights of entry and inspection as specified under the HUD Code
297  and ICC/MBI Standard 1200 and Standard 1205, as applicable;

298 g)  shall implement by rule a continuing education requirement for

299  manufactured housing and modular construction and installation contractors; and

300 h)  shall have the authority to set and collect fees associated with the

301  provision of decals or insignia to support the administration of the modular program.

302 2)  The division may assess civil penalties payable to the state for
303 violation of the HUD Code in an amount identical to those set forth in Section 611 of



304 the National Manufactured Housing Construction and Safety Standards Act of 1974,
305 42 U.S.C. Sec. 5410,

306 3)  The state may impose criminal sanctions for violations of the HUD
307 Code

308  identical to those set forth in Section 611 of the National Manufactured Housing Construction
309  and Safety Standards Act of 1974, 42 U.S.C. Sec. 5410, provided that if the criminal sanction is a
310  fine, the fine shall be payable to the state.

311 Section 15A-1-307 shall be enacted to read:

312 15A-1-307. Third party plan review — Inspection agencies

313 1) The Division shall maintain a list of approved third-party plan review and

314  inspection agencies that have been licensed by the Division of Professional Licensing.

315 2) Modular manufacturers shall contract with one or more third party agencies

316 listed

317 by the Division to perform offsite plan review and inspection.

318 3y Approved third-party agencies shall:

319 a)  Demonstrate knowledge of applicable sections of the Utah Code and State
320 Construction Code and other applicable laws, rules, and regulations:

321 b) Beindependent in judgment and not have any actual or potential conflict
322 ofinterest, is not affiliated with or influenced or controlled by any producer, supplier, vendor,
323  developer. builder, or related fields applicable 1o the construction of modular units in any manner
324  which might affect its capacity 1o render its conclusions and inspections without bias:

325 ¢)  Carry insurance in the amount set by the Division to cover liabilities and




losses arising or relating to possible errors and omissions from iis operations, reviews, and

inspections: and

d)  Perform all duties set forth in the ICC/MBI 1205, Chapter 4, as amended,

4} Third-party plan review examiners shall:

a)  Belicensed and certified as a plans examiner under the International Code

Council:

b)  Possess the qualifications required by a third party plan review agency

under the JCC/MBI Standard 1205. Chapter 4:

c¢)  Be knowledgeable regarding the construction, installation, and setup of

modular units;

5) Third party inspectors shall:

a)  Belicensed and certified as:

1) A combination inspector in the state of Utah: and

1) A third party inspector under the ICC/MBI Standard 1205, Chapter 4

Section 15A-1-308 shall be enacted to read:

Section 15A-1-308. Manufacturing Plants and Quality Assurance Inspections.

(1) The Division shall approve all modular manufacturers before modular units may

be used within the State.

(2) Subject to the changes set forth in this part, manufacturers and guality assurance

and control entities and employees must meet all of the requirements set forth in I[CC/MBI 1200

Standard, Chapter 5 and 1205 Standard. Chapters 4 and 5.




347 (3) The Quality Assurance and Control Plan, as required in ICC/MBI 1200 Standard
348  Chapter 5 and further defined per ICC/MBI 1205 Standard, Chapter 5, shall:

349 (a) Require inspections of each modular unit, including each module and panelized
350  system, at cach station and phase of the manufacturing process: and

351 (b) Include all conflict of interest forms of quality assurance personnel and regularly
352 submit conflict of interest forms for any new employees performing quality assurance duties,
353 (4} Quality assurance personnel shall:

354 (a) Demonstrate to the Division and third party inspection agency that thev have
355  adequate knowledge of the product, factory operations, and the codes and standards to which the
356  product is being manufactured and shall also demonstrate the ability o perform their required
357  duties;

358 (b) Be a licensed combination inspector in the state of Utah:

359 (¢) Individually inspect each modular unit and panelized system at each stage of the
360  manufacturing process and before being closed for inspection to ensure that the construction
361  conforms to the approved plans.

362 {d) Submit to the manufacturer, to be included in the Quality Assurance and Control
363 Plan or amended thereto, a form provided by the Division that lists all conflicts of interest.

364 (8) Manufacturers, quality assurance personnel. and third-party acencies and

365  inspectors may not amend the plans without approval from the local repulator if such

366 amendments violate specific provisions or affect the safety or habitability of the modular unit.




367 (6} The Division shall, upon request by a local regulator, provide all filed conflict of
368 interest forms signed by guality assurance personnel and that have been submitted by the

369  manufacturer as part of its quality assurance and control plan.

370 (7} Any decal or insignia for a modular unit, module, and panelized system issued
371  and affixed by the third party inspection agency in compliance with this Part and Standard 1205,
372 Chapter 7 shail warrant that such modular unit, module. and panelized svstem has been inspected
373 inaccordance with this Part 308(3) and is:

374 (a}  Fit for human occupancy and may be safely used as infended;

375 (b} Manufactured in accordance with the State Construction Cede, applicable state
376  and local codes. and modular plans and specifications.




